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Norsipah
From: Norsipah
Sent: Tuesday, July 9, 2019 03:06 PM
To: 'Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)’
Cc: Lawrence Teo
Subject: RE: Date of accident on 13/09/2016 involving vehicles PA 32725 & SKQ 961G (5C)
*** KK REF: CC4/11116021327/T1ma3
Attachments: SKQ961G_Signed DV.pdf
Importance: High
Hi Cecilia,

I will mail out the attached to you.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Sipah

Tan Chong Motor Sales Pte Ltd
913 Bukit Timah Road
Singapore 589623

From: Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto) <CeciliaChong @|kkauto,com>

Sent: Monday, July 8, 2019 09:40 AM

To: Norsipah <norsipah@tanchong.com>

Cc: Lawrence Teo <lawrenceteo@tanchong.com>

Subject: RE: Date of accident on 13/09/2016 involving vehicles PA 32725 & SKQ 961G (SC) *** LKK REF:
CC4/1N116021327/T1ma3

Without Prejudice
Dear Lawrence / Sipah,
Thanks for your acceptance.

Kindly sign on the DV attached and mail back ALL ORIGINAL DOCUMENTS to us {LKK)

Thanks

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / Inferred from
this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the Issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

Pest Regards,

Cecilin Chang | Caset Handler

LKK Auto Consultunts Pte Lid

Phone: 6739-3274 | email: Coailint honges Ikkauto.com) fax: 67410108

BIK 50, Pasa Ubi Industeinl Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{q080:43)
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EXPRESS SETTLEMENT

RISCHARGE VOUCHER
lli-Direct Settlement (PODS)

Indla Ret: MC20163080
Claimant Ref sSKQse1s

We'l TAN CHONG MOTOR BALES #TE LTD {the workshop®™) hereby confirm that we/l have reached an agreement
with the apporded SmdeMummnmlmmm_mW&me
of Surveyor) with respoct to the smount claimed for 5§ rsace ) e—————————————

e ——————— | S hat was damaged pursuant to the accident which occurred
on  1weaoe (SRt0) at _ *JE SUF RO WTD BRE flocation) mvolving wohicle no 2242728 (insurod
vemcle) Thie s pursuant 1o the innpection conducted on 1011201 (date) at “the workshop®,

Wal confirm fhat weil aream suthorized by the owner LEE HEE YAN ("he thitd party
clamant”) af vehicle na %%0 wiG mmna-mnwunm-noummdwnmwmm»m
ummmmnnammum“nmm We/l mmmhhnaoimnquo,'mmm
panty cluemant”

M‘lmcmﬁrmmumrlwllmom'y thMwmmmthom 0SS and/or exponse that
they wil or bave airsady mmanuuamuunmwmmwwlmmmm Indges »
furthee claim nomrd!brommwhnamw suffered portaining to cost of repairs andlor rental andior loss
MWDM”NW‘” 091G (vehicio no ) as & result of the socident

Weil canfirm that the agreemort reached m-numamlmmwwwmdwmmmmm
mlenm-mmnmmummmuvmtumaummmmumumouumy
basis.

This agreement s subject 10 1he eoplicition of Singapory law and the Singapore Courts have extiusive Jutisdiction over any
Qupute arsing out of the same

We Butharize youto pay the total amount of S$1860.00 1o TAN CHONG MOTOR SALES PTE LTD

Oatod this day of 20
CLAIMANT: - ]
Signature: Signature MTH
Signed by 'the werkshop” (with chop) Signed by appointed Surveyor
Nwme: Mame
SIPAHBUANG LK AUTD CONSULTANTS PIELTD
NRIC (cms%%ﬁ‘, NRIC A0 \9ER
Address: e Add 31 UBLAVE 1, PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK
AN CHONG MOTOR SALES PIELTD e
;‘3 B'Um M4 ROAD | #0225 SINGAPCRE 408533
at SINGAPOFE 55“23‘“ 8468 7472 Nationaity:
' YEL - BAGBTTY
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