Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com=

Sent: Thursday, 27 June 2019 4:48 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] TCS REF: AAD1610-067--Accident involving SKU4887R &
SHDO324A an 05.10.16 16/16/16/vp05/019296 [External General]

Attachments: image005.emz

Follow Up Flag: Follow up

Flag Status: Completed

Lonpac External - General
Dear Asher

Please proceed.

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all “w _ lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - General data is for internal / extarnal use.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mallto:AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 25 June, 2019 2:22 PM

To: ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Ce: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: TCS REF: AAD1610-067—Accident involving SKU4B87R & SHDO324A on 05.10.16
16/16/16/vp05/019296

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter

We have highlighted to your good office on 07/10/2016 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd

The accident occurred when both party entering into the same premises with a different direction and collided.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 50% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 34,167.42 $6,438.66
2. Loss of Rental (8days x $133.75) $ 1,070.00 $ 1,070.00 (Bdays x $133.75)




3. Loss of Income (8days x $100) $ 800.00 $ 400.00
Sub Total: | $ 7,900.66

50% | $3,954.83
4. LTA/GIA Search Fee 3 B6.00 $ 800
Total | § 36,043.42 $ 3.960.83 - $ 4,500.00

**6 days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The lease.

Thank You.

Best Regords,

Asher Sng | Case Handler

LKK Aulo Consultants Ple Lid

phone: 6841-6031 | emall; ashesng@kkguto.com | fox: 674 1-4108
Bl 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ubl avenue |, #02-25 | 5{408933)

From: ONG LI Ll <llong@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 26 September 2017 4:58 PM

To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>; Agnes Lim (LKKAuto)
<AgnesLim@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine @lkkauto.com>

Cc: “Jasmine Tan' <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>; claims@transcab.com.sg

Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1610-067-Accident involving SKU4887R & SHDO324A on 05.10.16 16/16/16/vp05/019296

Without Prejudice

Dear Wai Yin

Please liaise with LKK and mail the original hard copies to them for direct settlement cases.
Dear Jas

Fya - your ref: CC3/LPC/16018969/KYG3

Regards,

Ong Li Li

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road #17-04/07 The Concourse Singapore 199555
Tel : (65) 6250 7388 Ext. 254 Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Ng Wai Yin [mailto: in

Sent: Tuesday, 26 September, 2017 2:49 PM

To: MT_Claim_SG

Cc: 'Jasmine Tan'; .com.

Subject: TCS REF: AAD1610-067--Accident involving SKU4887R & SHD0324A on 05.10.16



WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sirs

Attached is our GIA report and LOD for your perusal and action.
Original hard copy will mailed to you by post.

Thank You

Best Regards,

Ng Wai Yin

Finance Department
TEL: 6603 1265 Ext.308

TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTELTD
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 43, Singapore 569111

5! Main Line: (45) 6287 4646 Fax Line: (65) 6287 7744
Website: www ranscab.com.sg

This message s confidental. [t may also be privileged or otherwise protectad by work product irmmunity or othier Bgal rules. IF you
have recsived It by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message or
dieclose jts contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message contalning deadlines as incoming e-malls are not scresned for
response deadlings. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guarant=ad on the [nternat



Asher Sna (LKKAuto)

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 2:22 PM

To: ONG LI LI; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: TCS REF: AAD1610-067—-Accident involving SKU4887R &
SHDO0324A on 05.10.16 16/16/16/vp05/019296

Attachments: TP LOD.pdf; ACCIDENT LOCATION.pdf; LKK Inspection.pdf; LKK Adjustment.pdf; LKK

Survey Photo.pdf, LKK Resurvey Photo.pdf

Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 07/10/2016 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred when both party entering into the same premises with a different direction and collided.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 50% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $ 34,167.42 $6,439.66
2 Loss of Rental {E‘da}'s x $133.75) $ 1,070.00 $ 1.070.00 (Bdays x $133.75)
3. Loss of Income (Bdays x $100) $ B00.00 $ 400.00

Sub Total; | $ 7,808.66
50% | & 3,954.83

4. LTA/GIA Search Fee 3 6.00 $ 6.00
Total | § 36,043.42 $ 3.960.83 - § 4.500.00

**& days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference

The above is f

Thank You.

Best Regords

Asher Sng | Cose Hondler

LEK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

phone; 4841-4051 | emall; gshesng@lkkaulo.com | lox: 4741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubl Industrial Park, Ut Avenue |, #02-25 | S[408933)

From: ONG LI LI <llong@lonpac.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 26 September 2017 4:58 PM
To: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>; MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com>; Agnes Lim (LKKAuto)

l



B3

Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Our Ref . AAD1610-067
Your Ref : SKU4887R
Date . 25.5eptember 2017

LONPAC INSURANCE BERHAD
Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD0324A AND SKU4887R ON 05-10-16 07:45 AM ALONG
UPPER SERANGOON ROAD MOBIL PETROL STATION

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured's negligence. We, therefore
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1 Cost of Repair [inclusive of 7% GST) 1 b431966

2 Loss of Rental for _ & days @ $24-3% per day 5 1,070.00

3 Loss of Income for i_ days @ $_100  per day 5 800.00

4 LTA Search Fee 1 6.00

5 Survey Fee 5 0.00
Toral 5 B.315.66

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records

Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act

Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall
proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further

mf—néaﬁce to you.

Jasmine Tan

General Manager

Tel No. : 6603 1250 (DID)

Mate : Please emall any further correspondence to claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 1259)



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax Mo. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No, 200303878K

Authorization To Act

We, Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd of Company Registration No. 200303878K hereby authorize
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd to act on behalf to claim for all losses incurred for the
accident involving SHD0324A and SKU4887R along UPPER SERANGOON ROAD MOBIL
PETROL STATION on 05-10-16 07:45 AM.

In addition, we also hereby authorize the above payment to be made in favour of Trans-cab
Auto Services Pte Ltd upon settlement,

Dated this 25 (day) of September 2017

Jasmine Tan
General Manager



Ado g 10- 047

LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIMNO : I6/16/16/VPI5/0]9296
DATE 24 0CT 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We. TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD confirmed acceptance from Mfs
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner SKL 4887R the sum of Singapore
Dollars FOUR THOUSAND AND FIVE HUNDRED ONLY . (S4.500.00) in full and
final sansfaction. liquidation and discharge of property cluim competent to mefus
upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD in respect ol property claim
sustained by mefus whether now or hereafter 1o become manifest, arising either
directly or indirectly from an accident 1o my vehicle, SHD 3244 on 05/10/2016
along/at UPPER SERANGOON ROAD MOBIL PETROL STATION.

| MWe hereby agree to indemmify and keep indemnify (TAN PANG YONG, JOHN
PAUL / LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) asgunst all clums and any claims
whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the smid accident.

I'We further authorize vou to pay the above settlement sum directly to Mifs TRANS-
CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

I/We hereby acknowledge that this payment is made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice 1o all relsed claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

oAt}

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

I I

Name of vehicle owner/Date



Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel: ©287 6656

Fax: B287 7764

Co. Reg. No.:  201019626G

GST Reg. No.: 201019626G

Tax Invoice / Debit Note

TO:
LOMPAC INSURANCE BERHAD INVOICE NO.  :INV1G611-143
GOLDHILL PLAZA #02-39 : 25, November 2016
1 GOLDHILL PLAZA REFERENCE NO : AAD1610-0&7
308899 Singapore z
: 25, November 2016
ATTENTION: :1
NO. CODE DESCRIPTION QTy UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
1 6050101 REPAIR-SHDO324A;DOA 0510 16(PART-BY-PART-16) 1 643966 6,439.66
Total SGD Excl. GST: 6,018.37
7% G5T 42129
seds SIX THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED THIRTY MINE AND SIXTY SIX SGD ONLY Total SGD Incl. GST : 6,439.66

1) All cheques should be crossed and made payable to"Trans-Cab Aulo Services Pte Lid”
) Please quate our Invoiges Mumber during payment
1) Wae reserve the right to charge interest @ 1 5% per month on everdue invaica

4) Any dispute 83 to the sccuracy, charges etc of this involce must be communicated within 10 days from the dote hareo! falling which it shatl ba

deemed to have been uncanditionally accepted,

THIS IS A COMPUTER GENERATED INVOICE WHICH REQUIRES NO SIGNATURE



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

25 September, 2017

To Whom It May Cancarn

Dear Sir / Madam,
Accident on 05-10-16 07:45 AM at UPPER SERANGOON ROAD MOBIL PETROL STATION

1.  We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd is the
registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicie registration no. SHDO324A. The taxi was hired to TAN PENG
HWEE a registered hirer-operator of Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd at the time of occurrence of the
aforementioned accident at a rental rate $133.75 per day (inclusive of GST),

2.  Please be advised that the Taxi is insured with AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD on a third party basis at the
material time of the accident

3. Please liaise with us directly for any settlement of claims in respect of the said accident.

Yours faithfully,

Jasmine Tan

General Manager

This is o computer generated print-out. No signature [s required,



TRANS-CAB SERVICES PTE LTD

Me. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 83

Singapore 569111

Teol Mo. : 6287 G666 Fax Mo, : 6281 1400
CO./GST Reg. Mo. 200303678K

21.09.47

Dear Sir / Mdm
Please be informed that the taxi was undergoe accident repair In the workshop as lallow :-

Date In Date Out Rental Rate Taxl Ne.
05-10-16 14:10 12-10-16 14:10 $ 131.75 SHDO3244

JASMINE TAN
General Manager



Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. SKU4887R As At 05 Oct
2016 / 07:45:00 )

LLaw Firm Search Details

Sgarch Reason: Insurance claim in relation to traffic accidenl
Law Firm Cass No. TCS(CANDYISHDIZ4A

Current Owner Details

Owner 1D Type: Singaparm NRIC

Owner |0: SATATIN

Drwmer Name: TAN PANG YONG, JOHN PALIL

Regisierad Address Type:  Private Residential (Condo Apt ar House) | Shopping [ Office Complexes
mﬂﬂﬂ BlociHouse 8

Registarad Streel Name:  LIM AH PIN ROAD

Registered Uinit No.: #04-03

Registared Building Name; -

Registared Postal Code: 547822

Current Vehicle Dotalls

Vihicle Mo SKU4BSTR

Maoke Descripfion™odal  TOYOTA / HARRIER PREMIUM 2.0 A

Ingurance Company Mame: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

o Transpors $Q Authoricy

Flease read fhrough the Privacy Sialoment, Tonms of Usa and Disclaimer.
Please do nol use the Back or Forward bullons on your Browsar as (his moy slter the resulls of the transactions.
Besi viewed with [E 8.0 571 and sbowe. 1024 X THE raccluiion
Copyighl © 3016 LTA | Privacy Stettmanf | Tnms of Uee | Qlssisimer | Buiging Websis

5/10/2016



