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CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD

UT Blk 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A, #01-374/382, Singapore 768761
Tel : 67556142 Fax : 67557719

Email: chmotor(@singnet.com.sg

Date: 7 May 2019

EQ Insurance Pte Ltd

C/0 LKK Auto Consultants

Attn : THE MOTOR CLAIMS DEPT
Dear Sir / Madam

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE NO. GZ4652Y & GBC7529G ON 30/09/2016
WOODLANDS RD.

We are authorized by GZ4652Y for their above matter.

Record reveals that you are the insurer of GBC7529G. We therefore wish to seek
compensation from you as below:-

1. Cost of Repairs S% 18190.00
2. Loss of Use (S$ 70.00 /- x 16 + 4 days) S§ 1400.00
3. Hire of Vehicle S$ 0.00
4, LTA Search Fee/GIA Reports S 8.00

TOTAL S$ 19598.00

Please let us have your reply soonest possible.
Thank you.

Yours faithfully
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Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd !!ishun-]une]

From: “Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June)" ~chmotor@singnet.com.sg-~

Date: Sunday, April 01, 2018 2:19 PM

To: "Thin Thin (LKKAuto)" <thinthin@@ lkkauto.com=

Ce: “Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)" <chewht/@lkkauto.com=, " Asher Sng (LKKAuto)" = AsherSng/@lkkauto.com=

Attach:  S-chmys180401141 10.jpe
Subject:  APPEAL 74652 - doa 30/9/16 (EQ Insured - GBC7529G)

Hi Thin Thin.

Pls highlight to your principal this is is a case -(Going straight and
Turning ). fails under Bola scenaio 2.

Hope that the case will be able to settle without escalate to GIA for
deliberation

Thank you.

Rgds

June Phua

Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Lid
Tel :67556142

Fax : 67557719

----- Original Message-----

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday. March 28, 2018 1:45 PM

To: Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd (Yishun-June)

Ce: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) : Asher Sng (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: REMINDER (2 )-GZ4652Y- doa 30/9/16 (EQ Insured - GBC7529G)

“Without Prejudice”
Dear Sir / Madam.

ACCIDENT ON 30/09/2016 INVOLVING VEHICLES GBC 7529G AND GZ 4652Y

We refer to the below matter.

Due to police investigation has not produced any substantive result,
strictly without admission of liability whatever. but with a view towards a
resolutions of your client’s claim in the above matter without resort 10
litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party.
we have our principal instruction to offer 50% to your client’s claim.

Please note that our above settlement is made on a without prejudice basis,
and should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on
the part of our insured/driver. Terms of such settlement should also not be
disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respecl of the accident. Our

offer made in respect of this present matier is made solely to resolve this
matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement
arising from this offer in any other related matters.

Settlement and payment are subject to production of original documents on
demand at any time and execution of Discharge Voucher (for settlement sum
above $20,000/-) by the Plaintiff/C laimant. Further all original documents
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Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

Rik 1019, Yishun Industrial Park A #01-374/382, Singapore 768761

TEL: AT556142 (Y1S) FAX: 67557719 (Y15) Email: chmotor:singnel.com. 52

GST:201001 158E RCB NO:201001158E

M/S: EQINSURANCE COLTD
22 GEMMILL LANE
SINGAPORE 069257

TEL: 62239433
ATTN: Motor Claim Department

WS Ref:
Claim Type:

Accident Date:

TP/EQ
Third Party
30/09/2016

FAX: 62243903

TP Veh Reg No: GBCT7529G

Description

To Supply all replaced parts, all necessary and agreed labour &

miscellaneous charges.
(As recommended by your appointed surveyor)

Final Repair Bill

Claim No:
NO:

Date:
Policy No:

Veh Reg No:
Make/Model:

Quantity |

1PC S5 17,000.00

Add GST @ ™%
Total Amount pavahle

For Cheng Hoe Motor Pte Ltd

febs

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE

ES1691113
PS1901471
06 May 2019
5073860219
GZ4652Y
MITSUBISHI
FBTOABOSRDER
PAGE:]
List Price Amount
53 5§
5% 17,000.00
Total 5% 17.,000.00
1,190.00
S5 18,190.00



SINGAPORE TiaficPoice

POLICE FORCE Singapore 408965
Tel +65 6547 0000
Fax +65 6547 4883
WWW. DONCE. OV, 5

Our Ref - TP/IP/51265/2016
Date 115 MAY 2017
CHENNIAH

BLK 484B CHOA CHU KANG AVE &
#16-44

SINGAFPORE 682484

Dear Sir/Madam

ROAD TRAFFIC ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBC 7529 G AND GZ 4652 Y ALONG WOODLANDS
RD ON 30.09.2016

| refer to the above accident.

Please be informed that our investigation has not produced any substantive result. However, this
does not preclude further prosecution should new evidence emerge later.

Yours faithfully,

HEAD INVESTIGATION
TRAFFIC POLICE

This is a compuier-generated letter. No signature is required.

A FORCE FOR THE NATION



19-10-16:11:11 cheng hoe

A.C. SYED & PARTNERS

ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
COMMISSIONER FOR OATHS

101A UPPER CROSS STREET, #13-23 PEOPLE'S PARK CENTRE, SINGAPORE 058358

TEL ; 6538 7411 & FAX : 6534 1011

[TO: CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD BILLNO : BO70/2016

YOUR REF:

OUR REF : ACS.CH.LTA.2016 (S

DATE: 19710116 |

TO OUR PRO ONAL CHARGES for acting for you in the above matter including
where necessary perusals, attendance preparation examination of documents
'mlaﬁng thereto; correspondence, attendance, perusals, telephone calis, searches

and all other incidental works not specifically mentioned herein to enable us to carry
out the work entrusted to us inclusive of all advice,

[SINGAPORE DOLLARS: TWO HUNDRED AND SIXTY FOUR ONLY )

MeAC ARTNERS
ADVOCATES & SOLICITORS
SINGAPORE

We reserved the right to farward a subsequent bill for any
disbursemanis omitted herein,
E.& OE

sub-total bif ] 200.00

~ |26, SKM B081P (SJR 2010U) as at 16.9.16 $ 8.00
< |27, YL 4388X (SJR 3760G) as at 18.8.15 $ 8.00
~|28. SLA 3830U (SGS 2410D) a5 at 26.9.16 5 §.00
- [28. SCG 8181D (5GY 1388T) as at 23.9.16 -] 8.00
~]30. GU B525G (SLD 44407) as at 26.9.16 3 8.00

¢+ 131. 8GQ 1135R (EL 351) as at 26,8,16 5 8.00
|32, SGW 5595M (SKL 2073K) as at 28.9.16 s 8.00
s |33, GBC 75296 (GZ 4652Y) as at 30.9.16 $ 8.00
§  264.00]

it
o



Vehicie Hub Page 1 of' ]

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. GBC7529G As At 30 Sep 2016 /
14:35:00 )
Law Firm Search Details

Search Reazon: Insurance claim in relation o traffic accident
Law Firm Case No. CHM-GZ4652

Current Owner Details

Owner 1D Type: Business

Owner 1D; 531976870

Owner Name SIONG DOOR ENTERPRISE

Registared Address Type  Private Residential {Condo Apt or House) / Shopping / Office Complexes
Registered Block/House 1072

Mo
Registered Street Mame EUNDOS AVENUE 5
Registered Unit Na #01-170

Registered Building Mams:

Registerad Postal Coda: 409751

Current Vehicle Details

Vehicle No GBCT529G

Make Descrnption/Model TOYOTA T DYNA 150 MANUAL
insurance Company Mame: EQ INSURANCE COMPANY LTD

Lakid LR AT M".Ll RLF Y

Flease read throwgh the Privacy Statemeant, Terms of Usa and Cisclaimer, _
Please do not use the Back or Forward buttans on your browser as this may alter the results of the transacticns
Besl yiewed with 1E 6.0 5F3 and above, 1024 X 768 resolution
Copyright & 2018 LTA | Privacy Swatemant | Terme of Use | Dieclaimer | Hate tha Websie

hitps://vrlta.gov.sg/lta/vrlaction/lawFirmDetail ZFUNCTION_ID=F1801071ET 30/09.2016



Re:

LETTER OF AUTHORISATION
FOR PROPERTY DAMAGE CLAIM ONLY)

Motor Insurance Claim (J‘Z Qé‘;}r ;

in respect of the traffic accident on_ 39/ ] / "ré
Woodlands Road

at/along

1/We, 800 Super Waste Management Pte Ltd

NRIC 198601155H of 17A Senoko Way Singapore 758056

owner of motor vehicle GZ4632Y  insured by NTUC Inecome Insurance

Co-operative Ltd under policy no. 5073860219

hereby authorise M/s CHENG HOE MOTOR PTE LTD on Blk 1019 Yishun

Industrial Park A #01-374 Singapore 768761, to act as my/our representative in

my/our claim against the owner /driver of motor vehicle _GBC7529G in respect

of the above-mentioned accident.

I/We further authorise that any payment due to me/us from the aforesaid claim is to be

directed to my/our abovenamed representative.

And 1/'We hereby indemnify my/our abovenamed representative against any claim

and’/or damage which may arise from any action taken on my/our behalf.

I/We affirm all the above by my/our signature below.

Date




