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Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 7 December 2018 10:56 AM
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims)
Cc: CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: RE: URGENT / 2ND REMINDER   Re: Accident on 23/9/2016 involving SHB 213Y & SGV 

5137H  (Our Ref: TAX/09/16/2177/lg)    
Attachments: OI Sketch Plan.pdf; Scene photo.pdf

‘WITHOUT PREJUDICE’ 
  SAVE AS TO COSTS 
 
Dear Lee Gek, 
 
We refer to the below matter. 
 
Our insured has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the negligence of your client. 
 
Our insured was driving on the main drive way and your client vehicle coming out from stop line and collided with our 
insured vehicle. 
 
We are of the opinion that your client should give way to our insured as our insured was travelling on the main drive 
way at the time of accident.  
 
Attached herewith our insured’s sketch plan for your perusal. 
 
Under such a circumstances, we are denying liability and unable to look into your client’s claim, unless you have 
concrete evidence to prove otherwise. 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 
 

From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svcs/Claims & IA/Taxis/Claims) <LeeGek@smrt.com.sg>  
Sent: Monday, 9 July 2018 12:29 PM 
To: CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: URGENT / 2ND REMINDER Re: Accident on 23/9/2016 involving SHB 213Y & SGV 5137H (Our Ref: 
TAX/09/16/2177/lg)  
 
URGENT 
2ND REMINDER 
 
Dear All, 
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We attach the scene photos for your perusal.  
 
The scene photos showed that our taxi was tilted towards the left with the debris beside on the right. It clearly proved 
that:- 
 

a) our taxi was actually within his own path prior to the accident; 
b) our taxi was stationary; 
c) 3rd photo showed your insured’s vehicle lying in the middle of the road; 
d) supports our driver’s version. 

 
Please let us have your offer by 16th July 2018, otherwise please let us have your principal’s consent to escalate the 
matter to GIA. Thanks.    
 
Regards 
Tan Lee Gek (DID: 6866 2647) 
Claims Department 
SMRT Automotive Services Pte Ltd   

 
 


