Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 November 2018 9:05 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Admin A

Ce: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Chee 5o Chow; KKLau

Subject: «Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (Ol |
SNM16D04115C02/3) and SHD9653R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3) on
05.09.2016

Attachments: Scene Photos from SHD9653R.PDF; LKKInspection.pdf; LKKAdjustment1.pdf; LKK

Survey Photos pdf; AAD1609-039 - LOD.PDF

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3
CTI REF — SNM16D04115C02/3 (GBD9433E)

Hi Hsiao Tong

We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.,

Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at $7,215.70.
We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly.
Best Regards

Alfred Toh

Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sag.cntaiping.com

alfred.toh{@sg.cntaiping.com

www.sg.cntaiping.com

T SARY
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Diselaimer

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd Anmy unauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. [f vou are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notifi the sender immediately.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, November 03, 2018 10:57 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com=>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>
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Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (01 : SNM16D04115C02/3) and
SHD9653R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

Hi Sirs/ Mdm,
We refer to our mandate request dated 01 Sept 2018.

kindly let us have your instruction/mandate.

Best Regzards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S[4084633)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Saturday, 1 September 2018 11:08 AM

To: 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’ <claimsdept@s .cntaiping.com:>

Cc: 'jowyn tay@sg.cntaiping.com’ <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin A <admin-a |kkauto.com>
Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (0l : SNM16D04115C02/3) and
SHD9653R (TP ; LKK REF - CC3/CT116016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

Your Ref: SNM16D04115C02/3
LKK Ref: CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3n2

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 9433E(Ol) & SHD 9453R(TP) ON 05/09/2016
wWe refer to the above matter,

Third party reported that he was stationary along Kitchener Link checking for oncoming vehicle on the
opposite lane as he intended to make o right turn towards City Square Residence. after traffic clear, third
party slowly proceed to make a turmn when suddenly our insured overtook his taxi and travel at the opposite
direction. Thus resulted the collision.

Our insured driver reported that he was fravelling along Kitchener Link behind third party taxi. Then third
party stopped without any indication, our insured driver had waited for a while, but third party did not
move off. so he overtook third party taxi. When insured driver was driving pass third party, third party
suddenly turned right and hit onto our insured lorry.

Third party had submitted a copy of scene photos for our consideration. We are of the view that BOLA
scenario 33 is applicable. Liability is not in our driver's favour.

We have contacted our insured to inform third party claim. No video/ evidence from our insured and they
agreed to let insurance to handle.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer “Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Lid" as follows: -



Amount Amount Revised

Claimed
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $20,192.71  $6,420.00
2. Loss of Rental [5days x $108.07) $ 54035 $ 540.35 (5daysx $108.07)
3, Loss of Income (5days % $50.00) $ 25000 $ 250.00 (Sdaysx $50.00)
4.LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 6.00 $ 5.35

Total $ 20.98%.06 $7.215.70

**D4days recommendation for repair

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2016 7:07 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@Ilkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com=; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com=; Zayyer [LKKAuto)
czayyer@lkkauto.com>: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBDY9433E (01 : SNM16D04115C02/3) and SHDSB53R (TP : LKK
REF - €C3/CTI16016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

Dear Hsiao Tong & Mei Kwan,

wWe refer to your email on even date.

We attached herewith our insured’s gia accident and letter for your immediate attention.
Please note that the officer in charge of this matter is Angie Foo.

Thank you,

Regards,

Jowyn Tay

Assistant Claims Executive

MMotor Division

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909



Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6174

Fax: 6224 7175 / 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com
Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

**#**#t***###*tt***t#*##i#**##**t***t**##***#***t*#t**l!*tt**z*t**#**#**#¥**t¢*+*t**i**

*4************%**t****lﬂ**tt********i

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping
Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

**w*t****mw**t*mt**t#****t**t*t***#*##****$**#***#**t**tm*#*****t*t*m+****¢m*t*****mtt*

#*mt*#tt**#1**mw*****mt****t*##**t*#

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 8 September, 2016 5:29 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: Alfred Toh; Hwang Shiang Yi; Angie Foo; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zayyer (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (01 : CAl - TBA) and SHD9653R (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/CT116016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 9653R at M/s Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd - Ang Mo Kio.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP GIA report
- TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax; 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security cloud service.
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From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuta)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 November 2018 12:59 PM

To: ‘Claims Dept of CTI'

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat; Alfred Toh; Chee So Chow; KKLau; Admin A

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (Ol :
SNM16004115C02/3) and SHD9653R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3) on
05.09.2016

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.
Case has been settled at a global sum of $7,200.00(all-in) with Third Party repairer.
We are pending for signed DV from third party and will proceed fo close file once DV received.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Claims Dept of CTI <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Sent: Monday, 5 November 2018 9:05 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ong Chin Kiat <chinkiat.ong@sg.cntaiping.com=; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Chee 5o Chow
<sochow.chee @sg.cntaiping.com>; KKLau <kklau@lkkauto.com>

Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (Ol : SNM16D04115€02/3) and
SHD9653R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI116016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

LKK REF - CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3
CTI REF - SNM16D04115C02/3 (GBD9433E)

Hi Hsiao Tong
We refer to your emails pertaining to the above matter.
Please proceed to resolve the property damage claim at §7,215.70.

We await your payment advice to enable Chin Kiat to act accordingly.

Best Regards



Alfred Toh
Senior Executive

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079909

DID: +65 6389 6183

FAX: +65 6224 7478/6224 7175

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com

www.sq.cntaiping.com

AN NSARY
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Disclainer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized
disclosure. use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message,
please notify the sender immediately.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com
Sent: Saturday, November 03, 2018 10:57 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTl <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>

Ce: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntai ing.coms=

Subject: RE: <Seek Mandate> Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (01 : SNM16D04115C02/3) and
SHD9653R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

Hi Sirs/ Mdm,
We refer to our mondate request dated 01 Sept 2018.

Kindly let us have your instruction/mandate.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Saturday, 1 September 2018 11:08 AM

To: 'claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com’ <claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com>
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Cc: ‘iuwvn.tav@sg,cntaipingicum' <jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com>; Admin & <admin-a@lkkauto.com>
Subject: <Seek Mandate> Direct settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (O1 : SNM 16D04115C02/3) and

SHDI653R (TP : LKK REF - CC3/CT116016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

Your Ref: SNM16D04115C02/3
LKK Ref: CC3/CTI1460169462/Kpa3n2

Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 9433E(Ol) & SHD 9453R(TP) ON 05/09/201&
we refer to the above matter.

Third party reported that he was stationary along Kitchener Link checking for oncoming vehicle on the
opposite lane as he intended to make ¢ right turn fowards City Square Residence. After traffic clear, third
party slowly proceed to make a turn when suddenly our insured overtook his taxi and travel at the ocpposite
direction. Thus resulted the collision.

Our insured driver reported that he was travelling along Kitchener Link behind third party taxi. Then third
party stopped without any indication, our insured driver had waited for a while, but third party did not
move off. so he overtook third party taxi. When insured driver was driving pass third party, third party
suddenly turned right and hit onto our insured lomy.

Third party had submitted a copy of scene photos for our consideration. We are of the view that BOLA
scenario 33 is applicable. Liability is not in our driver’s favour.

We have contacted our insured to inform third party claim. No video/ evidence from our insured and they
agreed to let insurance to handle.

We seek your approval to offer Third Party repairer "Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd" as follows: -

Amount Amount Revised
Claimed
1. Cost of Repair [w/GST) 32019271 $ 6,420.00
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $108.07) $ 54035 $ 540.35 (5daysx $108.07)
3. Loss of Income (5days x $50.00) $ 250.00 $ 250.00 (5days x $50.00)
4, LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 &.00 % 535

Total $2098%.06 $7.215.70

**0D4days recommendation for repair
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

The above is for your approval.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jowyn Tay <jowyn.tay@sg cntaiping.com>

Sent: Thursday, 8 September 2016 7:07 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Ce: Alfred Toh <alfred.toh@sg.cntaiping.com>; Angie Foo <angie.foo@sg.cntaiping.com>; Zayyer (LKKAuto)
<zayyer@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ikkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (Ol : SNM16D04115C02/3) and SHDI9653R (TP : LKK
REF - CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

Dear Hsiao Tong & Mei Kwan,
We refer to your email on even date.
We attached herewith our insured’s gia accident and letter for your immediate attention.

Please note that the officer in charge of this matter is Angie Foo.
Thank you.

Regards,
Jowyn Tay

Assistant Claims Executive
Motor Division

Claims Department
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.

3 Anson Road #16-00
Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909
Co. Reg. No. 200208384E

DID: 6389 6174

Fax: 6224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email: claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com
jowyn.tay@sg.cntaiping.com

Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

****t##***ttt*****tt*##*l**#*****tt*t****t**#*#*t*********#*****t*t***t**ttt***t***#**t
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Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance
(Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping
Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial,
is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, 8 September, 2016 5:29 PM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Ce: Alfred Toh: Hwang Shiang Yi; Angie Foo; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Zayyer (LKKAuto); Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving GBD9433E (O1: CAl- TBA) and SHD9653R (TP : LKK REF -

CC3/CTI16016962/Kpa3) on 05.09.2016

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Sir / Madam,
We refer to the above matter.
This is a TP direct settlement case.
We had inspected TP vehicle SHD 9653R at M/s Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd - Ang Mo Kio.
Enclosed for your perusal is:
TP GIA report
TP estimated cost of repair
- Preliminary advice
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured'’s GIA report for our necessary action.
Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto,com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com




Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd
No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Our Ref + AAD1609-039
Your Ref + GBD9433E
Date : 14.August 2018
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHD9653R AND GBD9433E ON 05/09/16 10:50 AM ALONG
Kitchener Link

It appears that the above accident was caused by your insured's negligence. We, therefore
seeking compensation from you for our financial loss as itemized below :-

1 Caost of Repair {inclusive of 7% G5T) % 6,420.00

2 Loss of Rental for _° _days @ $_"°" °/ per day $ 540.35

3 Loss of Income for _* __ days @ $_*°  per day $ 250.00

4. LTA Search Fee $ 6.00

5: Survey Fee % 0.00
Total % 7.216.35

We enclose a copy of the following documents for your consideration :-

GIA report lodged by our driver Rental rate and mileage records

Certificate of Insurance Authorization To Act

Original final repair bill LTA Search Fee

Kindly let us have the discharge voucher within the next 14 days, failing which we shall

proceed to hand over the conduct of this matter to our solicitors without further
reference to you.

Yours Faithfully
Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

Jasmine Tan

General Manager

Tel No. : 6603 1250 (DID)

Mote : Please email any further correspondence to claims@transcab.com.sg (6603 1259)



Hsiao Tam.; (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 11 October, 2016 11:39 AM

To: 'email2Znmani@gmail.com’

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 9433E & SHD 9653R OM 05/09/2016
Attachments: Scene Photos from SHD9653R. pdf

Your Ref: GBD 9433E
Our Ref: CC3/CT116016962/Kpal

Dear Mr Mani,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBD 9433E & SHD 94653R ON 05/09/2016

We refer to the above subject matter. We wiite to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed by

your motor insurer, China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim against
your policy.

We attached here with a copy of accident scene photos submitted by third party for your easy reference.

Based on all available information at hand for the accident, we are of the view that we do not have a
good defense towards the claim submitted by the driver of SHD 9653R. Your vehicle GBD 7433E was
overtaking third party's vehicle from the right against the traffic flow. Safety precaution must be observed
to ensure the traffic condition is safe for you to do so and to avoid collision. Please refer to the below
Barometer of Liability Agreement (BOLA) scenario 33.

T-JUNCTION X Y
33
s ! Vehicle X- Overtaking from
;_ v the right 100% | 0%
—— Vehicle Y- Changing lane or
p tuming
al
J Reason: Vehicle should not
overtake from the right against
X the flow of traffic

Therefore, we are of the opinion that liability is not in your favour. We will proceed to negotiate for an
amicable settlement with the Third Party.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have
them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 22/10/2014, after we shall proceed with negotiation with Third
Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims whatsoaver
by you/your driver against the other party's insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please call us if you have further queries.



Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@]kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

Authorization To Act

We, Trans-cab Services Pte Ltd of Company Registration No. 200303878K hereby authorize
Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd to act on behalf to claim for all losses incurred for the
accident involving SHD9653R and GBD9433E along Kitchener Link on 05/09/16 10:50 AM.

In addition, we also hereby authorize the above payment to be made in favour of Trans-cab
Auto Services Pte Ltd upon settlement.

Dated this 14 (day) of August 2018

Yours Faithfully
Tranﬂ_—Cah Services Pte Ltd

Jasmine Tan
General Manager
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Policy No' : DMCWSN30T73871600 Claim Mo @ SHM16DD4115C02/3
Claimant TRANS-CABR SERVICES PTE LTD
Amount : 557,200.00

Singapore Dollars SEVEN THOUSAND THO HUNDEED Only

I/le agree to accept the above menticned amount to be paid te mefus in full &
final sectlement of all claims, costs & disbursements for injuries / damages
sustained by me/us through an accident involving

Clzimant Vehicle Mo, ¢ SHDI9E53R
Insured Vehicle Ho. ¢ GBD9433E

bate of Loss t 05/08/52016
Flace of Accident i KITCHEMER LINK

IN CONSIDERATION of the payment made to mefus of the aforementicned sum by
CHINAE TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD., I/We agres absolutely to
discharge CHINA TRIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE} PTE. LTD. and/or

Insurad Hame : MEMIK ENGINEERING AND COWSTRUCTICH FTE LTD
Oriver Hame : THARUMARAJAN VENKATESAN

from all claims, present or future in respect of all logs, injury or damage
sustained by mefus arising out of the said accident.

T acknowledge that this payment is made without admission of liability on the
part of CHINA TRIPING INSURARNCE {SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

(1) Global Sum GE 7,200.00
TOPAL i & & o . e o B8 7,200.00

. I.l- . L} l;I ] : _l..!l:
Claimant Name : Uk e NRIC No : '

-1 DEC 1018

Signature H _ ' bate




Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd
Mo. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63 Singapore 569111
Tel: 6287 6666

Fax: 6287 /764

Co.Reg. No.: 2010196266

GST Reg. No.: 201019626G

Tax Invoice / Debit Note

TO:
CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

INVOICE NO.  :INV1808-012

105 Cecil Street DATE : 14, August 2018
#16-01,/02 The Octagon REFERENCE NO : AAD1609-039
069534 Singapore TERMS H
DUE DATE : 14, August 2018
ATTENTION: PAGE 26
|
NO. CODE DESCRIPTION QTY  UNIT PRICE AMOUNT
Invoice Mo, INV1610-159:
1. 6050101 REPAIR-SHDS9653R;D0OA 05.09.16(LUMP SUM-16) 1 6,420.00 6,420.00
Total SGD Excl. G5T : 6,000.00
7% GST: 420.00
#=xk SI THOUSAND FOUR HUMDRED TWENTY 5GD OMLY **** Total SGD Incl. GST: 6,420.00

1) All chegues should be crossed and made payable to"Trans-Cab Auto Services Pte Ltd®

2) Please guote our [nvoice Number during payment,

3) We reserve tha right to charge interest @ 1.5% per manth on overdue invoice.

4} Any dispute as to the accuracy, charges etc of this invoice must be communicated within 10 days from the date hereof failing which it shall be

deamad to have been unconditionally accepted.

E.&0.E

THIS IS A COMPUTER GEMERATED INVOICE WHICH REQUIRES NO SIGNATURE



Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd

No. 2 Ang Mo Kio Street 63

Tel No.: 6287 6666 Fax No. 6281 1400
Co./GST Reg. No. 200303878K

14 August, 2018

To Whom It May Concern

Dear Sir / Madam,
Accident on 05/09/16 10:50 AM at Kitchener Link

1.  We refer to the above-mentioned accident and wish to inform that Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd is the
registered owner of the taxi bearing vehicle registration no. SHD9653R. The taxi was hired to ABDUL
KADAR BIN MOHAMED ZAKARIA a registered hirer-operator of Trans-Cab Services Pte Ltd at the time of
occurrence of the aforementioned accident at a rental rate $108.07 per day (inclusive of G5T).

2. Please be advised that the Taxi is insured with AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD on a third party basis at the
material time of the accident.

3. Please liaise with us directly for any settlement of claims in respect of the said accident.

Yours faithfully,

Jasmine Tan

General Manager

This is a computer generated print-out. No signature is required.



WE2016 Vehicle Hub
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Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. GBD9433E As At 05 Sep 2016 /
10:50:00 )

Law Firm Search Defails

Search Reascn: Insurance claim in relation to traffic accident

Law Firm Case Me.: TCS{ROEL)SHDO&R3R

Current Owner Details

Owner 1D Type: Company

Owner |0 201218274W

Owner Name: MANIK ENGINEERING AND COMSTRUCTION FTE. LTD.

Registered Address Type:  Private Residential {(non-Condo Apt / non-House)

Registered Block/House B4a
Mo.:

Registerad Streat Mame:  LOROMNG 3 GEYLANG

Registered Unil Mo.: s

Registerad Building Mame: -

Ragisterad Postal Code: 382025

Current Vehicle Details

Vehicle No.: GROS433E

Make DescriptionModel.  TOYOTASDYNAZOM

Insurance Company Mame: CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTELTD
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