Hsiao TnnE (LKKAuto)

From: MG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 16 March 2020 1:43 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuUto)

Cc: Admin A

Subject: RE: C0326720- <Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate> AXA Ref: PDE13281

*LKK REF: CCA/AXA14023904/Kpa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL3958H(OI) &
SIRTS50U(TP) ON 20/12/2014]

Hi Hsiao Tong

Please proceed. Thanks.

Regards

Stacey Ng | Assistant Manager, Motor Claims Department

AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg
Email:stacey.ng@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 BEO4E8B8

_l E‘ ' GLOBAL INSURANCE
BRAND FOR 10

50 Years coNsECUTIVE YEARS

in Singapore

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is canfidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Monday, March 16, 2020 10:34 AM

To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: C0326720- <Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate> AXA Ref: POB13281*LKK REF:
CCH/AXA14023904/Kpa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL3958H(0!) & SIR7S50U(TP) ON 20/12/2014]

Hi Stacey,
We refer to the above matter.

For LOU, third party rejected our offer at $100.00/day and proposed $120.00/day as agreed rate with AXA, See
attached.

In view of this, kindly advise if we may proceed to settle as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) 5 9,844.00
2. Loss of Use (14days x 5120.00)* 5 1,680.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee s 2.00

Total | $11,526.00

Thank you.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: NG Stacey <stacey ng@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 6 March 2020 11:58 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: C0326720- <Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate> AXA Ref: PO813281*LKK REF:
CCH/AXA14023904/Kpa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL3958H(0I) & SIR7S50U(TP) ON 20/12/2014]

Hi Hsiao Tong
Please proceed. Thanks

Regards

;.it_aceyr Ng | Assistant Manager, Motor ClaiFné D_Epartment
AXA Insurance Pte Ltd | 8 Shenton Way, #24-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811 | www.axa.com.sg

Email:stacey.ng@axa.com.sg
Customer Care No. 1800 8804888

E GLOBAL INSURANCE
Al #1 FOR 10
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in Singapore

Please consider the environment before printing this message
This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Friday, March 6, 2020 7:32 AM

To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg=

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] FW: <Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate> AXA Ref: P0O813281*LKK REF:
CC6/AXA14023904/Kpa3s2-1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL3558H(O1) & SJR7550U(TP) ON 20/12/2014)

3 REMINDER
Dear 5irs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.



We have temparary close our file on year 2016 due to no submission of LOD/documents from third party.

Now, third party had submitted the LOD and documents as attached.

In view of this, kindly assist to re-open the case and let us have you mandate to settle the matter at 511,246.00(all-
in). Breakdown as follows: -

Liability: 100% [Head-to Rear Collision)

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) 5 0,844.00
2. Loss of Use (14days x $100.00)* S 1,400.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 5 2.00

Total 11,246.00

*Third party vehicle is for motor instruction (Bukit Batok Driving Centre Ltd).

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto)

sent: Monday, 6 January 2020 3:21 PM

To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng(@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate> AXA Ref: POB13281*LKK REF: CCB/AXA14023904/Kpals2-
1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL3958H(0I1) & SJR7550U(TP) ON 20/12/2014]

2" REMINDER

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have temporary close our file on year 2016 due to no submission of LOD/documents from third party.
Now, third party had submitted the LOD and documents as attached.

In view of this, kindly assist to re-open the case and let us have you mandate to settle the matter at 511,246.00(all-
in). Breakdown as follows: -



Liability: 100% (Head-to Rear Collision)

1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) 5 9,844.00
2. Loss of Use (14days x $100.00)* $ 1,400.00
3. LTA/ GlA Search Fee 5 2.00

Total | $11,246.00

*Third party vehicle is for motor instruction (Bukit Batok Driving Centre Ltd).

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction.

“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong [LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 11 December 2019 5:59 PM

To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng@axa.com.sg>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: <Request for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate> AXA Ref: POB13281*LKK REF: CC6/AXA14023904/Kpa3s2-
1 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL3958H(01) & SJR7550U(TP) ON 20/12/2014]

REMINDER

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have temporary close our file on year 2016 due to no submission of LOD/documents from third party.
Now, third party had submitted the LOD and documents as attached.

In view of this, kindly assist to re-open the case and let us have you mandate to settle the matter at $11,246.00(all-
in). Breakdown as follows: -

Liability: 100% (Head-to Rear Collision
1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) $5,844.00
2. Loss of Use (14days x 5100.00)* 51,400.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 5 2.00
Total | 511,246.00

*Third party vehicle is for motor instruction (Bukit Batok Driving Centre Ltd).



Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction.

“Best Wishes for Merry Christmas, and Happy New Year 2020"

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 22 November 2019 5:59 AM
To: NG Stacey <stacey.ng(@axa.com.sg=>

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com=>
Subject: <Reguest for Re-open Case & Seek Mandate> AXA Ref: POR13281*LKK REF: CCA/AXAL14023904/Kpads2-1

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL3958H(OI) & SIR7550U(TP) ON 20/12/2014]

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

We refer to the above matter.

We have temporary close our file on year 2016 due to no submission of LOD/documents from third party.
Now, third party had submitted the LOD and documents as attached.

In view of this, kindly assist to re-open the case and let us have you mandate to settle the matter at 511,246.00(all-
in). Breakdown as follows: -

Liability: 100% (Head-to Rear Collision)

1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) 5 9,844.00
2. Loss of Use (14days x 5100.00)* $1,400.00
3. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 5 2.00

Total | $11,246.00

*Third party vehicle is for motor instruction (Bukit Batok Driving Centre Ltd).

Kindly let us have your mandate/ instruction.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phaone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

----- Disclaimer-----
This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are

not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
-----Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.

————— Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.
-----Disclaimer-----

This message may contain confidential information intended solely for the use of the named addressee. If you are
not the intended recipient, you should not read, use, disclose or reproduce the content of this message. If you have
received this message by mistake, please notify the sender immediately. Any views or opinions presented in this
message are solely those of the author and do not necessarily represent those of AXA Insurance Pte Ltd or any other
entity of the AXA Group, unless otherwise stated by the sender and duly authorized by the said companies.

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by

AXA except where provided for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any

unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is

prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify

the sender immediately.
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Our Ref: CCH/AXA14023904/Kse3
Policy No: PO813281

{1 January 2015

Joo Keong Towing Services
ik 422 Bi Batok West Ave 2
#12-193

Singapore 650422

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING YL 3958H AND SJR 7550U ON 2041272014

We refer 1o the above accident where we are acting for AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Lid
(AXA) to resolve the claim against you and/or your quthorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Panty.

Should you however wish 1o {urther discuss on the matter prior o our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 10 days from the date of this letter.

Accordingly your No Claim Discount (NCD - if applicable) may not be preserved.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Sharon Yee

DID: 6749 4274

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: sharonyeedlkkauto.com

ce.  AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Leel
{ Motar Claims Dept)



Leiter of Authorizalion

To Whom It May Concern

Accident on 20th December 2014 jpyolving SJR7550U and YL3958H

Along Slip Road of Bukit Batok Road
UWe Bukit Batok Driving Centre Ltd NRIC NO. 198801155R of
815 Bukit Batok West Ave 5 S(659085)

owner of Motor Vehicle Registration No SJR7550U insured by
NTUC INCOME INSURANCE CO-OPERAT IR der Policy No. 0073346186-10

do hereby authorize M/s K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd as raylour

representative with full authority to write, negotiate and settle claim for damages on my/our

behalf against the owner and for driver of Molor Vehicle Regn No. YL3958H

in regard to the above mentioned accident

1 /We also consent to the agreed seitlement sum be made in favour of mylour representative,

S K. Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd and the said

payment be forwarded to them to be construed as full and final discharge of ray/our claim.

Owner' Signature & Company Stamp

16.08.2016

Date



AXA THIRD PARTY DIRECT SETTLEMENT

Y 3958H _(insd veh] [

[ Vehide No: iR
L _ TSR 7550U [TPuehl | Model’ Honda Jazz (1338¢c) I
| Date af Actident/ Time: | - 201212014 i _ SR I
I — T35 U ¥F0-0F _ e A
Final iiepair Cost (wiGST) T T G 844 .00 B |
| Lossof Use G s 1.680.00 194 days at 5120.00par day
rental {ifany) i i = days a1 % e day |
LT/ GIA Search Fee 5 o, o e R — e
i [Ehers i e En -
— e — s —
Final Settlement Sum % 11.528.00
payee Name : K.Kim Hin Auto Peltd e
is Third Party Workshop Gia Registered? %] YES | | HNO [kindly Hidicate bebow)
Al Far Ne.-n-ﬁ_llﬁ_ite-g'rstert_{.l_'-;l.:-rhshu'p ..... T ;.::-e |1 i--r"'-.‘!.“':; = __ _ I.+I_ o B T
(81 ForGlA Registered Workshop: AOLA Appicabin Yas/#s BOLA Stenario Mo 21

assessed Lability 7]

BOLA Linbality I_“"H:I o

= assessed Liobiily ta be Jitled curly for chisdit collish

]

ans perd for coses whede BOLA does not apaly

FET -

MNOTE:
1. PLEASE EXPRESSLY RESERVEVOUR CLIENT'S RIGHTS IF 50 REQUIRED IN THIS SETTLEMENT DOCUMENT.
7. THIS SETTLEMENT 15 ON A WITHOUT PR EJUGICE BASIS AND SHOULD NOT CONSTRUED AR AN ADMISSION OF
LIABILITY ON AXA AND THEIR CLIENT/TORTREASOR 1N ANY MANNER WHATSOEVER.
1 AXARESERVES THEIR RIGHTS UNDER THE POLICY TERMS & CONDITIONS A5 WELL A5 THEIR RIGHTS IN LAW.

Onky applicable 1o rental claim - All document are 1
agroement | invoices are not received within 7 doys of 1
per the MIMA rates

| confirmed that this is a full and final settlement that we and of cur elsent b
thorised driver ftartfeasor| Tor any and sl losses {pastfpresantfiuture] arising

W)
policyholderfau

Wwe confirmed that authority af our client to act for and on thew beha

o be submitted with this settlement confirmation
his signed confirmation, we will automatic

In the eveni, rental
alty revert 10 10ss of use claim

avefhadfhas against vou [AXA and thelr
from this accident

Lo stamp [if applicable)

Signaly waorkshop rEpreaen'mwTe'.-' Wark Ehn-pr;i:;n:ip ':rgnalu.r'e af witne
wame of Aepresentative.  Bpedais A Mame ol Wilness  ALABAALET
Date: 7 5. 8> Dare A S B R )

“C -

TEignature of ARA' Surveyar/rep
Mame of AXA's surveyor JReprese

Data- lﬂl uw

3

AxA lAsurance Fe Lid [Company Reg. Mo 150L0E5T 3N
3 Shanton Way H2d-01 A4 Tower Singapore J6661 |

Anm Custarmer Cenkre $01-2 Li32

Telephane: +55 GH50 4683 - ana COM.SE
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GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE
GENERAL RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

I"SURANCE 10 Anson Road, #06-16 International Plaza, Singapore 079803

ASSOCIATION Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to 5Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE 5ot Registration No: M400017735

Invoice

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Our Ref No: GR-14-116698
Date of Request, 22/12/2014 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

K Kim Hin Auto Pte Ltd
Blk 34, #01-114

Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575708

Dear Sir/Madam,

Enquiry Date 22M12/2014
Enquiry By Jane

TP Vehicle Mo, YL3958H
Accident Date 20/12/2014

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
YL3958H AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Lid 19/05/2014-18/05/2015 6338 7288
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General
Insurance Association of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no
liability whatsoever for any loss or damage arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

http://singapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm?fusebox=MTRsas&amp:fuseaction=dsp_geninvip&... 22-Dec-14



Invoice

GENERAL
INSURANCE
ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Our Ref No: GR-14-1166598
Date of Request: 22/12/2014

K Kim Hin Auto Pte Lid
Blk 34, #01-114

Sin Ming Drive
Singapore 575708

Dear SirfMadam,

Enquiry Date 221122014
Enquiry By Jane

TP Vehicle No. YL3958H
Accident Date 2011272014

Page 2 of 2

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF
SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

10 Anson Road, #06-16 International Plaza, Singapore 079903
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 9am to Spm

GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Your Ref No: Online Purchase

DESCRIFPTION AMOUNT (S§)

TP Insurer Enquiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use;
Date:
[X] GIRO[]Cash[] Cheque

http://singapore. merimen_com/claims/index.cim?fusebox=MTRsas&amp;fuseaction=dsp_geninvtp&... 22-Dec-14



