Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 7 October, 2019 5:48 PM

To: waiwaidx@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16 LKK REF CC4/LPC16014069/R1hb3
Attachments: DV.PDF

Importance: High

Without Prejudice

Dear Wai Wai,

We refer to our below email.
For your acceptance please.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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RLERER W Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 27 August, 2019 1:01 PM

To: waiwaidx@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16 LKK REF CC4/LPC16014069/R1hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Wai Wai,

We refer further to the below email.



Purely for an amicable settlement on a without prejudice basis and without admission of any liability to our
Insured’s part, we have our principal’s mandate and we propose below amount to settle your client’s claim:

Cost of Repair (w/gst) S 588.50
Loss of Use ($30 x 3 days) S 90.00
GIA Search Fee S 2.00

TOTAL S 680.50

If agreeable, kindly let the owner sign the attached DV then forward back to us (LKK) the original signed hard copy
together with the Final Repair Invoice for our principal to process the payment.

The above amount is to be made payable to DE XING MOTOR PTE LTD.

Thank you.

"Please note that our above offer and any settlement arising from the above offer are made on a without prejudice basis, and
should not be construed as an admission of liability on our part or on the part of our Insured Driver. Terms of such settlement
should also not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of the accident. Our offer made in respect of this present
matter is made solely to resolve this matter only. No reference shall be made to this offer or any settlement arising from this offer
in any other related matters.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

RERER WWT Sve the Larthe Print only when necessary

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 5 August, 2019 10:18 AM

To: waiwaidx@gmail.com

Cc: Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16 LKK REF CC4/LPC16014069/R1hb3

Without Prejudice
Dear Wai Wai,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that | am taking over the matter and we are currently in the midst of seeking mandate approval
to our principal.



We will get back to you for an update/offer in due course.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh @lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: WAIWAI DEXING <waiwaidx@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, 14 May 2019 11:53 AM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com>
Subject: Re: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16

Hi Mr.Rasul,
Enclose with the documents and please let us have the finalization figure.

Thanks & best regards,
Wai Wai
De Xing Motor

On Mon, May 13, 2019 at 8:47 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Wai Wai,

Kindy assist

Best Regards,

Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 12:40 PM
To: WAIWAI DEXING

Subject: RE: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16

Hi Wai Wai,

Could you forward to me and the parts invoice as well

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: WAIWAI DEXING [mailto:waiwaidx@gmail.com]
Sent: Thursday, 9 May, 2019 12:37 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16

Hi Rasul,

This is 2016 case and in-charge person is no more working here.
4



So | cannot get the photos but here we have the discharge voucher and authorization letter signed by the client
after repair.

Thanks & best regards,
Wai Wai

De Xing Motor

On Thu, May 9, 2019 at 11:59 AM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Wai Wai,

Kindly assist on the damage parts photos

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LSES
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 8 May, 2019 9:30 AM
To: WAIWAI DEXING

Subject: RE: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16

Hi Wai Wai,



Kindly assist. | need to close this file a.s.a.p

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

w0 Save the Earth Print only when necessary:

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 7 May, 2019 2:16 PM
To: WAIWAI DEXING

Subject: RE: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16

Hi Wai Wai,

There a few check item haven’t resurvey, kindly forward to me the check item damage photos

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315




Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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From: WAIWAI DEXING [mailto:waiwaidx@gmail.com]
Sent: Monday, 6 May, 2019 12:39 PM

To: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16

Hi Rasul,
Bike was being repaired.

Can we finalize this case?

Thanks & best regards,
Wai Wai

De Xing Motor

On Thu, May 2, 2019 at 3:18 PM Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@Ikkauto.com> wrote:

Hi Wai Wai,

Any update? | need to close this case

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LFES L.
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From: Rasul (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 26 April, 2019 3:02 PM
To: waiwaidx@gmail.com

Subject: FBK 291U DOA : 25/07/16

Hi Wai Wai,

As spoken, this bike was surveyed by me on 02/08/2016 until now this bike had not yet finalise.

May | know what is the status?

Best Regards,
Rasul | Assessor
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Litd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ LFES L.
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