
From: Agnes Lim (LKKAuto) '
Sent: Friday, 23 September, 2016 2:53 PM
To: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA) <l,eeGek?trul]le om.sg>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto)
<iarLhue-(4lk&eu1a. ce,q>
Cc: CS A Team <9$:O(r&LAuU.ce!:>; Admin A <adrrin-aiQ&Lquto.corn>
Subject: RE: Accident on 151712016 involving SHB I 156Y & SKT 1204L - AIG (Our Ref:
T Axt07 /1612146/19)

Dear Lee Gek,

Thank you for your email.

Please note that: -

LKK ref Officer in charge
CC3 / AlG760 13 480/K1vs3 Ias

To check availability ofthe case handler , you may contact the undersigned.

Best Regards,
Agnes Liml Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: Aqnesl..im(dtlkkauto.com ] fax: 6'1 41 -4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

----Original Message-----
From: Tan Lee Gek (Auto Svcs/Ext Biz Svs/Claims & IA) [mailto:LeeCek,lirS1g!.Sag-sS]
Sent: Friday, 23 September, 2016 2:49 PM
To: CS A Team <cs;gQj![quto.g9$>; Admin A <ad$!n:A!&!auto.eU]>
Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <j3rlhircglllaulo.caln>
Subject: Re: Accident on 1517/2016 involving SHB 1156Y & SKT 1204L - AIG (Our Ref: TAX10711612146/19)

Dear Jas,

We quantifr our own losses as follows:-

Cost ofrepairs $35,400.00
Loss of rental $ 4,910.77 ($146.59 x **33.5 days)
LTA search fee S 5.00
Total $40,315.77

We attach the proof of rental, repair bil1, laid-up report, police/GIA reports ofour taxi, police investigation
result and LTA search for your perusal.

Our hirer is claiming his injury and loss of income through his own lawyer.

Please let us hear from you soon.



'** our taxi was towed to the traffic police compound after the accident and was only released to us on 18/7/16
' at 3.01pm. We also attach the towing bill, notice to collect vehicle and letter of authorization as documentaxy
proof.

Regards
Tan Lee Gek (DlD:68662647)
Claims Department
SMRT Automotive Services Fte Ltd
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! Kl< xt*,no,*
.-ra l- r Ple Ltd

51 UBI AVE 1, #01-25 PAYA tlBI INDIISTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (06-q) 62563561 FAX : (065) 67414108

Our Ref: CC3/AIG16013480/Klyg3

28 JULY 2016

LIOW ZEE PING
10 RIVERVALE LINK
#r 5-r 9
SINGAPORE 545044

Dear Sir,Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKT 1204L & SHB 1156Y ON 15/0712016

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte
Ltd to resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto
Insurance policy taken up with them.

Based on the accident report and accident scenario, liability is down against us. We will
therefore proceed to negotiate for an amicable settlement with the Third Party.

Should you however wish to further discuss on the matter prior to our negotiations and
settlement, please contact us within 7 days from the date ofthis letter.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD)(if any) will be affected and reduced by
30% (20% for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim.
However, if your policy has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this
claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Yours faithfully,

Jas Khine
Case Handler
DID:6847 2928
FAX:6741 4108
Email : jaqkhinet@lkksu1q.com

c.c. AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
(Motor Claims Dep)



l, SMRT TAXIS PTE LTI) (the third pady claimant") of -ELK_6II_I4SODLANDS
INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 (S) 757705 (address), owner oi SHB 1156Y (vehicle no.) hereby

authorize SMRT AUTOMOTIYE SERVICES PTE LTD ("&e workshop') to act for me wilh

respect to my claim for repair costs and/or rental andlor loss of use ("claim") for my vehicle no

SHB 1156Y that was danraged pursuanl. to the accident whicir occurred on !!fi/2{6(date) along

PIE TOWARDS TUAS(Iocation) involving vehicle no/s SKT 1204l("the accident').

I funher authorize the workshop to settle my above rlentioned claim in a manner that they deem fit

and the rvorkshop is i'u$her authorizecl to receive payment t'ufiher !o settlemena of my claim with

payment cheque,/s being made in favour of SMRT |AXIS PTE LTD.

I further acknowledge tlrat any seltlement the workshop mav reach on my behalf is on a without

prejudice and wirhout admission of liability basis insofar a.s the driver/owner/insurers of the other

vehicle/s is concemed.

Dated tlris 0? ldayt ol Nl nr | (rnonrht 201 ( (ycar)

Signed by '1he third parly claimant"

(with chop if applicable)

Signed by "1Jre rvorkshop"

(with chop)



RELEASE VOUCHER
(AIG Asia Pacific - Exoress Third Partv Clainr)

"We/I, SMRT AUTOMOTIYE SEITVICES PTE LTD ("the rvorkshop'.1 hereby contlrm rhat rle/l
have reached an agreement u,ith tlre appointed surveyor oIAIG Asia Pacific Insurance pte Ltd LKK
AUTO CONSULT.A,NTS Pl E LTD tnarnc of strn.elorr with r.cspect io rh(. anro{llt claimcd [or
5$35.400.00 (Repair Cost). 5$3.738.05 (Loss ofRental/Use). S$5.00 (Disbu:^sement) for vehicle no.
SHB 1156Ythat was danraged pursuant to llte accident x,hich occured on 1510712016 (date) along
PIE TOWARDS TUAS (location) involving vehicle no/s SKT 120{L. This is pursuanr ro rhc
inspection condrcred on f!!][!!(date) at "the rvorkshop".

Well confifin that we/l arelan authorized by the or.vner SMRT TAXIS PTE LTD ('thc third party
clainrant") ofvehicle no. !gL1!i6)anrake the claim as set out in rhe above paragraph and we/l have
full authority to settle the rnatter on hisihel behalfin a manner that we/l deem fit. Well enclose herein
the letter of authority given by "the third parry- claimant".

We/l l"urther confirm that we/l lvill inde:nnity AtG Asia Pacitic Insurance Ptc Ltd for all damages.

loss and/ot expense that they will or have already incurred in the event thal "1he third ;rany claimant"
alter the above said agreement lodges a further clairn against the former for any loss and expenses

suff'ered pertaining !o costs of repairs and/or rental and,/or loss of use pursuant to the damage to S!
1156Y (vehicle no.) as a result ol'the accident.

Well confirm that the agreemenl rcached above is in full and final settlement ol any clainr of "tl.rc
third pa$.v claimant'" pur suant to the acciderlt and that fLrnher this settlemeut is reached on a rvithout
prejudice and rvithout admission of liability basis.

This agreement is sr:trject to the application ol Singapore lalv and the Singapore Courls have

exclusive.jurisdiction over any dispute arising out of the same.

oarecl this l[] (day) of \Jiv (rronth) 20-( (year)

ii:r
1ii
/a.,...:.1

,,$

Sigued b1'"the N,olkshop" (with chop)

Iif,iJrtqu r,oon* n Pli.s only l0 lile claimanl's claim

cr ldl popeil dari'age anc wiilnol ai'ecl hi! p'$'onal, 
.

inirnui .riio anliot ,rintrted iosses tlaitn ln a f ier dale'

c,l.!-. . 1ie €i'.m.'l lens'eleI !r- ': nrl |: us':d ar

,n 
"r,or, 

aa 
" 

o o'0.",, nre c arln''l'- l e'n'' + a'u' :5

dam !la or ollrr Jni'sur..o :c'_'e' c d:'a nrs'ro 'r ltF

subl-, 'irlrier in this 3.lrrn.



Dsmnr
\/-

Custome! Code: 3000053

S}4RT TAXIS PTE LTD

Block Unit

50 WOODLA}JDS INDUSTRIAI, PARK E4
SINGAPORE 75 7? 05

Lcl
I 0 AUG ?016

$er ,lutonotlvE servlooE PtE !tsd
251 Norfh BrLalge Road ElDgaI)o!€ U9102
T€t: 55 63311000 Fax: 55 533{02{7

Tax Invoice
GSI'Reg No. : MR- 8500 0 01- 7
CRN | !99OO42AOL
fnvoice No. : IV16 0 80 08 64
Date :29.08.2015
vehicLe No. : SHBI156Y
Your Ref No. I lIA]{/o?/16/2L46
our Ref No- : 24043543
Terms : 30 Days

Descriptiorl Qly Uait Adat ,/ (Dlscoult) ArBouDb
Cos! * AIIlouD.t

],IJMP SUM AMOUNT FOR REPAIR
AS PER SURVEYORI S RECOMMENDATION

1.00 35,400-00

Remark :

Make/Mode1 : cHRYST,ER 300C
Accident Date : 15 . 07 .2 016

GRAND TOTAI, $ 35,4OO.OO

) <t,
Aulhorised Signalure
for sl4RT Automoci-ve services Pte LEd

N.E. Pa)m€ats by cheque shoul,d be crossod aad

m.de payable to i SlrRt AutomotLwe g€rvicEa Pta Ltd,
xo rece:lpt wll] be tB8u€d un1ea6 requeateal.

Page 1/I E. & O.E



lA <nrlrtt
-J1Jart,t,\/-
SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd

To: Claims Dept

From: SMRT Taxis Pte Ltd

MEMORANDUM

OurRef: TAX/0711,612146

Date: 23109/2016

ACCIDENT ON 15/07120,16 INVOLVING SHB 1156Y & SKT I2O4L

ALONG PIE TOWARDS TUAS

This is to confirm that the daily rental rale for SHB 1156Y is $146.59 per day.

Please proceed to recover any rental loss from the third party as a result of the
above accident,

Thank you.

PTE LTD

/!

(ot



Vehicle Hub

ft"r,*"-tl

Enquire Transaction History
Transaction History Datails

LoO Oate/Time; 19 Jul2016 / 08;16;18

A3set Type: Vehicle Transaction Amount $5.35

Asset lD: SKT1204L

Transaction Type: l:;; 
lnsurance Enquirv (GlRo channel: ExternalAgency

use'rD: i3l!ffi1;"oto'tn ''*" R:*Hiltlij="*" 20r607rs081618215461

Search Date / Time: o4(r ro," ,r,ou,oo

tnsurance company: flo esn pnctrtc tNSuMNcE PTE. LTD.

lnformation displayed( conect as at the log date and time.

ire Related Back to List

l.n!i(i I rrtr\tE)rt 9itr!rt lE'r;ty

Please read through the P.ivacy Statemenl, Terms o, Use and Oisclaimer.
Please do noi uss the Beck or FoMard butlons on your brows6, as this may altgr ths rolults oflhe transactlons.

Belt vbwed wlth tE 6.0 SP3 and .bo!e. 1024 x 768 ,csotutlon
Copyriohlo2016 LTA I Pd!€cv Slrt€ment llgotel]Jsg I oisclalmGr I Rala lh€ Wlbsil8

https:l/vrl.lta.gov.sg/lta/vrl/action/hubAgencyTmlogDetail?FuNcTlON ID=F180100... 711912016



Date : l9t Dec 2016

TO WEOMITMAY CONCERN

RE: SEB It56Y

thie is to ocrti& that SIVR? Aufaoti-v-c.scrvice pte I*d had old€rcd rEar IJII knucklq
lensioncrlirJr camba tin& for srIB,* i thr;6;ffi;"T:y 2016 ffom ovemeadue to our stock was runninc out. The ord. p.*"&-drr; ii*}.o, ou*"o,supplia for about 2 wcaks E had imm.af"r.'rr,-rp," #fr "irfri# August 2016.

For your infoimation

/\---z \C€-^
Yours fafthfully,

and necessary action.

CMYSISR JEtrA.rIffi O]ITE OF SIIGAPOfiE PIE II,



CHRYSLER JEEP AUTOMOTIVE OF SINGAPORE PTE LTD

SO LENG KEE ROAD SINGAPORE 159100
Tel No.: +65 647s 3131

GST Fleg No.: MB-8500364-4
Business Heg. No. ; 198902095M

Tax Invoice
Date/Time : 12108116 I 5:57:23 PM
User lD : C02

lnvolce Name & Address

SMRT AUTOMOTIVES SERVICES PTE LTD
60 WOODLANDS IND PARK E4
SINGAPORE 757705

SHB 1I56Y

lnvoice
Customer No.

Customer Name
FIeg No./Reg Date
Date / Mileage ln
Dale ,/ Mileage Out
Chassis No.
Model
Servic6 Advisor

PAo05068
w00044
SMRT AUTOMOTIVES

12tO8116 lo
lo

Part No- Descriplion Oty Unil Price Disc. % Nett. Price

Ro47B2sA7AD

K68045329AB

K68306531M

K05065221AD

K04805846A8

K68241067A8

REAR LH KNUCKLE.3OOC

REAHTENSIONEB UNK. 3OOC

BEAH LH CAMBER LINK.3OOC

REAR LH WHEELHOUSING, 3OOC

LICENCE PLATE LAMP.3OOC

TPMS-JK 3.6 2015

.t

1

1

4
1

Tolal before Tax SGD

7% GSTAmount SGD
Total Amount lnd. eSTi SGD

40

40

40

40
40
4A

Payment Due to
CI-IliYsLER JEEP AUTOMOTIVE OF

SIT{GAPORE PTE LTD

This is a computer generated dooument, no slgnature is required. Thank you.

THANK YOU.








