Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Hi Hisao Tong,

HO AIK SENG, DENNIS <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>

Monday, 4 April 2022 6:22 PM

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto); EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT
Re: MID21238 & SDE2200C// DOA: 07/07/2016 // 10OD: CY
22/M1D21238/070716/0012

On behalf of Maj Edwin. He is appraised on this case and he has signed the 10D for MID 21238.

In view of such cases related to excess claim, he also mentioned will be as per last meeting minutes

update.

Thank you and please process on the case for MID 21238.

Regards,

2WO DENNIS HO
TA INVESTIGATION WO
HQTPT/ SAFETY BR (ARMY)
63074511

91763064

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Sent: Monday, 4 April 2022 3:19 PM

To: EDWIN KANG WEE HUAT

Cc: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS; RISHABH RADHAKRISHNAN; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)
Subject: RE: MID21238 & SDE2200C// DOA: 07/07/2016 // 10D: CY 22/MID21238/070716/0012

Dear Maj Edwin,

We refer to the above matter.

Based on our record, we did not settle repair cost with third party claimant.

We would like to seek your approval to reopen the case and proceed with TCA settlement with AIG as below

computation: -

Amount

Cost of Repair to SDE2200C (TP)

$3,102.02

1



TCA reimbursement to AIG @ 50% | $1,551.01

Kindly let us have your instruction.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 11 February 2022 10:58 AM

To: HO AIK SENG, DENNIS <HO_Aik_Seng_Dennis@defence.gov.sg>

Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@Ilkkauto.com>

Subject: MID21238 & SDE2200C// DOA: 07/07/2016 // I10D: FY16/17/0030

Dear Dennis,

As per our tele-conversation few days ago, we would like to seek approval to reopen this case for further handling.
On 10 April 2017, we have concluded settlement (uninsured losses claim) with M/s Cycle & Carriage Industries Pte
Ltd acting for the civilian. However we did not receive subrogation claim(repair cost) from the civilian insurer. As

such, Army approved to temporary close file on 17 July 2017.

Now, we have received subrogation claim(repair cost) from civilian insurer, M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd.
Attached here with the following documents for your easy reference.

We have reviewed the matter and we are of the view that TCA is applicable as third party policy coverage is under
Comprehensive with $800 Excess.

We would like to seek your approval to reopen the case and proceed with TCA settlement with AIG as below
computation: -

Amount
Cost of Repair to SDE2200C (TP) $ 3,102.02
TCA reimbursement to AIG @ 50% $1,551.01

Kindly let us have your instruction.



Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com |

HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
S(408933)
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