Zayyer (LKKAuto)

From: Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 26 September, 2017 3:32 PM

To: 'HQ TPT Safety Branch'; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: Merlin Koh

Subject: RE: Requesting to close IOD FY 16/17/0061 and no COR for MID 34651 & MID
34034

Hi Sir,

We duly noted the below email and will follow up the necessary action accordingly. thanks.

Best Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, email: zayyer@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: HQ TPT Safety Branch [mailto:tptsafety@gmail.com]

Sent: Monday, 25 September, 2017 2:24 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com>; Merlin Koh <merlinkoh@gmail.com>
Subject: Re: Requesting to close 10D FY 16/17/0061 and no COR for MID 34651 & MID 34034
Good day Tong and Zayer,

Please reply to this email as soon as possible.

Thanks.

Regards

On Tue, Sep 12, 2017 at 10:48 AM, HQ TPT Safety Branch <tptsafety @ gmail.com> wrote:
Good Day Tong,

We would like to close the case FY 16/17/0061:

1. MID 34708 was involved in an accident with civilian lorry (YL 7909) grazed a F550 Ambulance on
21st Jan 2017. There is no visible damage to the combat ambulance and the civilian vehicle drove
off after the incident happened thus no particulars are obtained. If there is no 3rd party claim for
this case in the month of September, please proceed to close the case.

The following 2 vehicles was involved in a past incident however it was not booked in to the workshop as
there were no visible damage, as a result, there is no cost of repair. We would like you to help to proceed
with the following cases.



1. MID 34034 was involved in an incident where the OUV reversed and scratched the front left door of

a civilian van (PC 2721J). The vehicle was not booked in as there were no visible damage on the
OUV.

FY 17/18/0007

2. MID 34651 was involved in an incident where the F550 ambulance reversed into a civilian van, GV
7813B on 4th May 2016. The F550 did not sustain any damage in the incident and thus was not

booked into the workshop. As a result, there is no final cost of repair.
FY 16/17/0009

Please reply as soon as possible.

Best Regards,
1WO Rajah
HQ TPT Safety

Tel: 63074040

Best Regards,
REC Zhou Zhefang
HQ TPT Safety

Tel: 63074040



