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Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 18 March 2019 10:17 PM
To: 'jasminetan@transcab.com.sg'; Ng Wai Yin
Cc: Admin A
Subject: Re: TCS REF: AAD1606-290--Accident involving SHD9086C & SHB7523G on 

23.06.16  *LKK REF: CC3/AXA16011935/Kpa3 

Your Ref: SHB 7523G                               Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Wai Yin, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
 
We have our principal instruction to withdraw our offer.  
 
Based on both parties report and video footage, our insured is not liable for the accident as he has the right 
of way. Your client failed to stop at the stop line and give way. 
 
As such, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and reject your client claim.  
 
“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an 
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice 
engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related 
claims.” 
  
 
 
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) 
Sent: Saturday, 16 March 2019 9:16 AM 
To: Ng Wai Yin; 'jasminetan@transcab.com.sg' 
Cc: Admin A 
Subject: RE: TCS REF: AAD1606-290--Accident involving SHD9086C & SHB7523G on 23.06.16 *LKK REF: 
CC3/AXA16011935/Kpa3  
  
Without Prejudice 
  
Dear Wai Yin, 
  
We refer to the above matter. 
  
We have our principal instruction to offer at a global sum of $1,700.00(all-in). 
  
Please confirm acceptance. 
  
**Kindly forward your LOD with all the relevant documents(ie: final repair bill, authorisation to act, rental 
receipt) to us (LKK) for our necessary action. 
  
“Please note that our proposal and correspondence with you is strictly on a without prejudice basis and should not be construed as an 
admission of liability on our part and/or that of our policyholder and/or the authorised driver. The terms of our without prejudice 
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engagement should not be disclosed in any other related matter(s) in respect of this accident nor should it be binding in any other related 
claims.” 
  
  
Best Regards, 
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
  
From: Ng Wai Yin <waiyin.ng@transcab.com.sg>  
Sent: Friday, 30 November 2018 11:38 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; CS A Team <cs-a@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: TCS REF: AAD1606-290--Accident involving SHD9086C & SHB7523G on 23.06.16 
  
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
  
Dear Hsiao Tong 
  
Please refer to the above mention case, we still pending for DV. 
  
Hope to receive your DV soon. 
  
Thank You 
Best Regards, 
Ng Wai Yin 
Finance Department 
TEL: 6603 1265  Ext.308 
  
*** Please be reminded that all claims correspondence to be send to claims@transcab.com.sg 
  

 
  
This message is confidential. It may also be privileged or otherwise protected by work product immunity or other legal rules. If 
you have received it by mistake, please let us know by e-mail reply and delete it from your system; you may not copy this message 
or disclose its contents to anyone. Please send us by fax any message containing deadlines as incoming e-mails are not screened 
for response deadlines. The integrity and security of this message cannot be guaranteed on the Internet. 
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