Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

From: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com>

Sent: Monday, 24 August 2020 1:16 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Cc: ‘Alan Khong'; Admin A

Subject: RE: Accident involving EY928H & SKH2017S on 18.06.2016 //LKK Ref:

CC4/AXA16011529/Kpb3q2

Hi Hsiaotong,
Due to lack of manpower issue, we might overlook this T.P. claim.

Please let me know how we can still retrieve this claim request. Thank you.

Regards,

Shi Jie
Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, August 24, 2020 11:24 AM

To: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com>

Cc: 'Alan Khong' <service@alanutd.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involving EY928H & SKH2017S on 18.06.2016 //LKK Ref: CC4/AXA16011529/Kpb3q2

Without Prejudice
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Kindly refer to the attached email which is self-explanatory. Thanks.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues
of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission of claim related
documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew (Ms) | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | Email: chewht@lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741 4108
HQ : Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 |
5(408933)




From: Shi Jie <shijie@alanutd.com>

Sent: Friday, 21 August 2020 5:50 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'Alan Khong' <service@alanutd.com>

Subject: Accident involving EY928H & SKH2017S on 18.06.2016

Hi Hsiaotong,

We have an outstanding case (accident involving EY928H & SKH2017S on 18.06.2016) that we’ve yet to receive any
update.

Attached please find the LOD for your reference.

Hope to hear from you soon. Thank you.

Regards,

Shi Jie
Alan’s United Auto Pte. Ltd.



