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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February, 2019 8:14 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> 15/16/16/VP05/018791 RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN1677Z & 

SGP984T ON 19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3s2 

Attachments: LKK INSPECTION REPORT.pdf; LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.pdf; LKK INSPECTION 

PHOTOS.pdf; LKK REINSPECTION PHOTOS 1.pdf; LKK REINSPECTION PHOTOS 

2.pdf; LKK REINSPECTION PHOTOS 3.pdf; LKK AFTER REPAIR PHOTOS.pdf; TP 

LOD.pdf

Your Ref: 15/16/16/VP05/018791 

Our Ref: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3 

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGP 984T (OI) AND SJN 1677Z (TP) ON 19/05/2016  

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We refer to the assignment dated 25th May 2016 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal, 

Lonpac Insurance Bhd. 

 

It was reported that our Insured vehicle was crossing the uncontrolled junction from a minor road (stop line) when 

the collision happened. 

 

We propose to offer to TP repairer “ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD” as below: 

 

TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER 

Cost of Repair w/gst $      51,800.84 $            13,234.59 

Loss of Rental ($120 x 55 days) $        6,600.00 $              5,000.00 ($100 x 50 days) 

Towing Fee $              50.00 $                    50.00 

GIA Search Fee $                2.00 $                      2.00 

TOTAL $     58,452.84 $           18,286.59 

 

TP VEHICLE 

MARKET VALUE                : $32,000.00 (est) 

LTA REBATE                        : $11,664.00 (est) 

NETT VALUE                       : $20,336.00 (est) 

 

Breakdown of days is as follows: 

 

Our surveyor’s recommended days to repair          10 days 

Weekends / Downtime / Parts Order and Arrival (LOD)          40 days 

TOTAL           50 days 

 

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please. 

 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Vic (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 5:55 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); GERALD POH WEE BIN 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN1677Z & SGP984T ON 19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Gwb3s2  

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that TP is still pursuing the claim and we are currently preparing report for mandate approval. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
 

 

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 5:46 PM 

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; Vic (LKKAuto) 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A 

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN1677Z & SGP984T ON 19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Gwb3s2  

 

Dear Gerald, 

 

Thank you for your email. 
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Please note that this case has been re-assigned to Mr Vic. 

                 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

 

 
 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>  

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 11:22 AM 

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@lonpac.com> 

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN1677Z & SGP984T ON 19.5.2016  

 

 

 
Our Ref        : 15/16/16/VP05/018791 

Your Ref      : CC4/LPC16009611/Gwb3 
 

 
Dear Vivian, 
 

Kindly advise if the third party is pursuing his claim.  
 

 
 
Best Regards 

Gerald Poh 
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd 

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555 
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706 

 
 


