Shu Pei (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Monday, 30 May, 2016 4:05 PM

To: Shu Pei (LKK Auto)

Cc: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT

Subject: RE: Accident involved SUN1667Z & SGP984T DOA:19/05/2016 ***LKK
REF:CC4/LPC16009611/Gwb3

Attachments: 30052016155914.pdf

Our Ref : 15/16/16/VP05/018791

Dear Shi Pei,

We attached a copy of our insured’s GIA report for your attention.

Kindly inform the case handler to let us have her view liability.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

100 Beach Road, #19-00 Shaw Tower, Singapore 189702
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Shu Pei (LKK Auto) [mailto:shupei@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, 30 May, 2016 3:36 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; LIONEL CHUA KOK KEONG; Admin A; Vivian Lau; Hsiao Tong; Zayyer

Subject: RE: Accident involved SIN1667Z & SGP984T DOA:19/05/2016 ***LKK REF:CC4/LPC16009611/Gwb3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SJN 1677Z at M/s Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Enclosed for your perusal is:
- TP’s GIA report

Please be informed that our preliminary advice is not ready yet.
Our case handler in-charge is Vivian and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 8625.
Thank you.

Best Regards,
Shu Pei| Admin



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@I|kkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-d@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Wednesday, 25 May, 2016 9:37 AM

To: 'GERALD POH WEE BIN' <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>; assignments@lkkauto.com
Cc: 'ERIC WOO JUN KIAT' <ericwoo@lonpac.com>

Subject: RE: Accident involved SIN1667Z & SGP984T DOA:19/05/2016

Dear Mr Gerald,

Thank you for the assignment.

Best Regards,
Catherine Chong | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6741-8434 | email: assignments@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 24 May, 2016 5:59 PM

To: Catherine Chong (LKK Auto) <admin-d@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT <ericwoo@lonpac.com>

Subject: FW: Accident involved SIN1667Z & SGP984T DOA:19/05/2016

Our Ref : 15/16/16/VP05/018791

Dear Catherine,

Kindly proceed to arrange accordingly.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

100 Beach Road, #19-00 Shaw Tower, Singapore 189702
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Accord Auto(Claims) [mailto:claims@mycarworkshop.com.sq]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 May, 2016 5:55 PM
To: GERALD POH WEE BIN




Cc: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT
Subject: Re: Accident involved SIN1667Z & SGP984T DOA:19/05/2016

Hi,
Please arrange Marcus Chua for PRI.

Thank you.

Kind regards,
Jessy Soe

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A
#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile: (65) 9740 0999
Tel :(65) 6481 9517
Fax :(65) 6481 9516

On Tue, May 24, 2016 at 5:45 PM, GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh @lonpac.com> wrote:

Our Ref : 15/16/16/VP05/018791

Dear Jessy,

We attached a list of our motor surveyors for your attention.

Best Regards
Gerald Poh
Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

100 Beach Road, #19-00 Shaw Tower, Singapore 189702
3



Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.240 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

From: Accord Auto(Claims) [mailto:claims@mycarworkshop.com.sq]
Sent: Tuesday, 24 May, 2016 9:44 AM

To: ERIC WOO JUN KIAT; GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: Gilbert Ng

Subject: Accident involved SIN1667Z & SGP984T DOA:19/05/2016

Kindly assist arrange Pri-repair inspection for SIN1667Z @ AMK Autopoint #03-11, this vehicle in workshop.

Please provide us 10 surveyor name list.

Kind regards,
Jessy Soe

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd
10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A

#03-11 Ang Mo Kio Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Mobile: (65) 9740 0999
Tel :(65) 6481 9517
Fax :(65) 6481 9516



