Jia Le (LKK Auto)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@Ilonpac.com=>

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 9:56 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cec: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> 15/16/16/VP05/018791 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN1677Z &

SGP984T ON 19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3s2 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Jia Le,

We are agreeable to the quantum but suggest that
for rental of vehicle, you proceed to offer 35 days first.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd
300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
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R et The all ¢ new | Jonpac.com.sg
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Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Jia Le (LKK Auto) [mailto:JiaLe@Ilkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 18 June, 2019 10:41 AM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> 15/16/16/VP05/018791 RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN1677Z & SGP984T ON
19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3s2

Lonpac Ref: 15/14/16/VPO5/0187%1
LKK Ref: CC4/LPC14009611/Ghb3s52

Dear Gerald,
We refer to the above matter.

wWe attached the calculation for LOR and revised the offer as follows -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair [w/GET) B 51,800.84 $13.234.59
2. Loss of Rental (55days x $120.00) B 6,600.00 $ 4,100.00 (41days x $100.00)
3. Towing Fee $ 50.00 $  50.00
4. LTA/ GIA Search Fee 3 2.00 $ 2.00
Total [ 58.452.84 $17,386.59

Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.

*NOTE : Third party repairer not able to provide purchase order,
1



The above is for your approval.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lud

Phone: 6749 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkautg.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 20 February, 2019 8:14 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> 15/16/16/VP05/018791 RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN1677Z & SGFP984T ON 19.5.2016

*LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3s2

Your Ref: 15/16/16/VP05/018791
Our Ref: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3

Dear Gerald,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SGP 984T (0O1) AND SIN 16772 (TP) ON 19/05/2016
We refer to the above matter.

We refer to the assignment dated 25™ May 2016 of Third-Party’s request to do Direct Settlement with our Principal,
Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

It was reported that our Insured vehicle was crossing the uncontrolled junction from a minor road (stop line) when
the collision happened.

We propose to offer to TP repairer “ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD" as below:
TP CLAIMED REVISED - TO OFFER
Cost of Repair w/gst $51,800.84 $13,234.59
Loss of Rental ($120 x 55 days) 5 6,600.00 $ 5,000.00 (5100 x 50 days)
Towing Fee S 50.00 % 50.00
GIA Search Fee 52.00 S 2.00
i [$18;28659 5 S e =

TP VEHICLE

MARKET VALUE : $32,000.00 (est)

LTA REBATE : $11,664.00 (est)
NETT VALUE : $20,336.00 (est)

Breakdown of days is as follows:

Our surveyor's recommended days to repair 10 days
Weekends / Downtime / Parts Order and Arrival (LOD) 40 days
TOTAL | 50 days

The above is for your approval and/or further instructions please.
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Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vie Alpeh | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2006 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

¥ - o

- - .

Asi Rl n  mm Gaye the Farthe Print only when necessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you belisve that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2015 5:55 PM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_5G; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJN1677Z & SGP984T ON 19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Gwb3s2

Dear Gerald,
We refer to your below email.
Please be informed that TP is still pursuing the claim and we are currently preparing report for mandate approval.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-20906 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

¥ :“rﬁmﬁgﬂ&fﬁ. Frint omly when recessary:

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a viclation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you.

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January, 2019 5:46 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN; Vic (LKKAuto)

Ce: MT_Claim_5G; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); Admin A
Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN1677Z & SGP984T ON 19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Gwhb3s2



. Dear Gerald,

Thank you for your email.
Please note that this case has been re-assigned to Mr Vic.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 22 January 2019 11:22 AM

To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@Ilkkauto.com>

Cc: MT_Claim_SG <mt_claim@Ilonpac.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5JN1677Z & SGP984T ON 19.5.2016

Our Ref : 15/16/16/VP05/018791
Your Ref : CC4/LPC16009611/Gwb3

Dear Vivian,

Kindly advise if the third party is pursuing his claim.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706

The all « vew | lonpac.com.sg
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From: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Sent: Friday, 5 July 2019 3:23 PM

To: '"GERALD POH WEE BIN'

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> 15/16/16/VP05/018791 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN1677Z &

SGP984T ON 19.5.2016 *LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3s2 [External Confidential]

Dear Gerald,

Please be informed that we have settled with third party as follows:-

Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/G5T) $13.234.59
2. Loss of Rental (55days x $120.00) | $ 3.500.00 (35days x $100.00)
3. Towing Fee $ 5000
4, LTAS GlA Search Fee b ] 2.00
Total | $ 16,786.59
Global sum | 516,700.00

We will proceed to close file and submit all the relevant documents to your good office soon.

Best Regards,

Carlor Chan | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6740 5792 | email: Jiale@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN [mailto:geraldpoh@lonpac.com]

Sent: Thursday, 20 June 2019 9:56 AM

To: Jia Le (LKK Auto)

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: RE: <SEEK MANDATE> 15/16/16/VP05/018791 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SIN1677Z & SGP984T ON 19.5.2016
*LKK REF: CC4/LPC16009611/Ghb3s2 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Jia Le,

We are agreeable to the quantum but suggest that
for rental of vehicle, you proceed to offer 35 days first.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, S5ingapore 199555
Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706



ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-80 SINGAPORE 159723
TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAX: 6274 5715
GST Regn No: 201113141K

17 Movember 2018

Lonpac Insurance BHD

300 Beach Road
#17-04/07 The Concourse
Singapore 199555

Attn: Motor Claims Department
Dear Sirs, / ;

- g
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLE: SIN1677Z and SGP984T on 19.5.201% Along At One Norih Link.

We are the authorized repair workshop for the owner of motor vehicle no:SIN1677Z, which was involved in the
captioned accident with your insured vehicle: SGP984T .The vehicle owner has requested and authorized us to
assist him in presenting his‘her claim against the party responsible for the damage to the vehicle.

As the accident was caused by the negligent act of your insured driving, we are submitting these claims for
your consideration on behalf of the owner/claimant.

01) Cost Of Repair 5 12,368.78
02) 7% GST b B65.81
03) Car Rental 55 days (@ $120 b3 6,600.00

(* 13 days of May , | month on June 30 days & 13 days till July. Due To Unavailble Parts )
05) GIA/LTA Enquiry Fee 5 2.00
06) Towing Bill 3 50.00

5 19,886.59

We enclosed herewith the following documents to support the claims:-

a) GIA report e) Insured MRIC & Driving License
b} Repair Statement AMK406 f) GIA/LTA Enquiry Fee

c) Car Rental Agreement g) Letter OF Authority

d)  Towing Bill h} Supplier Invoice

Kindly look into the matter and let us hear from you on the settlement of our customer's claims
as s00n as possible,

Please note that it is a condition of any settlement reached that it shall be without prejudice to any
personal injury claim (if any) of the owner/claimant.

Thank you
Yours faithfull

Tel: 6271 74337 9274 0999
Email: avclaims@mycarworkshop.com.sg



LETTER OF AUTHORITY

To Whom It May Concern,

% . - = | Ofeg - e o w ; P 1
Accident Involving Vehicle: 1t 16312 anedl  SO0484T  on 105, 0L flows BE Do Motk Guk.
-1

'We, Tay Joo Vel , NRIC No: g gl q04a8
Of -
Owner of motor vehicle no CIM Wby £ do hereby appoint Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

—

as my/ours authorised representative and

as my/ours solicitors to write, to negotiate and settle my/our claim against the other party/parties involved

in the above mentioned accident. 'We, _ Tay_Tov ¥isd

shall have absolute discerption to settle the matter at the best term.

I/'We also confirm and instruct that any agreed settlement sum in respect my/our claims be paid

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd and such payment will be constitute a full and final discharge of my claims.

Signature of owner




LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO : 15/16/16/VP05/018791 Without Prejudice

DATE : 25 JUNE 2019 on Injury Claims
DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I/'We, TAY JOO KIAT confirmed acceptance from M/s LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD and/or owner of SGP 984T the sum of Singapore Dollar Sixteen Thousand
Seven Hundred Only ($16,700.00) in full and final satisfaction, liquidation and
discharge of all property losses competent to me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC
INSURANCE BHD in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether
now or hereafter to become mapif‘::st, arising either directly or indirectly from an
accident involving SIN 1677Z and SGP 984T on 19 May 2016, along AT ONE
NORTH LINK.

| /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (LONPAC INSURANCE
BHD AND/OR CHAI CHUAN HAO) against all claims and any claims whatsoever
made by any person/persons on our behalf in respect of the said accident.

I/'We further authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to ACCORD
AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD.

[/We hereby acknowledged that this payment is made on a without admission of

liability basis and without prejudice to all related claims and in respect of our
insured’s recovery action.

/%w 28 JUN 2008

Signature of vehicle owner/Date

Toy Joo Vot . EBJUHM

Name of vehicle owner /Date
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ACCORD AUTO SERVICES PTELTD

BLOCK 1009 BUKIT MERAH LANE 3
#01-80 SINGAPORE 159723 :
TEL: 6271 5133/6271 7433 FAX: 6274 5715 \ *J'
GST Regn No: 201113141K

Date : 17 Nov 2018
Lonpac Insurance BHD Our Ref No » AME467
300 Beach Road Insured : Tay Joo Kiat
#17-04/07 The Concourse Insured NRIC : SB119099B
Singapore 199555 Make & Model : Fiat Bravo 1.4 A

DOA : 19.5.2016

Claim Type : Third Party

REPAIR STATEMENT
/
Re: Vehicle Registration No: SIN1GTTE
Cost Of Repair 4 12,368.78
7% GST $ B65.81
p 13,234.59

Accord Auto Services Pte Lid

ACCORD

AUTO SERVI RTE LTD

)




Accord Rent-A-Car Pte. Ltd.

10 Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 24
#03-11 AME Auto Point
Singapore 568047

Tel- G481 9518 Fax: 6481 8516

M P Invoice no. 2016-05-0010
Customer Vehicle No. SIN1ET7Z
Replacement Vehicle No. SGP20B5A
Make & Model: Mazda 3
Rental Information

Start End Actual Duratipn/ Charged

Date / Time 20/5/2016| 1700 HRS l#f:! JI" 201k | 1340 HRS 55 Days
Rental Costs
Daily E5  Days @ 55 120.00 Per day b6, boo.eo
Weekhy Weekly @ 5% Per week
Monthly Mornth @ 5% Per month
Cow Per day
Others
Payment Details Cash / Nets J Master / Visa / Cheque
Amount due: s -
Important Information and Declaration

Befare signing this agreement you should carefully read and understand the terms and conditions provided with this documents
and confirm below whether you consent to receiving information as set out.

Declaration

| agree to the condition of the vehicle as indicated. 4%%%%%%
+ental-set-aut-above-isan-estimate-on L :

not limited to, my liability as owner of the vehlde fur charges for traﬂk ar parklng mo!atmns, during the currency nf this
agreement,

Signature X

Customer name : TAY JOO EIAT Date :

Thark you for choasing ACCORD RENT-A-CAR



VEHICLE HIRING AGREEMENT

Vehicle No: SGP2085A “Wehicle Out Date: 20.05.2016 Time: 1700pm  (HRS)
Make & Model: Mazda 3 (IU: 1120732573) *Vehicle In Date: A
THIRD PARTY INSURANCE NON WAIVER EXCESS: Rate Per Day: $120.00 Mo. of Days:

553,500.00

Total Charges:

HIRER'S PARTICULARS

ADDITIONAL DRIVER'S PARTICULARS

*Name (as in NRIC): TAY JOO KIAT

Mame (as in NRIC):

*NRIC / Passport No: S8119099B NRIC [ Passport No:
*Date of Birth: 16/06/1984 Date of Birth:
*Address: BLEK 414 CHOA CHU KANG AVE 4 #02-336 Addrass:

SINGAPORE 680414

Employment Details:

Employment Details:

*Driving License Passed Date: 19/12/2002

Driving License Passed Date:

*Tel: HP: 9681 9832 H o

Tel: HP H o

CONTROL LEVEL (QUT) i
wow 1 w1 @ o ws

*MILEAGE OUT: AGu>»

| &8 | 4 | e I FULL

EMERGENCY BEREAKDOWN AND TOWING SERVICE (24 HOURS) HELPLINE: 6481 9518 HP 9229 9191

IMPORTANT
1.

Only persons above 25 & below 65 years of age and signing this agreement may drive the vehicle.

2, Wehicle [ striclly for use in  Singapore only  and  may

Precursor Investments

3. Al wehicles are fitted with anti theft device which will

fiabda for all costs and charges incurred im0 event

will be no refund of unused rental and the hirer shall bear the costs of the folliowsng charges ) S3$300.00 for towing  from

Singapore Customs i) 55150.00 for resetting of immobiliser.

4. Use of wvehicle for illegal purposes (&g In  connection with thefi, drug pedaling or trafficking, smuggling) is stricty probibited,
office  immedialely. H there are bodily injures, & police repon  must

be made within 24 hours,

6. Punclured tyres, emply petral tank, fat battery due to

response to the RF  at

In pase of accident, the hirer shall report to  the rental

the Singapore Customs. Hier  will

nof driven  ouwt of Singapore without the prior  written  comaent

immokdliser s being activated at the Singapore Customs

that cannot be reusad will be changed accordiingly from S380,00 to S$200 00 per tyre,

7. Al vehicles are supplied with petrol and should be
patrol.

& No refund or eary retun of wehicle (The Hirer shall be l@mble for ewcess charges for any late return &t rate shown per hour per

day). Latest by Spm.

8 Windscreen and windows damages ara not coverad under insurance (Range from S5300.00 ta S51000.00).
10. Mo Smoking, Durians and Transportation of Pets are allowsd. Hirer is responsible for a penatty of S$500.00

| have read and agree to the terms and conditions on both  sides of this egreement ANl information | have provided

Invastments in connection with this agreament is true,

L fudegqe

/j}_

T"_"; TJeo Yot

Harme NRIC / Passpon Mo

Signature

negligence, loss of wehicle's key or locked key (nside the vehicle, by
itself does not consitute to a breakdown and that in the eveni, the Owner's 24 hours Emergency Service i5 called upon 1o

respond o such occumence, the Hirer shall bear the costs of such response at S§50.00 per tip. Punctwed and damaged tyres

retumed with petral  level likewise. There wil be no refund for excess

be  fully

Precursor



532'5;"3?13 Invaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

10 Anson Road, #06-16 International Plaza, Singapore 079903
lNSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
e ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Maonday to Friday 9am to 5pm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Ref No: GR-16-054356
Date of Request: 20/05/2016 Your RefNo; Online Purchase

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A #03-11
AMK Auto Point

Singapore 568047

Dear SirMMadam,

Enquiry Date 20/05/2016

Enquiry By ACCORD AUTO

TP Vehicle No. SGP984T

Accident Date 18/05/2016

Enquiry Result

TP Vehicle No. Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No.
SGP984T Lonpac Insurance Bhd 30/08/2015-29/06/20186 +65 62507388
Thank You.

The images provided to you are taken from the original reports forwarded to the centre by the members of the General Insurancs Association
of Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no Eability whatsoever for any loss or damage
arising out of or in connection with the reports or their images.

This is a computer genarated decumeant and requires no signatura.

Hhitps:ifsingapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm Musebox=MTR sas&fuseaction=dsp_genimip&refid= 11620008CFID=14166TMACF TOKEN=292122f68a .. 112



512002016 I Imvoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
"GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
10 Anson Road, #06-16 Intermational Plaza, Singapore 079903
INSURA"CE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030
S ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday to Friday 8am to Spm
RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration No: M400017735

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref Mo: GR-16-054356
Date of Request: 20/05/2016 Your Ref No: Online Purchase

Accord Auto Services Pte Ltd

10 Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A #03-11
AMEK Auto Point

Singapore 568047

Dear SirMdadam,

Enquiry Date 20/05/2016

Enquiry By ACCORD AUTO

TP Vehicle No. SGP984T

Accident Date 18/05/2016

DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (S8§)

TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 0.13
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2.00

Thank You.

This is a computer generated document and requires no signature.

For GIARMC Official use:
Datea:
] GIRO[]Cash [] Cheque

https:/isingapore.merimen.com/claims/index.cfm Musebox=MTRsas&lseaction=dsp_geninvip&refid= 11620008 CF ID= 1416670440 FTOKEN=20a122f68a.. 22



Express Towing Services

You Call, We Tow - Fast . Secured . Reliable

Blk 27 Marine Crescent Ville #10-01 Singapore 440027 Co. Reg. No. 531526031 HP:90090092 Email: Jimkoh@hotmail.com Website: httpy//www.gaosxpresstowing.sg

CASH SALE{WORK ORDERY M- 100264
Date:mgs ! &

L &

i %_C;C—Em D Jump Start/Changing of battery
- Replacemen

‘iﬁ%ﬁle Nn:éﬂ‘\\ UQ';CLQ f'f'l-ndel No: r'ﬂ‘P\T \%"HND p t

oy T ant/Bheakdown
i il 5

Ti Ehﬂ: Contact No: __ [ ] Murt7Basement

B |:] With Load/Cargo Box

Location: m g%‘kﬁ@!@:—:‘p \C}%L,{\T-. ] s iy
. DCCoRIY B~ wark [[] Transport Charge

[[] Low Body kit

g 4
Cash $: ‘B Others: I:I Door Opening Service

Y g E 2\ — [] Crane Up/Winch out

' Tow Truck =y %%

Authorised By: : ;\W Driver Name: : % Collect Doc/Key
Repo

[] woodlands and Tuas Checkpoint

T2 A A B BRI R b, L AT b Ao AT A AT e KB e R 2 AR

Note: Vehicle is towed at owner’s risk. The company accepts no responsilbility for damages or
other misdemeanour to your vehicle whilst being towed.



KIAN HUA MOTOR CO. PTELTD

7 jalan Lembah Kallang Singapore 339563
Tel: 52933850 Fax: 63551800

Email: Sales@Kianhuamotor.Com

KIAN HU A Gst Reg No:200106569G

—#

Tax Invoice No: SRI2570763
Customer’s Copy Date; 01/07/2016

Area Code: 1 DELIVER
customer: ACCORD AUTO SERVICE P/ LIAMEK) Credit Terms: 308

Address: 10 AMK INDUSTRIAL PARK 24, Kian Hua Sales: YAPH)

#03-11 AMK AUTOROINT
SINGAPORE S68047.

SNSRI O : Q105 30 5 - 04 JUL 2016

: price | Amount
Mﬁ: T
P/O No:SOR 791 SIN16TTL
1 PANEL/LOW F/BARVO 1,4 FRT
2 ASC CONDENSOR F/BRAVO
1.#*'5052515-}5“1195\!5151552@

P/O Nusw:u SIN1677Z
3 ENG MTG Ffbravol.4A/M TURBO LH

PEUGEODT

ITEM SEN AME 403-04
BILL SEN K #03-11
ciTrRoiEn  Products received and checked to htj@ﬂd

‘6 condition

t:usmn;nr"s Signature / Company Stamp
Products sold are not returnable,

Page:1of 1

- ’ e e —— e —— i —
FOR KIAN HUA OFFICIAL USE:

PAID / AMOUNT:

TIME:

wamin A1 INTANE 1-AT74NE DA

Authorised Signature



| 17-0B-16:00:48 KIAN HUA KOTOR FTZ LTD ;+BE 3355 1800 #

Kian Hua Motor Co. Pie Ltd
ﬁ;ﬁ 7 Jalan Lembah Kallsng, 5339567
Telk: (+£5) 6293 3850
Fasxc [+65) 6355 1800
AN Emall; salesgklanhuamotoncom
SALES ORDER
M/S: ACCORD AUTO SERVICE F/ L.(AMEK) NO: SORI1004791
PAGE: 1
10 AMEK INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A, DATE: 16 Jun 2016
#03-11 AME AUTOPOINT AC CODE: KACCOR
SINGAPORE 568047, TERM: 30Days
TEL:  6481-9518 FAX: 6481-0516 B/ONO: SIN1677Z
ATTN: WAI PENG A/C
Delivery Time: 06/07/2016
Due Dat Description Quantity l:fq_it_ Prlce Amount
SGD SGD
I PANEL/LOW FFBARVO 1.4 FRT
2 AMC CONDENSOR F/BRAVO
114 L1

SGD FIVE HUNDRED SEVENTY SEVEN AND CENTS EIGHTY ONLY

Accord Auto Service P/ L{Amk) For Kinn Hua Motor Co, Pte Ltd
CONFIRMED & ACCEPTED BY AUTHORISED SIGNATUR
Cnee the order i3 confirmed, it connol b cangelled. Goods sold are not recumanle, Y APH)

ACCORD AUTC SERVICE N Al
I Ang Mo Kig ml:l':nEEﬁSF E;rrf:l i{ﬂ. AN "\J\ Uﬂ\
FO03171 AkK Auttipeing |

Sanoore SERY



]

U

TEL:

0-06-16;13:04 ;KIAN HUA MOTOR PTE LTC ;185 B35S 1800 i1

went KTAN HUA MOTOR CO. PTELTD

7 Julan Lemi

7 Julan Lemboh Kallang Singupore 339563
Ernail: sale TEL: 62933850 FAX: 63951800
Ca. Email: solesfkianbuamatar.com
GET REG NO20MU8589G

DELIVERY ORDER

ACCORD AUTO SERVICE P/ L{AMK) NO: DO1004762

DATE: 10/06/2016
10 AMK INDUSTRIAL PARK 2A, AJ/C CODE: KACCOR
#03-11 AMK AUTOPOINT TERMS: 3Days
SINGAPORE 563047, SALESMAN; YAPH]
64619518 FAX: 64819516

ATTN: WAIPENG A/C DEL. MODE:  DELIVER
SIN16772
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PAGE:]
Dexcription Quantity Unit Priee

SGD SGD

1

BONNET F/BRAVO!.4

BONNET HINGE F/BRAVOL.4 RH

EONNET HINGE F/BRAVOL4 LK

FENDER FIBRAVOI14-ALL F/LH = 517510460

FENDER F/BRAVO1 4-ALLF/RH

BUMPER F/BRAVO 1.4 FRT

BUMPER EEINF F/BARVO 1 4 FRT

BUMPER BKT F/BRAVO FRH  (Bu~per netamer )
BUMPER BKT FBRAVO FILH  (fu~pr 12705 )
BUMPER GRILLE FBRAVO FICTR  ( Beper 7 f¢ )
GRILLE BADGE F/BRAVOL.4

SPORT LAMP F/BRAVO FRH

BUMPER GRILLE F/BRAVO F/RH +FOG

H/LAMP FFBRAVO F/LH HALOGEN

H/LAMP FIBRAVO F/IRH HALOGEN

PANEL/FULL FIBARVO 1.4%%14039614-4+-5191 745451894555
PANEL/FULL BKT F/BRAVO |.4 F/RH

PANEL/FULL BKT F/BRAVO 1.4 F/LH

RAD ASSY FABRAVO//CORSA-D 1.4T

BUMPER SPOILER F/BRAVO FRT BRT

- ENG COVERF/BARVOLOW CTR [ engin lash chield)afcm)
- ATRHOSE F/BRAVO 14T

BUMPER BKT FBRAVO 14 FICTR  fRadialor 0P Cugpord gurmih)
GRILLE F/BRAVO 1.4 ( radierter -ah'.l.‘p)
PRESSURE SENSOR F/DODLOMITDBOOST



$0-08-18:13: 04 CKIAN HUA MOTOR PTZ _TD (+EE 5385 18CC

ket KIAN HUA MOTOR CO. PTE LTD
7 Jalan Leml
7 Julan Lembah Kallang Singupere 339363
\ Ernail: sale TEL: 62033850 FAX: 63551800
a Co. Email sulesfikianhuamotor.com
G5T REG NOZ001065690
DELIVER ER
M/S: ACCORD AUTO SERVICE IV L.{AMEK) NO: DO1004762
DATE: 1 0/06/2016
PAGE:2
Deseription Quantity Unit Price Amount
SGD SGD
36" BUMPER CLIPFIGPUNTOFRT (! )
}‘w‘f EXH HEAT SHIELD F/BRAVD
SGD FOUR THOUSAND FOUR HUNDRED SEVENTY SEVEN AND CENTS NINETY FIVE ONWLY
)% Products soll ary nol iturnable,
CORD AUTO SERVICES PTE. LTD
N:Iif ang Mo Kio b al Park 28
#03-11 AMK utcpoml
SingApare
tﬁl%\aﬁ‘ﬁz

For KIAN HUA MOTOR CO. FTELTD ' E.&O.E. ' ACCORD AUTO SERVICE P/ L{AMEK)

AUTHORISED SIGNATURE CONFIRMED & ACCEPTED BY

4i.
-



KIAN HUA MOTOR CO. PTE LTD

7 Jatan Lernbah Kallang Singapore 333563
Tel; 52933850 Fax: 63551800

Email: Sales@Kianhuamotor.Com
G5t Reg No: 2001063696

KINN HWA

Tax Involce No: SRIZSEESE6

| Customer's Copy ] Date: 14/06,/2016

Area Code: I DELIVER
Customer: ACCORD AUTO SERVICE P/ L LAME) Credit Terms: 300ays

Kian Hua Sales: YAPH!

Address: 10 AME INDUSTRIAL PARK 24,
H03-11 AME AUTOPOINT
SINGAPORE S56R047.

anis(g i) OORT AR P0G

BILL PASSES O AMK AUTOPCINT #03-11

Ne. Description [ty | Unitprice | Amount
P/ON 60 SINISTTZ
1 BOMMET F/BRAVD1.4 1
F) BONMET HINGE F/BRAVO1.4 RH 1
3 BOMNNET HINGE F/BRAVDL. A LH 1
*‘ 4 FENDER F/ERAVOL 4-ALL F/LH = 51751060 1
PEUGEET o PENDER F/BRAVOL4-ALL F/RH 1
A 6 BUMPERF/BRAVO 14 FRT 1
A_ 7 BUMPER REINF £/BARVO 1.4 FRT 1
HTEOEN
8  SPORT LAMP F/BRAVD F/RH 1
V 9 BUMPER BKT F/BRAVD F/RH 1
HENAUET 35 BUMPER GRILLE E/BRAVO F/CTR 1
11 GRILLE BADGE F/BRAVOL.4 1 =

Customer’s Signature / Company S5tamp

Products sold are not returnable
oo Page: 1ol 4

| w .07 FORKIAN HUA OFFICIAL USE:
e PAID / AMDUNT:
TIME:

YAPH - 16/06/2016 11:41:22 AM Autharised Signature




