SLUBLAVE 1, #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (65) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref; FY 16/17/0013
Our Ref: CC2/MIDA16009457/p

HQ-Transport Command
Kranji Camp 3

151 Chua Chu Kang Way
Singapore 688248

Attn _: CPT MERLIN/ IWO RAVEEN

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41542 AND SJP 5500M (TOKIO MARINE) ON 19
MAY 2016

We refer to the above matter.

As per your instruction, the case had been forwarded to AGC for further handling, LKK will
proceed to close file.

We have completed the claims activities and shall close our file.

Our note of charges is enclosed for your necessary action.

Summary:; -
Date of submission; | Remarks:
Professional Service Fee Completed
Disbursement Fee NA NA
[ TCA NA NA

Yours faithfully

%siau Tong

Claims Section

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

E-mail: chewht(@lkkauto.com



Hsiao Tnng (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Manday, 6 May 2019 4:36 PM

To: tptsafety@gmail.com

Cc: loy Irene (LKKAuta); Olivia Lau (LKEAuUto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK APPROVAL TO REFER THE CASE TO AGC> EY 16/17/0013 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING MID 41542 & SIP 5500M ON 18/05,/2016]

Attachments: Email to Tokio Marine.pdf; Supp docs_MID41542 pdf

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Atftached as requested.

+ Comespondence email with Tokio Marine Insurance Singapocre Ltd
* MID's Dacuments & Photos

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Fhone: 6742-3197 | email: chewhti@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)

From: HQ TPT Safety Branch <tptsafety@gmail. com=

Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 9:17 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Fwd: <SEEK APPROVAL TO REFER THE CASE TO AGC> FY 16/17/0013 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41542 &
51P 5500 ON 19/05/2016]

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Can we have the supporting documents before we refer to AGC? Thanks,

Regards,
leremy

---------- Forwarded message -

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Date: Sun, May 5, 2019 at 9:03 AM

Subject: <SEEK APPROVAL TO REFER THE CASE TO AGC= FY 16/17/0013 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41542 & SIP
5500M ON 159/05/2016]

To: tptsafety@gmail.com <tptsafety@gmail.com>

Ce: Joy Irene (LKKAuta) <loylrene @lkkauto.com>, Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto com>




Date 105 May 20019

To » MINDEF = Army

Attention :CPT MERLINY TWO RAVEEN

Your Ref (FY 16/17/0013

Our Ref: P CC2/MIDA16D09457 /p
Dear Sirs/Mdm,

CIDENT INVOLVING MID 41542 & S500M ON 19 2016

As per our meeting on 15/04/2019, we have given last reminder to third party insurer for payment. Kindly
refer to the attached email to third party insurer which is self-explanatory.

However there was no response/ offer from third party insurer up-to-date,

In view of this, we are intending to refer the case to AGC for their assistance. For your approval please.

In addition, kindly advise if we may proceed to close our file and submit our note of charges to your good
office,

Thank you.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@[kk auto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408033)
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To | g : MINDEF - Army ' i
Attention ; ’ Cﬁ il E
. Fax r'lpu - 8307 4820

§ ) |
Your ref ; FY18117/0013 i
Qur 1@ ; CCaMIDATBONS4E T i

F ' Date|. 28 APRIL 2018 ;

.ﬂ.cctj[}JEn'r INVOLVING MID 41542 & S.JP 55000 ON 15 1aY 2046 ;
Wa ; o tha a_hwe matler. |

ding to SAF's accident report, the accident ocourrad sojs! / Caused by the negligznoe driving |
of civilian driver by roversed and hit on eur MID velic's £a aich, SAF driver fn mot flanle for
musﬁ%g the accident. 8
Therefore, we are seexing your approval to apply the Insurance Search for vehicle SJP 53000 to|
enable us to process Polential Recovery from the respectivs insures. Plaase aote tne ingurance’|
Search fae is $2.00/- !

For yT_ur approval please. i

~ |

Yours faihful A f i I
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llsims Section B TRANSRCaT
DID: 8742 3157
Fax: 6741 4108
E-mail; chewht@lkkauto.com i



a/1er2018 Invaice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Fhone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +85 6224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Manday to Friday Sam to Spm

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Reqistration No; M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Cur Ref No: GR-18-125705
Date of Requast: 16/08/2018 Your Ref No; Onrlina Purchasa

LKK Aute Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Uibi Ave 1#01-25

Paya Ubi [ndustrial Park
Singapore 408933

Dear SirMadam,

Enguiry Date 18/08/2018
quiry By CHEW HSIAD TONG
P Mehiclzs No, SJPES00M
Accident Dats 12/05/2016
Enquiry Resuli
TP Vehicle No, Instrer Peariod of Insurance Insurer Tel. Nao.
SIPE500M Tekio Marine Insurance Singapore Lid 18/02/201517/09/2016 6221 6111
Thank You.

Tha images provided fo vou are taken from the original repons forwarded to the centra by the members of the Genaral Insurance Association of
Singapore and we take nio responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no liability whatsoaver for any loss ar damage ansing out of

of in sennection with the reports or their images.

‘515 a computer generated document and requiras ng signature.
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B15/2018

RELCORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

TAX INVOICE

Our Ref No: GR-18-125705

Date of Reguest; 168/08/2018 Your Ref No:

LKK Auio Consultants Pie Lig
51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25

FPaya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

Cear SifMadam,

A GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE
'~ GENERAL  RECORDS MANAGEMENT GENTRE

6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
lNSURANCE Phone: +85 6224 0010 Fax: +65 8224 0030
ASSOCIATION Operating Hours: Monday ta Friday Sam to S5pm
GST Registration No: M400017735

Online Purchass

Enguiry Datz 16/08/2018

1quiry By CHEW HSIAD TONG

~ Vehicle No: SJP5500M
Accidant Date 19/05/2016
DESCRIFTION AMOUNT (55%)
TP Insuret Enguiry 187]
EST Amount 013
Total Amount Due (GST Inclusive) 2,00

Thank You.

Thizs is a computer generated document and requires no signature,

For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
[X] GIRO [] Cash [] Cheque
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