3/19/2019 Merimen e-Claims

Print Sent Message

This mail is associated with :

*GBB4963K (C0384414)
[YN5161R]
TP
QUEK & TAN BUILDING CONSTRUCTION PTE LTD
May 18 2016 4:00PM
[DECOCEIL PLASTER PTE LTD]
Woon Meng Motor Pte Ltd

From LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd (LKK_HQ), sent on 19/03/2019 11:19 AM.

To AXA_SG; AXA_CynthiaLoh

CcC Admin-a@lkkauto.com; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

Subject Fw: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN5161R (Ol : AXA - C0384414) and GBB4963K (TP : LKK REF -

CC4/AXA16009377/T1ha3) on 18.05.2016

Dear Cynthia,

We refer to the subject matter.

Please assist to reopen case as we had received TP LOD and for mandate approval.
Thank you.

Vic Alpeh
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6841 2096

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: AXA_SG; cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg

CC: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; jaskhine@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 11/08/2016 07:35 PM

Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN5161R (OI : AXA - C0384414) and GBB4963K (TP : LKK REF
- CC4/AXA16009377/T1ha3) on 18.05.2016

Dear Cynthia,
We refer to your below email.

Please be informed that we had just received PIR from TP claimant and that based on the result, action was taken
againts our Insured for Inconsiderate Driving.

A copy of the PIR was uploaded in merimen for your reference.

As such, we opine that liability is down against our Insured.

We will proceeed to settle the matter accordignly if no further objection from your end.
Thank you.

Vic Alpeh

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Tel: 6841 2096

<-- Original Message -->

From: AXA_SG

To: LKK_HQ

CC: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; jaskhine@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com
Sent On: 13/06/2016 03:11 PM
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Subject: Re: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN5161R (OI : AXA - C0384414) and GBB4963K (TP : LKK REF
- CC4/AXA16009377/T1ha3) on 18.05.2016

AXA INSURANCE SINGAPORE PTE LTD
B (65) 6338 7288
Z [65) 6338 2522

AW . A0 DO ST

M redefining /insurance

Dear LKK,

Please assist to obtain PIR (involved injury per police report) and liaise with the OI before settlement as we have
been informed that TP insurer awarded 50% to OI's counter-claim.

Thanks & Regards,

Cynthia

<-- Original Message -->

From: LKK_HQ

To: cynthia.loh@axa.com.sg

CC: AXA_SG; vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; jaskhine@lkkauto.com; admin-a@lkkauto.com

Sent On: 23/05/2016 04:20 PM

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving YN5161R (OI : AXA - C0384414) and GBB4963K (TP : LKK REF -
CC4/AXA16009377/T1ha3) on 18.05.2016

Dear Cynthia

We refer to the above matter.

As per instruction, we will proceed direct settlement for this case.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID: 6841 2096.
Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ilkkauto.com | fax: 67414108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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