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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Friday, 20 January, 2017 11:38 AM

To: Yahoo

Cc: Admin A; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Tan Kwee May; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: YOUR REF: SKL 3130U_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKL 3130U AND SHD 9623C 

ALONG OUTRAM ROAD TOWARDS CANTONMENT ROAD ON 29.04.2016

Dear Sir, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

 

Thank you. 
 

“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year” 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save Save Save Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.the Earth. Print only when necessary.the Earth. Print only when necessary.the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

 

From: Yahoo [mailto:alvinkfchin@yahoo.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 19 January, 2017 9:09 PM 

To: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Tan Kwee May 

<kweemay.tan@axa.com.sg> 

Subject: Re: YOUR REF: SKL 3130U_ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKL 3130U AND SHD 9623C ALONG OUTRAM ROAD 

TOWARDS CANTONMENT ROAD ON 29.04.2016 

 

Hi Vic,  
First and foremost, thank you so much for your call.  

After talking to you and with this very helpful informations.  

I received all different version of excuses from AXA and the Taxi's insurance company.  

I'm sure many people is going to have coffee at CPIB very soon.  

 

Since I given AXA the deadline is end of this month. I will wait for AXA to reply me.  

 

Thank you so much.  

Have a fruitful and blessed weeks ahead.  

 

Alvin Chin  

Sent from my iPhone 
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On 19 Jan 2017, at 6:26 PM, Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com> wrote: 

TO: MR CHIN KIN FUNG ALVIN 

  

Dear Sir, 

  

OUR REF              : CC3/AXA16008117/Kpa3 

YOUR REF            : SKL 3130U 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKL 3130U AND SHD 9623C ALONG OUTRAM ROAD TOWARDS 

CANTONMENT ROAD ON 29.04.2016 

  

We refer to the above subject matter. We write to inform you that we are the loss adjuster appointed 

by your motor insurer, AXA Insurance Pte Ltd to deal with the third party claim (Property Damage) 

against your policy.  

  

We also refer to our telephone conversation earlier. 

  

As spoken, please be informed that the finalized cost of repair to the claimant’s vehicle after 

inspection is $720.00 (before gst). Please be informed that we are still pending for the claim 

documents from the third party and no settlement has been done yet. 

  

If you need any clarification, please do not hesitate to contact us. 

  

Thank you. 
  

“Wishing you a Happiness and Prosperity New Year” 
  

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) 

please notify the sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this 

email is strictly forbidden. 
  

  


