AT,

[ b FE 0 L A A PR 24
TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
Address: 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216 Tel: 6858 5151 Fax: 6858 0877

Our Ref _PATLASA sate (30119
Your Ref GBD 1033

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Claims Department - Executive in charge

L°“t}ﬂc Tnsurance Bhdl

Dear Sir/Madam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING _PRUASA [ GBD 1035 on 6%.04.16

Refer to the above accident and please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days.

It appears that the accident was caused by your insured. Enclosed documents to substantiate our client's
property damaged claim as our client had authorized us to quantify, fo act and to reach settlement within 6
weeks on their behalf: -

O Qriginal survey report/ copies of photographs

_2Original Tax-invoice number O Original rental invoice number
JI'SAS 1 AS gLs / police report O police result

A Certificate Of Insurance JZ Vehicle search result
.@/Aufhorizaﬂon fo act o

*Survey under insurance instruction / Indepenq,zﬁ‘r surveyor / No sufvey.

LK

a) Cost of repair (inclusive 6ST) $ %,%Bl 00
b) Survey fees / Photographs as per request $ -
c) Vehicle Search fees / GIA f¢és / Police Repdft fees / Rep6rting fees $ 535
d) Loss ofbjr@/ use / rentdl / earpirgs / rentdl fees ¢ 1,000. 00
e) Scene photographs $ -
f) Administrative charges fo negotiate settlement $ -

{ Waive if 100% offer made within acknowledge timeframe)
9) $

Totdl 54,3570

* Driver's injury and other losses exclude in this claim.
If you are agreeable o the above, please forward discharge voucher for our client's signature and payment
issued directly to "Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd" within 28 days.

Yours faithfully,

Patricia Tan / Sam Low / Johnson Chua
Email: pt@tbmotor.com.sg / sam@tlmoter.com.sg / jchnson.chua@thnotor.com.sg




TAX-INVOICE
NUMBER: TP1118/002

{Please quote our reference number TP017042016 for payment)

Ang Mo Kio North Bus Service

Vehicle Na:  PA 917HA

RAAFE %4 AR B2 F
TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

Date: 01/11/2018

Model: YUTONG ZK6100H
Description Amount
To lump sum repair as recommended by surveyor. $3,600.00
Reimbursement of LTA search fees. $5.00
Sub Total $3,605.00
Add 7% GST $252.35
Total $3,857.35

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd

No. 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216

Tel : 8858 5151 (24 hours) Fax : 6858 0877

email@tmotor.com.sg www.timotor.com.sg

Co. Reg. No.: 199503965M GST Reg. No. : M2-8922054-2



AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

TO : TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

FROM : OWNER OF VEHICLE NUMBER PA 6“%5/‘}

ACCIDENT INVOLVING GhpivsSs

ST o e b Codst
ALONG/AT Chéﬂjiljs /rwg} 2 ke Cf{o}'fhffmjf ! fmp!pi\l‘ Da";/ v EHb

T/We hereby authorize you o act on my/our behalf in pursuance of my/our claim for losses
arising out of the above accident.

This letter serves as the 'AUTHORITY TO ACT

I/We also hereby authorize all agreed settlement payment be made in favour to TAN LIM
MOTOR PTE LTD.

Name Rr}ﬁf jﬂt? Ki'd A/L)VH’\ f?pﬂs SCriils «

NRIC 2444 0 FovJ

address  Block o2k pungdal Frod iﬁ?f’?’%é’ S‘hja[?a;f@ Prior

Contact Q%J‘,C{ 6 R
0o o
Sighature

“fha conients of this doguinstt ag_pi_y ta' vghicle
damages onfy. All personal iajuries and

%% damages ansing sherefrom are excluded {fom
the ambit and application of this dotumedt,

-
Owner's / Hirer's signature / RTP

(Company's stamp if applicable)



Waei Shong
B I ]

From: Thin Thin <thinthin@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 17, 2016 12:00 PM

To: Wei Shong

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); sharon.ten@timotor.com.sg; CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: RE: PA9175A - Check liability

Categories: Red Category

LKK REF: CC6/LPC16007269/Aug3

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the email below.

.._~e are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions.

Strictly without admission of liability whatever, but with a view towards a resolutions of your client’s claim in the
ahove matter without resort to litigation and not jeopardizing our insured claim against the liable party, we are
prepared to offer 50% to your client’s claim.

However, if you have any proof/evidence to proof your client’s claim, kindly inform us and we will review the matter
again.

Kindly take note that case handler in charge is Thin Thin and can be contacted at 6841 2360.

Kindly note that this negotiation between partias on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving
the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred
from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materiatly affect/influence on the issues

---+£ liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.

""Best Regards,

Thirn Thin Hlaing | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6841-2560 | email: thinthin@lkkauto,com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Wei Shong [mailto:wei.shong@timotor.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 17 May, 2016 11:33 AM

Ta: Thin Thin

Cc: Joy Irene (LKK Auto); sharon.ten@timotor.com.sg; CS A Team; Admin A
Subject: RE: PA9175A - Check liability

Dear Thin Thin,
Our client do not have any evidence.

Thank you.
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CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE

Page 1 of 2
DEXRIR A 0saon
SRS (ST ) B R 24 ] mosaon_
V. 1
MOTOR PRIVATE BUS CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. 17D, ASTOSK?Z
CERTIFICATE OF INSURANCE
Motor Vehicles (Fhird-Party Risks and Compensalion) Act (Chapter 189)
Motor Vehicles (Third-Parly Risks and Compensation) Ries, 1960
Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia)
Motor Vehicles (Third-Party Risks) Rules, 1559 (Malaysia)
Engine No :ISBE425021843372
CERTIFICATE No. DMBISNIS11431500 Chassis No:LZYTBTDE991019746
1. Index Mark and Registration
Number of Vehicle PRELIEA
2. Name of Policy Holder M/S RANG MO KIO NORTH BUS SERVICE
3. Effective dale of the Commencement of insurance for 25 MARCH 2015 EXCESS BECT I .iieiinriicmnnrnnnrananran 5§2,500.00
the purposes of the Regulations, Crdinance or Enactment EMCESS SECT. II toitiiiniiiimrannnnnnnnns g%$2,500,00
EX ON WINDSCREEN ... - rervrerrnvnanres 55500.00
4. Date of Expiry of Insurance 24 MARCH 2016

5. Persons or Classes of Persons entitled to drive *

ANY PERSON PROVIDED HE IS IN THE POLICYHOLDER'S EMPLOY AND IS DRIVING ON THEIR CORDER OR WITH THEIR
PERMISSION.

PROVIDED THAT THE PERSON DRIVING 15 PERMI'TTED IN ACCORDANCE WITH THE LICENSING OR OTHER LAWS OR
REGULATIONS 70 DRIVE THE MOTOR VEHICLE OR HAS BEEN 30 PERMITTEDR AND IS NOT DISQUALIFIED BY ORDER OF A
COURT OF LAW OR BY REASON OF ANY ENACTMENT OR REGULATION IW THAT BEHALF FROM DRIVING THE MOTOR VEHICLE.

6. Limitations as to use: *

USE ONLY FOR THE CARRIAGE
SPECIFIED IN THE SCHEDULE.
THE POLICY DOES NOT COVER
{1} USE FCR RACING, PACE-MAKING, RELIABILITY TRIAL OR SPEED-TESTING.

{2) USE WHILST DRAWING A TRAILER, EXCEPT THE TOWING {OIHER THAN FOR REWARD) OF ANY ONE DISABLED
MECHANICALLY PROPELLED VEHICLE,

OF PASSENGERS OR GOODS IN CONNECTION WiTH THE POLICYHOLDER'S BUSINESS AS

HIRE PURCHASE CO. : TATCO CREDIT PTE LTD AS HP OWNER

* Limifations rendered inoperative by Section 8 of the Motor Vehicles {Third-Parly Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189}
and Section 85 of the Road Transport Acl, 1987 (Malaysia}, are not fo be included under these headings.

IWe hereby Certify that the poficy to which this Certificate relates is issued in accordance with the

provisions of the Motor Vehicles (Third-Pany Risks and Compensation) Act (Chapter 189} and Part |V of the
Road Transport Act, 1987 (Malaysia).
Please see reverse

For CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (SINGAPORE) PTE. LTD.

Countersigned By:

Authoﬁse\i\o_fﬂgg/‘ Autirorised Signatory

3 Anson Road #16-00 Springleaf Tower Singapore 079809  Tel: 6389 6111 Fax: 6225 3592 Website: www.sg.cntaiping.com

http://120.50.33.27//chinainsB2B/Spool/ANG580A-PAII75A-DMBISNI511431500-...  24/3/2015



