S25/2019 Mail - Asher Sng (LKKAue) - Outlook

RE: [MANDATE REQUEST] ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA9175A & GBD103S ON 8.4.2016
[External Confidential]

GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpoh@lonpac.com>
Wed 5/22/2019 12:17 PM

To: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) <AsherSng@lkkauto.com=
Ce: MT_Claim_S5G =mt_claim@lonpac.com>

Lonpac External - Confidential
Dear Asher,

Please proceed as proposed.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
- £

The all @88 lonpac.com.sg

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.

From: Asher Sng (LKKAuto) [mailto: AsherSng@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 21 May, 2019 4:57 PM

To: GERALD POH WEE BIN

Cc: MT_Claim_SG

Subject: [MANDATE REQUEST] RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA9175A & GBD1035 ON 8.4.2016 [External
Confidential]

Dear Sirs,

We refer to the above matter.

We have highlighted to your good office on 20/04/20186 of Third-Party's request to do Direct Settlement with our
Principal, Lonpac Insurance Bhd.

The accident occurred both party turning into the main road.
Basing on the reports of the circumstance of the accident, we propose to settle third-party claim at 50% liability.

Summary to offer to repairer TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD is as follows: -

Claimed Amount Revised Amount
1. Cost of Repair (w/GST) $8471.73 $ 3,852.00
2. Loss of Use (5days x $200) $ 1,000.00 $ 750.00 (5days x $150)
Sub Total | $9471.73 $4.602.00
50% | $4,735.87 $ 2,301.00
3. LTA/GIA Search Fee 5 5.35 $ 5.35
Total | §4,741.22 $2.306.35

hitps:outlock.office. com/mail search/id/AAQKAGVINDIKMTdILTMIMDgtNDY 52C1hZTdkLWQEZDMyN TEOMGFhMgAQAPTBrNS:ZBVXgICat98g)... 112



5/25/2018 Mail - Asher Sng [LKKAuto) - Outiook

**4 days recommendation for repair.
Relevant supporting claim documents are attached herewith for your perusal and reference.
The above is for your approval please,

Thank You.

Best Regands,
Asher Sng | Caze Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

phope; 634 [-605] | email: ashersppidlikkawo comg | fax: 674 1-4108

Blk 51, Payva Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S{408933)

From: GERALD POH WEE BIN <geraldpeh@Ilonpac.com>

Sent: Thursday, 7 March 2019 1:29 PM

To: Thin Thin (LEKAute) <thinthin@lkkauto.coms>

Cc: MT_Claim_5G <mt_claim@|onpac.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING PA9175A & GBD103S ON 8.4.2016 [External Confidential]

Lonpac External - Confidential
Our ref : 15/16/16/VC00/018609
Your Ref : CC6/LPC16007269/Aug3

Dear Thin Thin,

Kindly update us on the current status.

Best Regards

Gerald Poh

Senior Claims Executive | Lonpac Insurance Bhd

300 Beach Road, #17-04/07 The Concourse, Singapore 199555

Tel: (65) 6250 7388 Ext.255 | Fax: (65) 6296 2706
- >

i

sl g Theall @ lonpac.com.sg
ey B

Lonpac External - Confidential data is for use by authorised external parties only.
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TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
Address: 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216 Tel: 6858 5151 Fax: 6858 0877

ourRef PAAIISA  TPO\}0LI0IE Bate V-0 \9

Your Ref _GBD 1035

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Claims Department - Executive in charge

L'}ﬂ F':'l- L —l.l_r"l._";ur"u"h -E)hhj'.

Dear SirdMadam,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING _'PUIASH [ GBD 1035 on ok 016

Refer to the above accident and please acknowledge receipt of this letter within 14 days.

It appears that the accident was caused by your insured. Enclosed documents to substantiate our client's
property damaged claim as our client had authorized us to quantify, to act and to reach settlement within &
weeks an their behalf: -

© Original survey report/______ copies of photegraphs

@ Original Tax-invoice number Pk [oor O Original rental invaice number
O'SAS / AS &15 / police report O police result

O Certificate Of Insurance @ Vehicle search result
ﬁ/:ﬂ.ufhﬂr‘rzuhun to act o]

*Survey under insurance instruction / Indepznqlgﬁ't surveyor / Mo survey.

LK. |

a) Cost of repair (inclusive G5T) $_° 851.99
b) Survey fees / Photographs as per request $ -
c) Vehicle Search fees / GIA fees / Police Repo’Ft fees / Repﬁr"ring fees % S-35
d) Loss of Jh,u-t / use / rental / earnings / rental fees $ 1,000 60
e) Scene photographs $ =
f) Administrative charges to negetiate settlement $ =

{Waive if 100% offer made within acknowledge timeframe)
g) $

Total $ L4,X51 .8

* Driver's injury and other losses exclude in this claim,
If you are agreeable to the above, please forward discharge voucher for our client's signature and payment
issued directly to *Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd" within 28 days.

Yours faithfully,
Patricia Tan / Sam Low / Joknson Chua

Email: pt&timotor.com.sq / samEtimotor comsg / johnson.chua@timoter.comsg




AUTHORIZATION TO ACT

TO : TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD

FROM : OWNER OF VEHICLE NUMBER P‘q Cf l }ﬁ; /:i

} &
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GhD 1955

P meaich Covist
ALONG/AT c"hﬁ@_f- /““A_‘,T D inrkers dorm. hm;!m @ON LH-’- Gl

I/We hereby authorize you to act on my/our behalf in pursuance of my/our claim for losses
arising out of the above accident.

This letter serves as the 'AUTHORITY TO ACT

I/We also hereby authorize all agreed settlement payment be made in favour to TAN LIM
MOTOR PTE LTD.

Mame qu"ﬂ f}"h' Ki'd ﬂ”L*’FH’\ BH&- COrvi(e <

NRIC 2?9«& 0 ‘—I]EL‘L-’ T

Address Rlock l'fl.‘}ﬂ! FL'LNJ{'E'?[J ‘Frl::"ft’f 'ﬁil;‘{!";? -Q“f.ﬂfi’r'f Pzioy

D2&4 ¢ 1w

Contact
Date
Signature /’;,,u K
I
ﬂ;.
( I.-\;:
.-? -” .L;". contents of this docum wand _:pr,-llﬂ:x:tl :-.u:'
i d”'-}' .:_,_,(\ damages only. All persd nal inju :, IIIII
/‘ — \H‘ : damages arising the i rm &re exciuc IIr
ot the amical anl:l an-, jication of this document

Owner's / Hirer's signature / RTP
(Company's stamp if applicable)



f’ LONPAC INSURANCE BHD

CLAIM NO  : 15/16/16/VCO/0186049
DATE : 13 JUNE 2019

DISCHARGE VOUCHER

I'We, ANG MO KIO NORTH BUS SERVICE confirmed acceptance from M/s
LONPAC INSURANCE BHD and/or the owner GBD 1035 the sum of Singapore
Dollars TWO THOUSAND THREE HUNDEED SIX AND CENTS THIRTY FIVE
ONLY. ($2.306.35) in full and final satisfaction, hquidation and discharge of all
property losses competent o me/us upon the said M/s LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
in respect of all property losses sustained by me/us whether now or hereafter 0
become manifest, arising either directly or indirectly from an accident involving, PA
9175A on 08/04/2016 along/at CHANG] LODGE2 WORKERS DORMITORY /
TANAH MERAH COAST.

I /We hereby agree to indemnify and keep indemnify (HY BUILDING &
MAINTENANCE SERVICES PTE LTD /LONPAC INSURANCE BHD) against
all claims and any claims whatsoever made by any person/persons on our behalfl in
respect of the said accident.

I/'We lurther authorize you to pay the above settlement sum directly to M/s TAN LIM
MOTOR PTE LTD.

I/'We hereby acknowledge that this payment i1s made on a without admission of
liability basis and without prejudice o all related claims and in respect of out
insured’s recovery action.
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TAX-INVOICE 1—

NUMRBER: TP1118/002 RBFEBARRL G
(Please quote our reference number TPO17042016 for payment) TAN LIM MOTOR PTE LTD
Ang Mo Kio North Bus Service Date: 01/11/2018

Vehicle No:  PA 9175A

Model: YUTONG ZK6100H

Description Amount
To lump sum repair as recommended by surveyor. $3,600.00
Reimbursement of LTA search fees. $5.00
a Sub Total $3,605.00
Add 7% GST %252.35
Total $3,857.35

20
/

Tan Lim Motor Pte Ltd

No. 51 Defu Lane 10 Singapore 539216
Tel : 6858 5151 (24 hours) Fax : 6858 0877
email@timotor.com.sg www . timotor.com.sg
Co. Reg. No.: 199503965M GST Reg. No. : M2-8922054-2



AfBI20%6 Vehicle Hub

ﬁzr.l size + |

Enquire Vehicle & Owner Information ( Vehicle No. GBD103S As At 08 Apr 2016
/ 06:40:00 )

Law Firm Search Details
Search Reason: Insurance claim in retation fo trafic accident

Law Firm Case ho.: TaM LI
Current Owner Details

Cwner (D Type: Company
Crwner (D 2005086200
Owner Name: HY BUILDING & MAINTENANCE SERVICES PTE LTD

Registered Address Type: Private Residential (Condo Apt or House) / Shopping f Office Complexes
Ragistered Block/House

: B
Mo.:
Registered Street Name:  KAKI BUKIT AVENUE 4
Registered Linit Ma.: #05- 28/20

Fegislered Building Mame: PREMIER @ KAKI BUKIT

Regstered Postal Code: 415875

Current Vehicle Details

Vehicle Mo GBD103S

Make Description/Model:  MITSUBISHI f CANTER FEADTBRI1SDER (CEU)
Insurance Company Name: LONPAC INSURANCE BHD
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