Shu Pei (LKK Auto)

From: Shu Pei (LKK Auto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 April, 2016 9:04 AM

To: motor.survey@axa.com.sg

Cc: Hsiao Tong; Vivian Lau; Zayyer; Admin A

Subject: Third Party Direct settlement for APWs (Zone 1) - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFL2828G (Ol :
AXA - TBA) AND SKV9288G (TP : LKK REF - CC6/AXA16006100/pb3) ON 03.04.2016

Attachments: EST.pdf; IMG_1252.mp4; IMG_6917.JPG; RPT.PDF

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Sir / Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case from M/s Mova Automotive Pte Ltd - Bukit Merah.

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s GIA report, video, photo and estimated cost of repair for your perusal.
Meanwhile, kindly assist to register this case in Merimen and assign to LKK.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Shu Pei| Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366-0055 | email: shupei@Ikkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: VION [mailto:vion@mova.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 4 April, 2016 6:41 PM

To: Admin A <admin-a@Ikkauto.com>

Subject: Accident on 03/04/16 involving SKV9288G & SFL2828G (TP AXA)

Dear Sir / Mdm,
Your Ref: SFL2828G (AXA INSURED)
Please assist to revert the OIC and liability for the above case. Thank you.

Best Regards,

Vion Lim

Claims Officer

MOVA Automotive Pte Ltd
Tel: 6272 3892

Fax: 6270 8314

E-mail: vion@mova.com.sg




