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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 7 December, 2016 5:00 PM

To: Khor Saw Theng

Cc: Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Admin A; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: TP settlement - C0375003/GA060103 ***LKK REF: CC4/AXA16004577/K1hg3

Attachments: Email from OI.pdf

Dear Saw Theng, 

 

We refer to your below email. 

 

Please be informed that we had spoken to our Insured where our Insured had strongly denied liability for this 

accident and doesn’t want to settle the claim. Please refer to the email from Insured. 

 

TP repairer, however, provided to us a copy of the CCTV footage for our review. Copy of the footage will be 

forwarded to you via accellion. 

 

Kindly advise further instructions as OI doesn’t want to settle the claim and TP is also chasing for settlement. 

 

Thank you. 
 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

 

From: Do-Not-Reply [mailto:do-not-reply@merimen.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 7 December, 2016 10:00 AM 

To: sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg 

Cc: Vic (LKKAuto) <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@lkkauto.com>; Admin A <admin-

a@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: Re: TP settlement - C0375003/GA060103 ***LKK REF: CC4/AXA16004577/K1hg3 

 

This mail is associated with : 

*PC3165H (C0375003) 

[SJV9385X] 
TP 

KAL TRANSPORT PTE LTD 

Mar 8 2016 9:00AM 

[PLATTS THOMAS NIGEL, JAMES LANDSBROUGH] 

SC Auto Industries (S) Pte Ltd 

Dear Saw Theng, 
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Thank you for your email. 

  

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

  

Dear Vic, 
  

For your information and necessary action please.  
  

To check availability of the case handler , you may contact the undersigned. 
  

Best Regards, 

Agnes Lim| Admin 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6366-0055 | email: AgnesLim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

<-- Original Message --> 

From: AXA_SG 

To: LKK_HQ; sur@lkkauto.com; assignments@lkkauto.com; AXA_SG 

Sent On: 06/12/2016 08:04 PM 

Subject: Re: TP settlement - C0375003/GA060103 

   

 

  

 

Dear LKK 

  

Please advise on the status of this matter. 

  

Regards 

  

Saw Theng 

   

   

<-- Original Message --> 

From: AXA_SG 

To: LKK_HQ;sur@lkkauto.com;assignments@lkkauto.com 

CC: AXA_SG 

Sent On: 29/03/2016 05:19 PM 

Subject: TP settlement - C0375003/GA060103 

 

Dear KALVIN ANG WEI KUN , 

 

Please proceed for direct settlement if damages consistent. 

 

Regards, 

Khor Saw Theng 
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[ This mail is sent from a mailer account - do not reply to this email address ]  

 

Sent by : Agnes Lim Su Hoon (LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd)  


