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Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 9 October, 2018 6:57 PM

To: Loo, Tong Shing; Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina

Cc: PRDSG.DFILE; Admin A; Thin Thin (LKKAuto); 'Sukimin, Nurasikin'

Subject: RE: #7023060350SG003#027#TP Claim Status - SJP2772P *** LKK REF: 

CC6/AIG16003566/M1wb3

Your Ref :  7023060350SG 
Our Ref: CC6/AIG16003566/M1wb3 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SJO 2772P  & SKT 7945S  & OTHERS ON 18/02/2016 ALONG HOLLAND RD 
 
We refer to the above matter 
  
This is a chain collision involving 3 vehicles chain collision where OI was the last vehicle 
  
In accordance to the MCF guideline, we have to settle 3rd claim at 100%. 
 
We have surveyed the vehicle, and relevant supporting documents was enclose for your perusal.     
 
We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer Em-1 Auto Pte Ltd is as follows: 

                                                          Amount Claimed        Amount Revised 

1. Cost of Repair (+GST)                                  S$ 44,202.24               S$ 20,865.00 

2. Loss of Rental ($ 100.00 x 14days )             S$   1680.00               S$ 1,400.00( Surveyor recommend 14 days) 

3.GIA SEARCH                                                S$         5.35               S$      5.35 

                                                                         S$ 45,887.59              S$ 22,270.35 

Amount of claim at liability 100% S$ 22,270.35 

For your approval in merimen please. 
 
 
 

Thank you 

Best Regards, 

Vivian Lau| Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 
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From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  

Sent: Thursday, 24 May, 2018 8:26 AM 

To: Loo, Tong Shing <TongShing.Loo@aig.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: PRDSG.DFILE <PRDSG.DFILE@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) 

<thinthin@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: RE: #7023060350SG003#027#TP Claim Status - SJP2772P *** LKK REF: CC6/AIG16003566/M1wb3 

 

Dear Sir / Madam,  

Thank you for your email.  

   

Please note that: -  

  

LKK ref Officer in charge 

CC6/AIG16003566/M1wb3 Vivian – 6841 8625 

 

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 

 

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 

 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Loo, Tong Shing [mailto:TongShing.Loo@aig.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, 22 May, 2018 2:41 PM 

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 

Cc: PRDSG.DFILE <PRDSG.DFILE@aig.com> 

Subject: #7023060350SG003#027#TP Claim Status - SJP2772P 

 

Dear Sir/ Madam 

 

We would like to acquire progress and updates of this case as it is still not close for quite some time. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 
 
 
 
Loo Tong Shing  
AIG 
 
Express Claims Adjuster 
Claims Operations | AIG Shared Services 

 
TongShing.Loo@aig.com  | www.aig.com 

 

IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must 

not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by 

"Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and 
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any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into 

which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no 

responsibility is accepted by American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or 

severally, for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 


