Zayyer (LKKAuto)

From: Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 15 January, 2018 5:31 PM

To: 'Chew Goon Motor(ad3)’

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); 'chewgoon@singnet.com.sg'; 'Eric’
Subject: payment cheque - DV ATTAHED RE: YN2476C
Attachments: payment cheque.pdf

Dear Chew Goon,
Attached is payment cheque.

We will send out by post as per below address. Your acknowledgement is appreciated upon receiving of the cheque.
Thanks.

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15,16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Zayyer (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 5 September, 2017 6:38 PM

To: 'Chew Goon Motor(ad3)' <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@Ilkkauto.com>; 'chewgoon@singnet.com.sg'
<chewgoon@singnet.com.sg>; 'Eric' <eric@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Subject: DV ATTAHED RE: YN2476C

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Dear Grace,
Refer to the below email.

With a solely purposes of resolving towards your claim, we will proceed to settle the claim global sum at $56200.00
all in.

Kindly sign the attached DV and return the original DV to us for our necessary action. thanks.

Best Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, email: zayyer@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Zayyer (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 20 March, 2017 8:50 AM
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) <ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
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Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>; chewgoon@singnet.com.sg; Eric
<eric@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
Subject: RE: RE: YN2476C

Dear Grace,
We will check and revert back to you. Thanks.

Best Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, email: zayyer@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3) [mailto:ad3@chewgoonmotor.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 18 March, 2017 9:52 AM

To: Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer@Ikkauto.com>

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>; KKLau <kklau@Ikkauto.com>; chewgoon@singnet.com.sg; Eric
<eric@chewgoonmotor.com.sg>

Subject: Re: RE: YN2476C

Dear Zayer,
Gentle reminder.

Thanks & Regards,
Grace

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)

Sent: 28 November 2016 15:58:13

To: zayyer@Ilkkauto.com

Cc: chewht@lkkauto.com; kklau@lkkauto.com; chewgoon@singnet.com.sg; Eric
Subject: Re: RE: YN2476C

Dear Zayyer,

We refer to your offer. We regret that the LOU is too low.
We propose as following:-

COR: 5724.50 (w.gst)



LOU: 1200.00 (8days x $150) (refer to the breakdown)

@90%: 6232.05

Our breakdown of 8 days :

20th PRI lday
23th, 24th Sat, Sun (non working day) 2days

Surveyor recommended 5 working days.

Please advise.

Thanks & Regards,
Grace

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15, 16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465

From: Chew Goon Motor

Sent: 28 November 2016 15:37:21
To: Chew Goon Motor(ad3)
Subject: Fwd: RE: YN2476C

———————— Forwarded Message --------
Subject:RE: YN2476C
Date:Sat, 26 Nov 2016 08:24:17 +0000
From:Zayyer (LKKAuto) <zayyer @lkkauto.com>
To:ad5 @chewgoonmotor.com.sg <ad5 @chewgoonmotor.com.sg>
CC:Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ikkauto.com>, KKLau <kklau @lkkauto.com>

WITHOUT PREJUDICE




Dear Grace,

We refer to the below email.

On a without prejudice basis, we will proceed to settle the claim global sum at $$6090.00 all in.

Cost of Repair $$5724.50 (including GSt)
Loss of Rental $$1050.00 ($150 x 7days) recommended 5 days + 1 Sunday + 1 inspection
Total $$6774.50

@90% $$6097.05 ( global sum -$$6090.00)

Kindly confirm the acceptance. Thanks

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the
sole intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of
liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.”

Best Regards,
Zayer | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841 2409, email: zayyer@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Thursday, 21 January, 2016 4:46 PM
To: ad5@chewgoonmotor.com.sg

Cc: Zayyer <zayyer@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: FW: YN2476C




Without Prejudice

Dear Grace,

Thank you for your email.

Please be informed that we are currently pending for accident report from MID 34265.

Kindly note that for liability, claim negotiation and settlement, please contact Zayyer at 6841 2409.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course.

Thank you.

‘Wishing you a very happy and prosperous new year’

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Chew Goon Motor - Admin [mailto:ad5@chewgoonmotor.com.sg]
Sent: Thursday, 21 January, 2016 4:41 PM

To: Hsiao Tong

Subject: YN2476C




Dear Sir,

Kindly refer to the attached, let us to know the liability or third party report.

Thanks & Regards
Grace

Chew Goon Motor

Blk 10, Ang Mo Kio Ind Park 2A,
Ave 5 #01-15,16 & 17,

Ang Mo Kio Autopoint
Singapore 568047

Tel : 6484 1626

Fax : 6484 0465
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