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Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Clarence Richard Anthony <clarence.anthony@income.com.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 17 April 2019 2:11 PM

To: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Cc: Azhari Afidi

Subject: FW: TREASURY COLLISION AGREEMENT : ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34265 & YN 

2476C ON 13/01/2016 MT/0887931

Attachments: DOCS-.pdf; Copy+of+CI.pdf

Hi Joy Irene 

 

The driver at the time of the accident was holding a class 3 driving license for less than 2 years.  Due to this, there is 

a young & inexperienced driver excess imposed. Therefore the total excess is $1,500.00. 

 

I attach a copy of the certificate of insurance for your reference. 

 

Due to this TCA will not apply for this case and we will be closing our file. 

 

Hi Azhari – pls close your file. 

 

Regards 

 

 
Clarence Anthony 

Manager 

Motor Insurance  

T +65 6430 7877 

www.income.com.sg 

 

 

    

 

 

 

 

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) [mailto:JoyIrene@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 11 April 2019 3:49 PM 

To: MTCL@income.com.sg 

Cc: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <olivialau@lkkauto.com> 

Subject: TREASURY COLLISION AGREEMENT : ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34265 & YN 2476C ON 13/01/2016 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

 

Your Ref: YN 2476C 

Our Ref: CC2/MIDA16001377/M1j 

 

 

M/s NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd 
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Dear Sirs, 

 

TREASURY COLLISION AGREEMENT :  

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34265 & YN 2476C ON 13/01/2016 

 

 

We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving 

military vehicles with effect from 01st April 2007. 

 

We note that your insured’s vehicle YN 2476C is under Comprehensive cover and excess S$600.00. 

 

Please be informed that the Treasury Collision Agreement is applicable and the computation will be as 

follows: 

 

a) Cost of Repair to your client vehicle (YN 2476C)   : $ 5,350.00 

b) Cost of Repair to our vehicle (MID 34804)   : $ 5,235.73 

TCA reimbursement to MINDEF by NTUC @ 50%        : $ 10,585.73 x 50% 

: $ 5,292.87 

 

 

A copy of the supporting document is enclosed.  

 

Please confirm on the above stated computation and forward the TCA reimbursement amount of 

S$5,292.87 made payable to PS DEFENCE within the next 14 days. 

 

 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Joy Irene | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6841-2409 | email: joyirene@lkkauto.com|Fax: 6741-4108  

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.It may contain confidential and/or privileged 

information.If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email 

is strictly forbidden. 

 

Disclaimer 

 

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the 

recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately 

and delete all copies of it. Thank you.  


