Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

From: Sharon Sng <sharon@sngahtee.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 25 June 2019 1:59 PM

To: Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Cecilia Chong (LKK Auto)

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 2219P & GV 7099X ON 15/01/2016
Hi Cecilia

We refer to the below and the payment for the repair has already paid by our client.
Thanks.

Best Regards

Sharon Sng

SNG AH TEE MOTOR & PANEL SERVICE PTE LTD | BLK 3 PIONEER ROAD NORTH #01-18 SINGAPORE 628457
TEL: 62686183 (4LINES) | FAX: 62681429 | Find us at http://www.sngahtee.com

SNGAHTE

MOTOR & PANELSER

-Please note that all offer/acceptance is made without prejudice.-

From: Jas Khine (LKKAuto) <jaskhine@Ikkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, May 23, 2017 9:55 AM

To: sharon@sngahtee.com

Cc: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 2219P & GV 7099X ON 15/01/2016

WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Your Ref: GBB 2219P
Our Ref : CC6/AXA16001211/T1yb3

Dear Sharon,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING GBB 2219P & GV 7099X ON 15/01/2016
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that our Principal AXA has repudiated the claim due to our insured driver breach of policy terms and
conditions.

Therefore, we will close the matter at our end and kindly redirect your client’s claim to owner of GV 7099X directly.



P/s Please advise whether you are willing to purchase our survey report.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Jas Khine | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-2928 | email: jaskhine@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)




