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i A & Ple Lid

51 UBIAVE L #01-25 PAYA UBI INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 TEL : (D65) 62563561 FAX : (065) 62564315

Your Ref: FY 15/16/0053
Our Ref: CC2/MIDA15020850/p

HQ-Transport Command
Kranji Camp 3

151 Chua Chu Kang Way
Singapore 688248

Attn_: CPT MERLIN/ 1WO RAVEEN

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34270/ MID 34272/ SGN 3872Z(AXA) ON 07/12/2015

We refer to the above matter.

As per your instruction, the case had been forwarded to AGC for further handling, LKK will
proceed to close file.

We have completed the claims activities and shall close our file.

Our note of charges is enclosed for your necessary action.

Summary: -
Date of submission: | Remarks:
Professional Service Fee Completed
Disbursement Fee NA NA
TCA NA NA

Yours faithfully

Mian Tong

Claims Section

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

E-mail: chewht(@lkkauto.com



Hsiao Tung (LKKAuto)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, & May 2019 4:34 PM

To: tptsafety@gmail.com

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto); Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: <SEEK APPROVAL TO REFER THE CASE TO AGC> FY 15/16/0053 [ACCIDENT
INVOLVING MID 34270/ MID 34272/ SGN 38727/ ON 07/12/2015]

Attachments: Email to AXA pdf; SIGNED DV_MID34272 pdf; Photos_MID 34272 pdf; Docs_MID
34272 pdf

Dear Sirs/Mdm,

Attached as requested.

o Comrespondence with AXA Insurance Pie Lid
» Signed DV
« MID's Documents & Photos

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(a08933)

From: HQ TPT Safety Branch <tptsafety@gmail.com>

Sent: Monday, 6 May 2019 9:14 Al

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

subject: Fwd: <SEEK APPROVAL TO REFER THE CASE TO AGC> FY 15/16/0053 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34270/

MID 34272/ SGN 38722/ ON 07/12/2015]
Hi Hsiao Tong,
Can we have the supporting documents before we can refer to AGC? Thanks.

Regards,
Jeremy

s-msemmees Forwarded message ---------

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@Ilkkauto.com>

Date: Sun, May 5, 2019 at 8:49 AM

Subject: <5EEK APPROVAL TO REFER THE CASE TO AGC= FY 15/16/0053 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34270/ MID
34272/ 5GN 38722/ ON 07/12/2015]

To: tptsafety@email.com <tptsafety@gmail.com:>

Cc: Joy Irene (LKKAuto) <loylrene @lkkauto.com>, Olivia Lau (LKKAuto) <glivialau@lkkauto.com>




Date : 05 May 2019
To : MINDEF - Army
Attention : CPT MERLINS TWO RAVEEN
Your Ref tFY 15/156/0053
Our Ref; CCC2/MIDATS020850/p
Dear Sirs/Mdm,
ACCIDENT I ID 34270/ MID 3427 N 38727/ ON 07/12

As per our meeting on 15/04/2019%, we have given last reminder to third party insurer for payment. Kindly
refer to the attached email to third party insurer which is self explanatory.

However there was no payment/cheque received up-to-date.

In view of this, we are intending to refer the case to AGC for their assistance. For your approval please.

In addition, kindly advise if we may proceed to close our file and submit our note of charges to your good
office.

Thank you,

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Caze Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-9197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)



CLAIM REF : 538MO0TOM
INSURED : CHAN KIE

DISCHARGE VOUCHER |

Weft, PS D“‘&"CQ hereby agree to accept the sum of dollars
THREE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED NINETEEN AND CENTS SEVENTY ONLY ($$3,719.70) paid ta
us/me by AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD as full and final sestlement of all claims of whatever kintJ
including damages for personal injuries and damages to property that we/l may have against the
said AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD or their Insured or the driver of motor vehicle no. SGN3872Z as a
result of an accident along PIE TOWARDS TUAS on 07.12.2015 of which we/| were,/was the driver/|
owner/ hirer/ passenger/rider/pillion/ insurer of motor vehicle o, MID 34272

We/| hereby declare that the said insurer or owner andfor driver of insured vehicle shall not be
liable for any further claim(s) whatsoever and whosoever present or future that we/l may have
against the said Insurer, owner and/ar driver of vehicle no. 5GN3872Z in connection directly or
indirectly with the said accident and give our/my full and final discharge.

We/| hereby declare that we/l arefam the person(s) entitled to receive the above settlement and|
hereby undertake to indemnify AXA INSURANCE PTE LTD against any claim made or to be made in|
respect of this settlement

It ls understood and agreed that payment herein is made without admission of liability whatsaevarl
on the part of the said insurer, owner and/or driver of vehicle no. SGN38727. |

Dated this day of 2018

Claimant's Signature

NRIC no./ Company Stamp

Occupation/ Business

Address

Telephone Mo.

Witness's Name

Witness's Signature

Witness's NRIC Mo,
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FACSIMILE |

To : MINDEF — Army
Attention : CPT Merlin / 1WO Raveen
Fax no : B307 4518

Your ref : FY15/168/0053

Our ref : CC2/MIDAT5020850/p
Date ; 08 SEPT 2018

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34270(15) / MID 34272(2") / SGN 3872Z ON 07/12/2015
SGN 3872Z(3rd car - AXA) -> MID 34272(2nd car) -> MID 34270 (1st Car)

We refer to the above matter.

Third party insurer(AXA) had agreed to settle MID 34272's claim at 33 719.70(all-in).

Please duly sign the discharge voucher & GIRO Credit Authorisation form enclosed and retumn to
us by post/by hand.

Please contact the undersigned should you require any clarification with the matter.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully

O APPRC

Chew Hsiao Tong
Claims Section
Tel: 6742 3197
Fax: 6741 4108
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51 UBL AVE 1, #01-75 PAYA UBL INDUSTRIAL PARK, SINGAPORE 408933 ‘TEL: (065)62863561 FAX : (065] 62564315

FACSIMILE
To ' MINDEF — ARMY
Attention : 1WO VENNU/ 1WON SIVAJI RAJAH
Fax no : 8307 4520
Your ref : FY 151 8/0053
Our ref : CC2MIDA1E020850p
Date : 04 SEFT 2017

P ——— e —

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34270 & MID 34272 & SGN 3872Z ON 07 DEC 2015

mﬁe.refer to the above matier.

This & total 3 vehicles chaln collision. Detail as follows: -

SGN 3872Z -> MID 34272 -> MID 34270

We are processing potential recovery from the insurer of SGN 3872Z.

e are seeking your approval to apply the Insurance Search for vehicle SGN 38722 to enable us
lo procass Potential Recovery from the respectiva insurer. Please note the Insurance Search fee
is $2.00/-.

For your approval please.

Thank you.

Yours faithfully

. Fea
gt V4
NV '
M HQ TRANSPORT
Cheaw Hsiao Tong

Claims Section
DID: 6742 3187
Fax 6741 4108
E-mail: chewht@lkkauto.com




Q25/2017

. INSURANCE

S ASSOCIATION

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE

Invoice

GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
& Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580
Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax; +65 6224 0030
Operating Hours: Monday to Friday Sam to 5pm
GET Registration No: M400017735

Third Party Insurer Enquiry

Qur Ref No: GR-17-142407
Date of Ragquast: 25/09/2017 Your Ref No! Onling Purchase
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Dear SirfMadam,
Enguiry Date 25/09/2017
Snguiry By CHEW HSIAD TONG
2 Vehicle No, SGN38T2Z
Accident Date 071212015
Enquiry Result
TP Vehicle No, Insurer Period of Insurance Insurer Tel. No,
SGMN3aTez AXA Insurance Pte Ltd 02/07/2015-01/07/2016 6335 7288
Thank You.

The images provided to you ara taken from the original reperts forwarded to the centra by the members of the General Insurance Association of

Singapore and we take no responsibility for their accuracy or contents and shall be under no fiability whatsosver for any loss or damage arising out of

or in connection with the reports or their imagas.

5 Is 8 computer generated document and requires no signatura.

hitps://singapare.merimen.com/clalmsindex ofm2fusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=d sp_geninvip&refid=15009558 CFID=2185508BACFTOKEN=12c. .
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02512017 Invoice

? GENERAL INSURANCE ASSOCIATION OF SINGAPORE

RECORDS MANAGEMENT CENTRE
GENERAL 6 Raffles Quay #18-00, Singapore 048580

INSURANCE Phone: +65 6224 0010 Fax: +65 6224 0030

ASSOCIATION Gperating_ ch_rs: Manday to Friday 9am to Spm
REEDRDE MANAGEMENT CENTRE GST Registration Mo: M400017735

TAX INVOICE
QOur Ref No: GR-17-142407
Date of Requast: 25/09/2017 Your Ref No: Online Purchase
LKEK Auto Consultants Fle Lid
51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25
Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933
Dear SirfMadam,
Enquiry Date 25/09/2017
Snquiry By CHEW HSIAD TONG
2 Vahicle Na, SGMN3BT2Z
Accident Date 071212015
DESCRIPTION AMOUNT (5%)
TP Insurer Enguiry 1.87
GST Amount 013
Total Amount Due [GST Inclusive) 2.00
Thank You,
Thiz is a computer generated document and requires no signature.
For GIARMC Official use:
Date:
(%] GIRO [] Cash [ ] Cheque
hitps:/fsingapore. merimen com/claimsindex efmfusebox=MTRsas&fuseaction=dsp geninviplrefid=1550056&0F [0=71555868ACFTOKEN =126, 2i2



