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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com>

Sent: Monday, 26 February, 2018 4:42 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: Chloe; Jas Khine (LKKAuto); Admin A; Olivia Lau (LKKAuto)

Subject: Re: SGK9405R CLAIMING SCW1336T DOA 28.11.15

Hi Vic 

Please advice your offer and revert for close case,thanks. 
 

 
 
 

Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet. Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
 
On Wed, Jan 24, 2018 at 3:34 PM, Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote: 
Hi Vic 

Please advice your offer and revert for close case. 

Your reply much appreciated. 
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Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet. Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
 
On Mon, Jan 8, 2018 at 5:02 PM, Admin nht <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote: 
Hi Vic 

Please advice your offer and revert for close case. 

Your reply much appreciated. 
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pictures.  To  
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Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet. Right-click here to download pictures.  To help protect your privacy, Outlook prevented automatic download of this picture from the Internet.

 
 
On Mon, Oct 9, 2017 at 2:16 PM, Admin . <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote: 

Hi Vic 

Please advice your offer and revert for close case. 

You're reply much appreciated. 

  

On June 12, 2017 at 10:46 AM "Admin ." <admin@nhtmotor.com> wrote: 

Hi Vic 

Please advice and revert. 
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You're reply much appreciated. 

Thanks & Regards 

Sukyi 
新福德新福德新福德新福德车厂 

NEW HOCK OCK OCK OCK TECK MOTOR WORKSHOPHOPHOPHOP 

1 Kaki Bukit Avenue 6, #01-43 Block C @ Autobay, Singapore 417883 

 T T T T : 6747 9241| FFFF : 6741 7276 

On June 1, 2017 at 7:52 AM Chloe <chloe@nhtmotor.com> wrote: 

Dear Vic,  
 
This case has been idling for more than 1 year, emailed out on the February 
2016 from Lily. 
However, I think you may have overlooked it. 
Enclosed LOD and supporting documents for your reference. 
We are asking for:  
 
Cost of Repair - $3210 
Loss of Use - $300 
LTA - $5.35 
Total - $3515.35 
 
Hope to receive your offer soon. 
Thank you. 
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