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Re: 13/08/2015; Our ref: AAD1508-153 & Veh No :-SHD 943M *Your Ref:
CC3/III15013900/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 6194Z & SHD 943M]

Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>
Wed 30/6/2021 11:50 AM
To:  jasminetan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>
Cc:  Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Without Prejudice

Hi Jasmine,

We refer to your below email.

We have appealed your matter to our principal for further review. However, we regret to inform you that we
have our principal to maintain rejection as your client had a stop line and was coming out of minor road. 
Hence your client should have exercised caution and should give way to the vehicles on the main road.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 29 June 2021 10:10 AM

To: jasminetan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: Re: 13/08/2015; Our ref: AAD1508-153 & Veh No :-SHD 943M *Your Ref: CC3/III15013900/Kpa3
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 6194Z & SHD 943M]
 
Without Prejudice

Dear Jasmine,

We are seeking instruction from III and will get back to you.

Thank you.

“Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of

resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be

deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.
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In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the

issues of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement.”

Note: We are on work from home arrangement. All correspondence should be made via email. Submission
of claim related documents will be in softcopy. Any inconvenience caused is much regretted. 
 
Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Phone: 6742 3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741 4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: jasminetan <jasminetan@transcab.com.sg>

Sent: Friday, 25 June 2021 11:35 AM

To: Hsiao Tong (LKKAuto) <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Claims <claims@transcab.com.sg>

Subject: 13/08/2015; Our ref: AAD1508-153 & Veh No :-SHD 943M *Your Ref: CC3/III15013900/Kpa3
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 6194Z & SHD 943M]
 
Without Prejudice
 
Final Reminder
 
Dear Hsiao Tong
 
Please refer to our email dated 7 October 2015.
Please refer to the video footage for your re-consideration. 
Kindly let us have the offer within the next 5 working day otherwise we shall proceed to hand over to
our solicitor to conduct the matter.
 
Thank you.
 
 
Regards
Jasmine Tan
25.6.2021
 
From: tzeyong.lui [mailto:tzeyong.lui@transcabservices.com.sg] 

Sent: Wednesday, 7 October 2015 2:24 PM

To: 'Hsiao Tong' <chewht@lkkauto.com>

Cc: 'jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg' <jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg>;
'zhewei.kek@transcabservices.com.sg' <zhewei.kek@transcabservices.com.sg>;
'claims@transcabservices.com.sg' <claims@transcabservices.com.sg>

Subject: RE: 13/08/2015; Our ref: AAD1508-153 & Veh No :-SHD 943M *Your Ref: CC3/III15013900/Kpa3
[ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 6194Z & SHD 943M]
 
Dear Hsiao Tong,
 
Kindly convey to your principal –India Ins. to withdraw this deny liability for this case.
 
We have attached the video clip for you to investigate this matter and to review this case again.
 
You can see our taxi driver turned out from China Town Point complex pick-up exit out and did not hit onto the
Silver Cab SHC6194Z.   
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While our Trans Cab Taxi SHD943M already at the extreme left lane (ie the dotted bus lane ) traveling straight
at that position and behind the SBS Transit Bus;
the silver cab (SHC6194Z) just cut suddenly into the extreme left lane without due consideration and collided
on the front right portion of our transcab taxi SHD943M
in which our taxi is already traveling straight and behind the SBS Transit bus.
 
My opinion is that the silver Cab is held full responsible for this accident without due consideration of others
road user.
 
Kindly request your principle insurer (ie. India Insurer) to review this case again and to with draw the deny
liability and to compensate full damages to us & our taxi driver.
 
We appreciate.
 
Thank you & Best Regards,
 
Lui Tze Yong
TRANS-CAB AUTO SERVICES PTE LTD

(Accounts)  

tzeyong.lui@transcabservices.com.sg
Tel:-66031265 Ext.232
 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com] 

Sent: Wednesday, October 07, 2015 10:46 AM

To: 'JasmineTan' (jasminetan@transcabservices.com.sg); Zhe Wei (zhewei.kek@transcabservices.com.sg);
claims@transcabservices.com.sg

Subject: DOA: 13/08/2015; Your ref: SHD 943M *Our Ref: CC3/III15013900/Kpa3 [ACCIDENT INVOLVING
SHC 6194Z & SHD 943M]
 
Your ref: SHD 943M                                       WITHOUT PREJUDICE
Our Ref: CC3/III15013900/Kpa3
 
Dear Sir/Madam,
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SHC 6194Z & SHD 943M ON 13/08/2015
 
We refer to the above matter.
 
Our insured driver has reiterated that the accident was caused due to the entire negligence of your client. Your
client turned out from minor road and hit onto our insured who was driving on main road. We are of the opinion
that your client should exercise greater caution while turning out from minor road.
 
Under such a circumstances, we have our principal instruction to deny liability and unable to look into your
client’s claim.

 

 

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)
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