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Thin Thin (LKKAuto)

From: Thin Thin (LKKAuto)
Sent: Monday, 18 June 2018 8:48 PM
To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina
Cc: PRDSG.DFILE; Admin A; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto); KKLau
Subject: RE: #7851370788SG#027#PD claim_SHD9749Z DOA; 19/04/2015 *** LKK REF: 

CC3/AIG15007002/Kua3 

Dear Sir / Madam, 
 
We refer to the below matter. 
 
Please be inform that we have offered 50% liability to TP. 
   
TP’s repairer did not submit the LOD until now. In view of no further development, we will proceed to temporary close 
the file and submit the report to your office. 
 
If any new development in future, we will keep you informed for an update and follow up the matter accordingly. 
 
Thank you, 
 
 
Best Regards, 
 
Thin Thin Hlaing | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2360 | email: thinthin@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 
 

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)  
Sent: Monday, 21 May 2018 3:48 PM 
To: Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina <MimiZarina.DallyAmri@aig.com>; Thin Thin (LKKAuto) <thinthin@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: PRDSG.DFILE <PRDSG.DFILE@aig.com>; Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>; Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) 
<vivianlau@lkkauto.com> 
Subject: RE: #7851370788SG#027#PD claim_SHD9749Z DOA; 19/04/2015 *** LKK REF: CC3/AIG15007002/Kua3  
 
Dear Sir / Madam,  

Thank you for your email.  
   
Please note that: -  
  
LKK ref Officer in charge 
CC3/AIG15007002/Kua3 Thin Thin – 6841 2360 

 
Our respective case handler will look into the matter and revert to you in due course. 
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To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned. 
 
Thank you. 

Best Regards, 

Mei Kwan | Admin  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

From: Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina [mailto:MimiZarina.DallyAmri@aig.com]  
Sent: Monday, 21 May, 2018 11:07 AM 
To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: PRDSG.DFILE <PRDSG.DFILE@aig.com> 
Subject: #7851370788SG#027#PD claim_SHD9749Z DOA; 19/04/2015 
 
Dear LKK 
 
We would like to acquire progress and updates of this case as it is still not close for quite some time. 
 
Thank you. 
 
 
Regards, 

 
Mimi Zarina @ Mimi 
AIG 
Express Claims Adjuster 
Claims Operations | AIG Shared Services 
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