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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Vic (LKKAuto)

Sent: Monday, 1 October, 2018 11:47 AM

To: Sundari Nagarajan - III

Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKKAuto); Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: <SEEK MANDATE> RE: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN LKK Ref:

CC3/III15006898/Kha3 Accident on 22.04.2015 involving SHD3013C 

(India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23

Attachments: LKK INSPECTION REPORT.pdf; LKK ADJUSTMENT REPORT.pdf; LKK INSPECTION 

PHOTOS.pdf; TP LOD.pdf; SHD9586B DOA 22.04.15.wmv

PODS – Express Settlements 
 

PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN;   LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kha3  Accident on 22.04.2015 involving SHD 3013C 

(India) and SHD 9586B(TP) along/at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 

Dear Sundari, 

 

We refer further to our below email. 

 

Please be informed that we had just received TP LOD and we advise our recommendation as follows:  

 

(a)    Liability                               : 100%  

(b)   Quantum 

COR(w/gst)                        : $ 1,765.50 

LOR                                        : $    226.84 ($113.42  x 2 Days) 

LOI                                         : $       80.00 ($40 x 2 Days) 

TOTAL                                   : $ 2,072.34 

Veh Model                         : Chevrolet Epica 1991cc  (Taxi) 

 

       (c)    Remarks                              : BOLA NIL – both turning at junction but TP insisted based on footage (as 

attached) that their client was within its lane while turning 

 

For your approval / mandate / instructions, if any.  

 

Thank you. 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This e-mail contain confidential and privileged material, and are for the sole use of the intended recipient. Use or distribution by an 
unintended recipient is prohibited, and may be a violation of law. If you believe that you received this e-mail in error, please do not 
read this e-mail or any attached items. Please delete the e-mail and all attachments, including any copies thereof, and inform the 
sender that you have deleted the e-mail, all attachments and any copies thereof. Thank you. 
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From: Vic  

Sent: Thursday, 25 June, 2015 9:06 AM 

To: Sundari Nagarajan - III 

Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Kathy Lai; Vic 

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 

involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 
Dear Ms Sundari, 

 

Noted and I received the latest mandate at 50% liability. I replied on the wrong email. 

 

Thank you. 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

 

From: Sundari Nagarajan - III [mailto:sundari@iii.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 25 June, 2015 9:05 AM 

To: Vic 
Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Kathy Lai 

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 

involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 
Dear Sir 

 

We refer to your email below.   Please note that our approval is for 50% liability as per our email attached. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Sundari Nagarajan  

 

From: Vic [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, 25 June, 2015 8:55 AM 

To: Sundari Nagarajan - III 
Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Kathy Lai; Vic 

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 

involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 
Dear Ms Sundari, 

 

We refer to your below email and the contents were noted. 

 

Thank you. 
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Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessarSave the Earth. Print only when necessarSave the Earth. Print only when necessarSave the Earth. Print only when necessary.y.y.y. 

 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

 

From: Sundari Nagarajan - III [mailto:sundari@iii.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 25 June, 2015 8:46 AM 

To: Vic 
Cc: Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Kathy Lai 

Subject: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 
involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 
Dear Sir 

 

We refer to your email below.   We agree to settle the SHD9586B’s property damage claim at 100% liability. 

 

Best Regards,  

 

Sundari Nagarajan  

 

DID: 63476071  

From: Vic [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, 24 June, 2015 5:39 PM 

To: Sundari Nagarajan - III 
Cc: Motor Claim - III; Admin A; Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Kathy Lai; Vic 

Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 
involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 
Dear Ms Sundari, 

 

We refer to our below email. 

 

Kindly advise. 

 

Thank you. 

 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 
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This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the 

sender immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

 

From: Vic  

Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2015 12:31 PM 

To: Sundari Nagarajan - III 

Cc: Motor Claim - III; Admin-A (LKK Auto); Mei Kwan (LKK Auto); Kathy Lai; Vic 
Subject: RE: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 

involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 

PODS – Express Settlements 

 

PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 

involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 

 

Dear Ms Sundari, 

 

We advise liability as follows for Direct Settlement: 

 

Liability                                                  : __50%__ (e.g. 50% or 100%) 

 

Officer-In-Charge Mandate                : _________ (e.g. agree or disagree) 

 

Remarks                                                 : BOLA NIL (Conflicting of versions pending evidence from both parties) 

 
 

 
Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh  

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

 

 

From: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)  

Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2015 12:24 PM 
To: Vic 

Subject: FW: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 
involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 

 
 

 

From: Motor Claim - III [mailto:motorclaim@iii.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 24 April, 2015 10:06 AM 

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) 

Cc: Sundari Nagarajan - III 

Subject: FW: PODS III Ref: MCT15040793/01/SN (TBA) LKK Ref: CC3/III15006898/Kra3 Accident on 22.04.2015 

involving SHD3013C (India) and SHD9586B (TP) Along/ at Bukit Batok Street 23 
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You have received a secure message  

  
Read your secure message by opening the attachment, securedoc.html. You will be 
prompted to open (view) the file or save (download) it to your computer. For best results, save 
the file first, then open it in a Web browser. To access from a mobile device, forward this 
message to mobile@res.cisco.com to receive a mobile login URL.  
 
If you have concerns about the validity of this message, contact the sender directly.  

First time users - will need to register after opening the attachment. For more information, 

click the following Help link.  
Help - https://res.cisco.com/websafe/help?topic=RegEnvelope 
About Cisco Registered Email Service - https://res.cisco.com/websafe/about  

  
 

 

DISCLAIMER: 

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.  

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.  

Registration No. 198703792-K 

DISCLAIMER: 

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.  

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.  

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached  

you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby  

notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination  

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful. 

Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be  

intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.  

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this  

message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission  

or any modification.  

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.  

India International Insurance Pte Ltd.  

Registration No. 198703792-K 


