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Celine Fong (LKKAuto)

From: Celine Fong (LKKAuto)
Sent: Wednesday, 18 January 2023 3:02 PM
To: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto); Woody Woo; Taufikh (LKKAuto)
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; Jason Sim; felicia@hnplaw.com; law1

@hnplaw.com; Accounts (LKK Auto)
Subject: RE: SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - 

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 
20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- Muhammad Munzir]

Attachments: MSG_LKKInvoice_AC2300400.pdf

Dear Woody, 
 
Apologise, we are unable to apply GST 7% for current invoices.  
 
Please see attached invoice of $400.00 plus GST. 
 
 
Best Regards, 
Celine Fong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
phone: 6256-3561 | email: celinefong@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 
#02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 
Sent: Tuesday, 10 January 2023 11:07 AM 
To: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com>; Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Celine Fong 
(LKKAuto) <celinefong@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; Jason Sim <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com>; felicia@hnplaw.com; 
law1@hnplaw.com 
Subject: RE: SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- Muhammad 
Munzir] 
 
Dear Woody, 
 
Thank you for the email. 
 
Dear Celine, 
 
FYNA. 
 
Best Regards, 
Shiau Chan (Ms) | Case Handler 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: siewsc@lkkauto.com | fax: 6256-4315 Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 
#02-25 | S(408933) 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Sent: Monday, 9 January 2023 8:57 AM 
To: Taufikh (LKKAuto) <Taufikh@lkkauto.com>; Shiau Chan (LKKAuto) <siewsc@lkkauto.com> 
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Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; Jason Sim <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com>; felicia@hnplaw.com; 
law1@hnplaw.com 
Subject: SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT INVOLVING 
SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- Muhammad 
Munzir] 
 
Dear Shiau Chan 
 
As the case is concluded, please let us have the bill for Taufikh's help on the case. 
 
It includes: 
 
26 Dec 2019 (10am till 12pm) at MSIG for meeting and attended trial and testified before the Court via zoom 
application on 14 April 2021, from 2pm to 4pm. 
 
In view there is no travelling to Malaysia, please advise if your fee can be charged at $400 based on a half day for the 
meeting and Zoom Session? 
 
You may include the transportation fee to our office as well. 
 
As the service is in 2019 and 2021, please bill us using 7% if possible. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
Woody Woo 
 
Executive, Claims Services (Motor) 
D: +65 6012 1353 | woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com  
 
Please note my direct line has changed. 
 
 
 
 
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6827 7888  | 
Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg            
 
 
 
 Join our mission in protecting our planet, please consider the environment before you print. 
 
 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of 
this e-mail to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that 
attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do 
not copy, distribute or disclose its contents. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Woody Woo 
Sent: Thursday, 2 September 2021 9:38 AM 
To: law1@hnplaw.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com 
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; Jason Sim <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com>; felicia@hnplaw.com 



3

Subject: RE: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- 
Muhammad Munzir] 
 
Dear Felicia 
 
Thank you 
 
 
Aside to Taufikh 
 
Thank you for your assist on the case, please let us have the bill for the assist on case. 
 
I understand that there was a meet up on 26 Dec 2019 (10am till 12pm) in MSIG, attended trial and testified before 
the Court via zoom application on 14 April 2021, from 2pm to 4pm. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
 
 
 
 ᏑᏒᏓᏔᏕᏖ Visits to our offices are by appointments only. To schedule an appointment with us, please email us at 
service@sg.msig-asia.com at least 2 working days in advance. Please check our website or official Facebook page for 
the latest updates.   
 
We wish to assure you that we remain fully committed to serving you and will continue to operate to support your 
essential insurance needs.  
 
Please bear with us should there be some service delay during this period.  
 
Woody Woo 
Executive, Claims Services (Motor) 
D: +65 6594 2564 |F: +65 6225 7402 | woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com  
 
 
 
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6827 7888 | F: 
+65 6827 7800 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg            
 
 
 
 
 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of 
this e-mail to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that 
attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do 
not copy, distribute or disclose its contents. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: law1@hnplaw.com <law1@hnplaw.com> 
Sent: Wednesday, 1 September 2021 2:54 PM 
To: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com> 
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Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com; Jason Sim <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com>; 
felicia@hnplaw.com 
Subject: RE: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- 
Muhammad Munzir] 
 
EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s). 
 
 
Dear Woody, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Upon our review on the Notes of Proceeding, kindly be informed that Mr Mohamad Taufikh has attended trial and 
testified before the Court via zoom application on 14 April 2021, from 2pm to 4pm. 
 
Hope it clarifies. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
Tan Keng Yi, Alvin 
Messrs Ho-Noecker & Pragasam 
Advocates & Solicitors 
Level 2, No 104A Jalan SS 21 / 39 
Damansara Utama 
47400 Petaling Jaya 
Selangor 
MALAYSIA 
Tel : +603 7728 0855 
Fax : +603 7728 3855 
Website: https://protect2.fireeye.com/v1/url?k=b59290a3-ea09a855-b5959cf6-8627ced94d24-
7ce242d7135097ba&q=1&e=77cfe148-bcfa-482d-90a0-74b1eace0622&u=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.hnplaw.com%2F 
Please consider the environmental impact before printing emails. 
The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any 
action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you 
received this in error, please contact the sender and delete the material from the computer. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: felicia@hnplaw.com <felicia@hnplaw.com> 
Sent: Monday, August 30, 2021 11:32 AM 
To: 'Woody Woo' <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com>; law1@hnplaw.com 
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com; 'Jason Sim' <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Subject: RE: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- 
Muhammad Munzir] 
 
Dear Woody 
 
Our team will check the Notes of Proceedings and revert. 
 
Best Regards 
Felicia Ho 
Messrs Ho-Noecker & Pragasam 
Advocates & Solicitors 
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Level 2, No 104A Jalan SS 21 / 39 
Damansara Utama 
47400 Petaling Jaya 
Selangor 
MALAYSIA 
Tel : +603 7728 0855 
Fax : +603 7728 3855 
Mobile : +6019 266 2298 
Website: https://protect2.fireeye.com/v1/url?k=f197271f-ae0c1fe9-f1902b4a-8627ced94d24-
e24ce6b803b8c585&q=1&e=77cfe148-bcfa-482d-90a0-74b1eace0622&u=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.hnplaw.com%2F 
Please consider the environmental impact before printing emails. 
The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any 
action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you 
received this in error, please contact the sender and delete the material from the computer. 
 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Sent: Monday, 30 August, 2021 11:19 AM 
To: felicia@hnplaw.com; law1@hnplaw.com 
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com; Jason Sim <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Subject: RE: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- 
Muhammad Munzir] 
 
Dear Felicia 
 
Good news indeed. 
 
Let us have the update, once the judgement is enforced and payment is received from MMA Takaful. 
 
We need to know the dates and duration that Mr Taufikh has assisted us, so that we can inform LKK to let us have 
the bill. 
 
Appreciate the information after as well. 
 
Good Job everyone. 
 
Thank you 
 
 
 ᏑᏒᏓᏔᏕᏖ Visits to our offices are by appointments only. To schedule an appointment with us, please email us at 
service@sg.msig-asia.com at least 2 working days in advance. Please check our website or official Facebook page for 
the latest updates. 
 
We wish to assure you that we remain fully committed to serving you and will continue to operate to support your 
essential insurance needs. 
 
Please bear with us should there be some service delay during this period. 
 
Woody Woo 
Executive, Claims Services (Motor) 
D: +65 6594 2564 |F: +65 6225 7402 | woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com 
 



6

 
 
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6827 7888 | F: 
+65 6827 7800 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg 
 
 
 
 
 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of 
this e-mail to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that 
attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do 
not copy, distribute or disclose its contents. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: felicia@hnplaw.com <felicia@hnplaw.com> 
Sent: Monday, 30 August 2021 11:02 AM 
To: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com>; law1@hnplaw.com 
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com; Jason Sim <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Subject: RE: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- 
Muhammad Munzir] 
 
EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s). 
 
 
Dear Woody 
 
Reference is made to the above matter which was fixed for Decision yesterday. 
 
As informed via whatsapp yesterday, we are pleased to inform you that upon hearing testimony from witnesses and 
taking into account evidence tendered and upon reading submissions from all parties, the Court allowed our claim 
and held that the Defendant is 100% liable for the accident.  The Judge allowed our claim for the sum of 
RM51,639.56 with interest and costs according to scale. 
 
We will proceed to draft judgment and order and proceed with recovery once the judgment and order are sealed by 
the Court. 
 
Well done everyone!! 
 
Best Regards 
Felicia Ho 
Messrs Ho-Noecker & Pragasam 
Advocates & Solicitors 
Level 2, No 104A Jalan SS 21 / 39 
Damansara Utama 
47400 Petaling Jaya 
Selangor 
MALAYSIA 
Tel : +603 7728 0855 
Fax : +603 7728 3855 
Mobile : +6019 266 2298 
Website: https://protect2.fireeye.com/v1/url?k=592c7722-06b74ff6-592b7b77-8680d8d86cc5-
7b43aa570d04d202&q=1&e=adee1f3b-a9a9-41f5-82f1-0013d216c767&u=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.hnplaw.com%2F 
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Please consider the environmental impact before printing emails. 
The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any 
action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you 
received this in error, please contact the sender and delete the material from the computer. 
 
 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Sent: Friday, 6 August, 2021 2:52 PM 
To: law1@hnplaw.com 
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; felicia@hnplaw.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com; Jason Sim 
<Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Subject: RE: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- 
Muhammad Munzir] 
 
Dear Alvin 
 
Noted, 
 
Thank you 
 
 
 ᏑᏒᏓᏔᏕᏖ Visits to our offices are by appointments only. To schedule an appointment with us, please email us at 
service@sg.msig-asia.com at least 2 working days in advance. Please check our website or official Facebook page for 
the latest updates. 
 
We wish to assure you that we remain fully committed to serving you and will continue to operate to support your 
essential insurance needs. 
 
Please bear with us should there be some service delay during this period. 
 
Woody Woo 
Executive, Claims Services (Motor) 
D: +65 6594 2564 |F: +65 6225 7402 | woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com 
 
 
 
MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6827 7888 | F: 
+65 6827 7800 | Co. Reg. No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg 
 
 
 
 
 
 
CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that is privileged or confidential. The sending of 
this e-mail to any person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the privilege or confidentiality that 
attaches to it. If you are not the intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the email and do 
not copy, distribute or disclose its contents. 
 
-----Original Message----- 
From: law1@hnplaw.com <law1@hnplaw.com> 
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Sent: Friday, 6 August 2021 2:38 PM 
To: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Cc: lit1@hnplaw.com; jane@hnplaw.com; felicia@hnplaw.com; taufikh@lkkauto.com; Jason Sim 
<Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com> 
Subject: Re: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT 
INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v- 
Muhammad Munzir] 
 
EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any attachment(s). 
 
 
Dear Woody, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
The attached documents are: 
1. A copy of Submission to reply to the Defendant's earlier submission after trial; and 2. A copy of Bundle of 
Authorities to support our submission. 
 
The attached documents are for your file record purpose. 
 
Hope it clarifies. 
 
Thank you. 
 
Best Regards 
Tan Keng Yi, Alvin 
Messrs Ho-Noecker & Pragasam 
Advocates & Solicitors 
Level 2, No 104A Jalan SS 21 / 39 
Damansara Utama 
47400 Petaling Jaya 
Selangor 
MALAYSIA 
Tel : +603 7728 0855 
Fax : +603 7728 3855 
Website: https://protect2.fireeye.com/v1/url?k=8292e143-dd09d862-8295ed16-86ea443be490-
4eb5fc869ecc2acc&q=1&e=220cd3d7-c130-4556-8c4c-b2a39801fe17&u=http%3A%2F%2Fwww.hnplaw.com%2F 
Please consider the environmental impact before printing emails. 
The information transmitted is intended only for the person or entity to which it is addressed and may contain 
confidential and/or privileged material. Any review, retransmission, dissemination or other use of, or taking of any 
action in reliance upon, this information by persons or entities other than the intended recipient is prohibited. If you 
received this in error, please contact the sender and delete the material from the computer. 
 
On 2021-08-06 14:29, Woody Woo wrote: 
> Dear Nini, 
> 
> Please advise what are the attached documents? 
> 
> 1) Writ of Summons 
> 
> 2) ? 
> 
> 
> Thank you 
> 
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> 
>  ᏑᏒᏓᏔᏕᏖ Visits to our offices are by appointments only. To schedule an  
> appointment with us, please email us at service@sg.msig-asia.com at  
> least 2 working days in advance. Please check our website or official  
> Facebook page for the latest updates. 
> 
> We wish to assure you that we remain fully committed to serving you  
> and will continue to operate to support your essential insurance  
> needs. 
> 
> Please bear with us should there be some service delay during this  
> period. 
> 
> Woody Woo 
> Executive, Claims Services (Motor) 
> D: +65 6594 2564 |F: +65 6225 7402 | woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com 
> 
> 
> 
> MSIG Insurance (Singapore) Pte Ltd  4 Shenton Way, #21-01 SGX Centre  
> 2, Singapore 068807 | T: +65 6827 7888 | F: +65 6827 7800 | Co. Reg. 
> No. 200412212G | msig.com.sg 
> 
> 
> 
> 
> 
> 
> CONFIDENTIALITY NOTICE 
> This e-mail (including any attachments) may contain information that  
> is privileged or confidential. The sending of this e-mail to any  
> person other than the intended recipient is not a waiver of the  
> privilege or confidentiality that attaches to it. If you are not the  
> intended recipient, please notify the sender immediately, delete the  
> email and do not copy, distribute or disclose its contents. 
> 
> -----Original Message----- 
> From: lit1@hnplaw.com <lit1@hnplaw.com> 
> Sent: Friday, 6 August 2021 2:03 PM 
> To: Woody Woo <woody_woo@sg.msig-asia.com>; taufikh@lkkauto.com; Jason  
> Sim <Jason_Sim@sg.msig-asia.com> 
> Cc: jane@hnplaw.com; felicia@hnplaw.com; law1@hnplaw.com 
> Subject: RE : SUBROGATION ASSIGNMENT [MSIG REF : 416763] [OUR REF : 
> FH.171454.INS] - ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFR4141J (MSIG), JQJ1826 AND 
> JNU9351 DATED 20/04/2015 - COR + SURVEY FEE [Cycle & Carriage -v-  
> Muhammad Munzir] 
> 
> EXTERNAL EMAIL: Be careful when you click any links or open any  
> attachment(s). 
> 
> 
> Dear All, 
> 
> 
> We refer to the above matter. 
> 
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> We attach herewith the following documents for your information and  
> file records :- 
> 
> 1. "Hujahan Balasan Plaintif" dated 5 August 2021; and 2. "Ikatan  
> Otoriti Plaintif (2)". 
> 
> Thank you. 
> 
> 
> Best Regards, 
> Nini 
> (For and on behalf of Ms. Jane Mary Pragasam / Ms. Felicia Ho) Messrs  
> Ho-Noecker & Pragasam Advocates & Solicitors Level 3, No. 97, Jalan  
> TKS 1, Taman Kajang Sentral, Sentral Business Park, 
> 43000 Kajang, 
> Selangor Darul Ehsan, 
> Malaysia. 
> 
> Tel     :  +603 8736 2855 
> Fax     :  +603 8736 3855 
> Email   :  admin@hnplaw.com 
> 
> 
> On 2021-07-08 11:58, lit1@hnplaw.com wrote: 
> 
>> Dear All, 
>> 
>> We refer to the above matter. 
>> 
>> Please be informed that the Court has vacated the Decision on 8 July 
>> 2021 by way of e-mail. 
>> 
>> Kindly note that the Court has directed for parties to file and serve  
>> the written submissions on or before 22 July 2021 and the submissions  
>> in reply on or before 5 August 2021. 
>> 
>> Please be informed the Court has fixed the Decision on 29 August 2021  
>> before the Magistrate Puan Norhabsarina Binti Ayob. 
>> 
>> We shall attend to the necessary and keep you informed of any  
>> developments. 
>> 
>> Thank you. 
>> 
>> Best Regards, 
>> Nini 
>> (For and on behalf of Ms. Jane Mary Pragasam / Ms. Felicia Ho) Messrs  
>> Ho-Noecker & Pragasam Advocates & Solicitors Level 3, No. 97, Jalan  
>> TKS 1, Taman Kajang Sentral, Sentral Business Park, 
>> 43000 Kajang, 
>> Selangor Darul Ehsan, 
>> Malaysia. 
>> 
>> Tel     :  +603 8736 2855 
>> Fax     :  +603 8736 3855 
>> Email   :  admin@hnplaw.com 
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>> Website : 
>> https://protect2.fireeye.com/v1/url?k=63b7caef-3c2cf3f7-63b0c6ba-865f 
>> 8 
>> 4946d4c-302440d2126ce22f&q=1&e=2ab55735-61e0-4d68-89af-0594fb9196ec&u 
>> = 
>> http%3A%2F%2Fwww.hnplaw.com%2F 
 


