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Hsiao Tong

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Monday, 27 July, 2015 1:47 PM

To: 'Ling Leong Hui'

Subject: RE: Your Ref: LLH/ing/1296/0515/WLC *Our Ref: CC2/MIDA15006567/Fp 

[ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20418 & SGD 6555Y ON 14/04/2015]

Attachments: DV_SGD 6555Y.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mr Ling, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the DV enclosed and return to us for our necessary action. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

From: Ling Leong Hui [mailto:lhling@tcmg.com.sg]  

Sent: Friday, 24 July, 2015 2:35 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: LLH/ing/1296/0515/WLC *Our Ref: CC2/MIDA15006567/Fp [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 
20418 & SGD 6555Y ON 14/04/2015] 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE 

 

Dear Mdm, 

 

We refer to the above matter and to your mail dated 23
rd

 July 2015. 

 

For amicable settlement, we have our client’s instructions to accept your offer of the total sum of S$6,312.00 (all-in).

 

Kindly let us have your discharge voucher within the next seven (7) days.  

 

Yours faithfully, 

 

Ling Leong Hui 

TOMMY CHOO MARK GO & PARTNERS  

 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, July 23, 2015 9:39 AM 

To: Ling Leong Hui (lhling@tcmg.com.sg) 
Subject: Your Ref: LLH/ing/1296/0515/WLC *Our Ref: CC2/MIDA15006567/Fp [ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20418 & 

SGD 6555Y ON 14/04/2015] 

 

Your Ref: LLH/ing/1296/0515/WLC 
Our Ref: CC2/MIDA15006567/Fp                               WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
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Dear Sirs, 
 
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 20418 & SGD 6555Y ON 14/04/2015 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Strictly without admission of liability and for quick and amicable settlement, our principal MINDEF is prepared to settle 
your client's claim as follows :- 
 
1. Cost of Repair $ 5,300.00 

2. Loss of Use(7days x $60) $    420.00 

 $ 5,720.00 

@90% $ 5,148.00 

3. Survey Report Fees $    614.00 

4. Cost & Disbursement $    550.00 

Total $ 6,312.00 

 
Please revert. 
 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong Chew | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

 

 

 

 


