Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

From:
Sent:
To:

Cc:
Subject:

Vivian Lau (LKKAuto)

Thursday, 8 March, 2018 8:38 AM

Gabriel Wee; 'motorclaim@iii.com.sg’

Admin A

RE: T Ref: MCT15030642/JC; Accident involving SHD4315A (III) & PA7559P on
16.03.2015

PODS - Express Settlements

PODS III Ref: PA 7559P LKK Ref: CC6/11115004746/Gsa3; Accident on 16.03.2015 involving SHD

4315A (India) and PA 7559P (TP) along LOR 6 TOA PAYOH

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

Be informed that till date TP’s repairer had finalised with our surveyor since 16/03/2015 after inspection .

TP’s repairer did not submit the LOD until now. In view of no further development, we will proceed to
temporary close the file and submit the report to your office.

If any new development in future, we will keep you informed for an update and follow up the matter

accordingly

Thank you

Best Regards,

Vivian Lau| Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6841-8625 | email: Vivianlau@lkkauto.com| fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto)

Sent: Thursday, 8 March, 2018 8:31 AM
To: Vivian Lau (LKKAuto) <vivianlau@lkkauto.com>
Subject: FW: Il Ref: MCT15030642/]C; Accident involving SHD4315A (l11) & PA7559P on 16.03.2015

Importance: High

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.



Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Johnson Chua - lll [mailto:johnson@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Monday, 27 April, 2015 11:00 AM

To: Sharon Yee <sharonyee@Ikkauto.com>; Olivia Lau <olivialau@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: lll Ref: MCT15030642/JC; Accident involving SHD4315A (IIl) & PA7559P on 16.03.2015
Importance: High

Dear Sharon,

Please proceed.

Johhwson Chhna

Motor Claim Department

India International Insurance Pte Ltd
64 Cecil Street #04-02 0B Building
Singapore 049711

Tel: 6347 6128 Fax: 6224 4174
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From: Sharon Yee [mailto:sharonyee@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 21 April, 2015 9:58 AM

To: Johnson Chua - III

Cc: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

Subject: FW: III Ref: TBA; Accident involving SHD4315A (III) & PA7559P on 16.03.2015

PODS - Express Settlements

PODS III Ref: PA 7559P LKK Ref: CC6/11115004746/Gsa3; Accident on 16.03.2015 involving SHD
4315A (India) and PA 7559P (TP) along LOR 6 TOA PAYOH

Dear Johnson,

We advise liability as follows for Direct Settlement:

Liability :__100% _ (e.g. 50% or 100%)
Officer-In-Charge Mandate : (e.g. agree or disagree)
Remarks : OID was making a right turn from Lor 6 Toa Payoh towards Toa Payoh East

and collided with TP (PA 7559P) who was travelling along Lor 6 Toa Payoh. We are in the opinion that
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OID should exercise more cautious when turning. Therefore , BOLA 5 applies. Kindly provide CCTV from
OID if possible.

Thank you

Best Regards,

Sharon Yee | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-4274 | email: sharonyee@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-

4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Olivia Lau

Sent: Monday, 6 April, 2015 9:27 AM

To: Admin A

Cc: Sharon Yee

Subject: FW: III Ref: TBA; Accident involving SHD4315A (III) & PA7559P on 16.03.2015

Dear Admin Support,
Please refer to instructions in attachment.

Our ref: CC6/11115004746/Gsa3

Best Regards,

Olivia Lau | Admin Manager

LKK Auto Consultants

phone: 6256-3561 | email: olivialau@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Johnson Chua - Il [mailto:johnson@iii.com.sg]

Sent: Saturday, 4 April, 2015 7:29 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

Cc: Olivia Lau

Subject: lll Ref: TBA; Accident involving SHD4315A (Ill) & PA7559P on 16.03.2015

You have received a secure message

Read your secure message by opening the attachment, securedoc.html. You will be
prompted to open (view) the file or save (download) it to your computer. For best results, save
the file first, then open it in a Web browser. To access from a mobile device, forward this
message to mobile@res.cisco.com to receive a mobile login URL.
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If you have concerns about the validity of this message, contact the sender directly.

First time users - will need to register after opening the attachment. For more information,
click the following Help link.
Help - https://res.cisco.com/websafe/help?topic=RegEnvelope

About Cisco Registered Email Service - https://res.cisco.com/websafe/about

DISCLAIMER:

This email is intended solely for the person to whom it has been addressed.

It may contain confidential and/or legally privileged information.

If you are not the person for whom this e-mail was intended, or if this e-mail has reached
you by mistake, please delete it immediately and inform us of the error and also be hereby
notified that any use, distribution, transmission, printing, copying or dissemination

of this information in any way or in any manner is strictly prohibited and may be unlawful.
Internet communications may not be entirely secure or accurate as information could be
intercepted, corrupted, lost, delayed or contain viruses.

Therefore, we do not accept liability for any errors or omissions in the content of this
message or any delay in delivery which may arise as a result of Internet transmission

or any modification.

Print this email only if it is absolutely necessary and help in preservation of environment.
India International Insurance Pte Ltd.

Registration No. 198703792-K



