Admin-A (LKK Auto)

From: Admin-A (LKK Auto)

Sent: Monday, 16 March, 2015 1:06 PM

To: 'Jacy Goh Lay Ting'

Cc: Ruth Chua; KKLau; Kathy Lai; Vic

Subject: RE: WP / RICARDO AUTO / P1566338 / OD-SFU3331T / TP-SKC309P / 25.02.15 /
EST-$1228.46 / NO-X'S / RC

Attachments: TP ESTIMATE.pdf; TP GIA REPORT.pdf; Preliminary Advice - SKC 309P.pdf

Dear Jacy / Ruth,

Enclosed revert of vehicle: SKC 309P
Date of survey : 02/03/2015
Number of days: 7-8 Days

We have not authorized repairs.

Kindly advise whether we can proceed for direct settlement for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Su Li | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6256-3561 | email: admin-a@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Jacy Goh Lay Ting [mailto:jacy.goh@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Friday, 27 February, 2015 3:55 PM

To: assignments; Celine Fong; SUR

Cc: Ruth Chua; Tan Chia Ling (PSC); pinglin.chang@axa.com.my; Ong Eng Hong (PSC); Lee Ling Ling (PSC)
Subject: WP / RICARDO AUTO / P1566338 / OD-SFU3331T / TP-SKC309P / 25.02.15 / EST-$1228.46 / NO-X'S / RC

RISK1 —P1566338

CLAIM RECEIVED ON 26.02.2015

YL5571B -> SIT5650S -> SFU3331T (INSD) -> SKC309P
VTP

LKK-27.02.2015

NCD-N

CH- RC

Thank you

Jacy Goh

Executive Assistant - Claims Service

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
jacy.goh@axa.com.sq

Customer Care: 1800 8804741 (Press 3)

Website: www.axa.com.sg




M redefining / standards

“This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.”

5% Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Tan Tiong Beng

Sent: Friday, February 27, 2015 8:49 AM

To: Jacy Goh Lay Ting

Subject: FW: Surveyor appoinment for survey 3rd party vehicle SKC309P

From: Grace Tan [mailto:grace@ricardo.com.sg]

Sent: Thursday, February 26, 2015 4:35 PM

To: AXA SGP - Motor Survey

Subject: Re: Surveyor appoinment for survey 3rd party vehicle SKC309P

Hi
Re: Accident involving SKC309P & SFU3331T on 25/02/2015 along PIE

We are instructed by owner of SKC309P to file 3" party claim against SFU3331T which insured under your insurance
company.

Kindly send your surveyor to survey SKC309P at below address without any delay.

Attached repair quotation & GIA report of SKC309P for your perusal.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Grace Tan
Parts & Motor Claims Executive
Ricardo Auto Centre Pte Ltd

Blk 20 Sin Ming Industrial Est. #01-30
Singapore 575678

T:6475 2112

F: 6475 4666

W: www.ricardo.com.sg

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.



