Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

From: Khor Saw Theng <sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg>

Sent: Thursday, 14 May, 2015 11:06 AM

To: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

Cc: Hsiao Tong; Zayyer

Subject: RE: WP (NR & OSP) / Trans-cab Auto / P1562990 / OD FBB1403E / TP SHD963E /
15.01.15 / EST $16,251 / SAW

Attachments: FBB1403E - 150115.pdf; Full page photo.pdf; TP ESTIMATE.PDF; TP GIA

REPORT.PDF; Preliminary Advice.pdf; FileNETImage.tif; ATTO0001.txt

Categories: HMK

Dear Mei Kwan

You may proceed with direct settlement and please study all the related parties’ reports prior to settlement.

KHOR Saw Theng (Ms)

Assistant Manager - Motor Claims

AXA Insurance Singapore Pte Ltd

8 Shenton Way, #27-01 AXA Tower, Singapore 068811
sawtheng.khor@axa.com.sg

Customer Care No. 1800 8804741 Press 3

Website: www.axa.com.sg

We are all born to protect, but for me it's a calling.
Discover our stories on www.borntoprotect.sg
redefining /insurance m

“This message is confidential. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either whole or partial, is
prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender immediately.”

5% Please consider the environment before printing this email

From: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto) [mailto:Meikwan@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, May 14, 2015 10:49 AM

To: Khor Saw Theng

Cc: Tan Tiong Beng; Hsiao Tong; Zayyer

Subject: RE: WP (NR & OSP) / Trans-cab Auto / P1562990 / OD FBB1403E / TP SHD963E / 15.01.15 / EST $16,251 /
SAW

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advice whether we can proceed direct settlement for this case.

Thank you.
Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd



Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Mei Kwan (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 April, 2015 3:46 PM

To: 'Khor Saw Theng'

Cc: Tan Tiong Beng; Hsiao Tong; Zayyer

Subject: RE: WP (NR & OSP) / Trans-cab Auto / P1562990 / OD FBB1403E / TP SHD963E / 15.01.15 / EST $16,251
/ SAW

Dear Saw Theng,
Kindly advice whether we can proceed direct settlement for this case.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 62563561 | email: MeiKwan@Ikkauto.com | fax: 67414108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tan Tiong Beng [mailto:tantiong.beng@axa.com.sg]

Sent: Tuesday, 20 January, 2015 10:11 AM

To: Admin-B (LKK Auto); assignments; SUR

Cc: Khor Saw Theng

Subject: WP (NR & OSP) / Trans-cab Auto / P1562990 / OD FBB1403E / TP SHD963E / 15.01.15 / EST $16,251 / SAW

RISK 1 — P1562990

CLAIM RECEIVED : 19.01.15
FBB1403E (INSD) C/W SHD963E
VTP - $13,000

ASSESSOR - LKK 20.01.15

NCD -Y

SAW 20.01.15

From: Admin-A (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-a@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Monday, January 19, 2015 5:16 PM

To: Winnie Ho Ping Ping; Tan Tiong Beng; Jacy Goh Lay Ting

Cc: KKLau; Hsiao Tong; Rosey Naing; Pauline Yap

Subject: Direct Settlement - Accident Involving FBB1403E (Ol : AXA - TBA) AND SHD963E (TP : LKK REF -
CC3/AXA15001053/T1pa3) on 15.01.2015

WITHOUT PREJUDICE



Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SHD963E at Trans-cab Auto Services Pte Ltd.
Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s GIA report, estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice for your perusal.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Hsiao Tong and she can be contacted at DID: 6742 3197.
Thank You.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
DID: 6366 0055

FAX: 6741 4108

EMAIL: admin-a@lkkauto.com

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by AXA except where provided
for in a written agreement between you and AXA. Any unauthorized disclosure, use or dissemination, either
whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the sender
immediately.



