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Hsiao Tong

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Thursday, 5 February, 2015 9:09 AM

To: 'Ng Mei Yen'

Cc: William Go Shaw Chan

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 

28/10/2014

Attachments: DV_SKP 9940M.pdf

Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mei Yen, 
 
Thank you for your acceptance. 
 
Please duly sign the document enclosed and return the original copy to us for our necessary action. 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Ng Mei Yen [mailto:NgMeiYen@goldbell.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 5 February, 2015 8:39 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong 

Cc: William Go Shaw Chan 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 

Dear Hsio Tong, 

Refer to your email on 04/02/2015, we accept your offer as total $3,289.00. 

 

Thanks and Best Regards, 

  

Mei YenMei YenMei YenMei Yen 

Motor Claims Officer 
Service & Parts Division 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd.  
Motorviva Pte Ltd.  
Tel: +65 6861 0007 
DID: +65 6864 0647 
Fax: +65 6863 0425 
Website: www.goldbell.com.sg  
Industrial Vehicles. 20,000 Served. And Counting 
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From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 4 February, 2015 6:10 PM 

To: Ng Mei Yen 

Cc: William Go Shaw Chan 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 
WITHOUT PREJUDICE 
 
Dear Sirs, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
Without admission of liability, our principal MINDEF is prepared to settle your client’s claim as follows:- 
 
1. Cost of Repair(w/GST) $ 2,889.00 

2. Loss of Use(4days x $100) $    400.00 

Total $ 3,289.00 

 
Please revert. 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 

 

Best Regards, 

Hsiao Tong | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  

From: Ng Mei Yen [mailto:NgMeiYen@goldbell.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 4 December, 2014 10:32 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong 

Cc: William Go Shaw Chan 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

Refer to the above mentioned matter, here attach with the scanned attachment. 

 

Cost of repair                          - $ 2,889.00 ( as agree with your surveyor ) 

Loss of Use                              - $     400.00 ( $100 x 4 days ) 

Total                                              $ 3,289.00 

 

Kindly revert to us as soon as possible. 

 

Thanks and Best Regards, 

  

Mei YenMei YenMei YenMei Yen 

Motor Claims Officer 
Service & Parts Division 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd.  
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Motorviva Pte Ltd.  
Tel: +65 6861 0007 
DID: +65 6864 0647 
Fax: +65 6863 0425 
Website: www.goldbell.com.sg  
Industrial Vehicles. 20,000 Served. And Counting 
 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: 4 December, 2014 9:58 AM 

To: Ng Mei Yen 

Subject: FW: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 
Re-send. 
 

From: Hsiao Tong  

Sent: Wednesday, 3 December, 2014 10:24 AM 

To: Ng Mei Yen (NgMeiYen@goldbell.com.sg) 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear Mei Yen, 
 
As spoken earlier, please refer to the below for your perusal: -  
 
Ministry of Defence 
AFPN HQ-SUPPLY 
Kranji Camp 3 
151 Chua Chu Kang Way 
Block 822, #03-05 
Singapore 688248 
 
Kindly forward all the relevant documents to us for our necessary action. 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 
Best regards, 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Ave 1 
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
(S) 408933 
DID: 6742 3197 
Fax: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 
 

From: Hsiao Tong  
Sent: Thursday, 13 November, 2014 9:28 AM 

To: 'William Go Shaw Chan' 

Cc: Ng Mei Yen; Shawn Ngo Sau Wei 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear William, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
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Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both parties, the liability is clear and shall 
proceed with direct settlement for the above mentioned case. 
 
Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your 
client’s vehicle. 
 
The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident.  
 
And the days of LOU/ LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor. 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 
Best regards, 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Ave 1 
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
(S) 408933 
DID: 6742 3197 
Fax: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 

From: William Go Shaw Chan [mailto:WilliamGoSC@goldbell.com.sg]  
Sent: Tuesday, 11 November, 2014 9:50 AM 

To: Hsiao Tong 

Cc: Ng Mei Yen; Shawn Ngo Sau Wei 
Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

Importance: High 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

 

Kindly advise if you have get your insured report. Can we clear this case liability? 

 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
 

William Go 
Motor Claims Officer 
Service & Parts Division 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd.  
Motorviva Pte Ltd.  
Tel: +65 6861 0007 
DID: +65 6864 0637 
Fax: +65 6863 0425 
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 
Website: www.goldbell.com.sg  
Industrial Vehicles. 20,000 Served. And Counting 
 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, November 3, 2014 9:26 AM 

To: William Go Shaw Chan 

Cc: Ng Mei Yen 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear William, 
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We are currently pending for our insured accident report and shall revert as soon as possible. 
 
Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole intention of resolving 

the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability, whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred 

from this negotiation of terms/settlement. 

 

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially affect/influence on the issues 

of liability/damages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation terms/settlement. 

 
Best regards, 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Ave 1 
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
(S) 408933 
DID: 6742 3197 
Fax: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 

From: William Go Shaw Chan [mailto:WilliamGoSC@goldbell.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 3 November, 2014 9:21 AM 
To: Hsiao Tong 

Cc: Ng Mei Yen 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 

Dear Hsiao Tong, 

 

Any update for the case? 

 
Thanks & Best Regards, 
 

William Go 
Motor Claims Officer 
Service & Parts Division 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd.  
Motorviva Pte Ltd.  
Tel: +65 6861 0007 
DID: +65 6864 0637 
Fax: +65 6863 0425 
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 
Website: www.goldbell.com.sg  
Industrial Vehicles. 20,000 Served. And Counting 
 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, October 30, 2014 5:02 PM 

To: William Go Shaw Chan 

Cc: Ng Mei Yen 

Subject: RE: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 
Without Prejudice 
 
Dear William, 
 
We acknowledge receipt of your email dated 30/10/2014. 
 
We will look into the matter and revert. 
 
Best regards, 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Ave 1 
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#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
(S) 408933 
DID: 6742 3197 
Fax: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
 

From: William Go Shaw Chan [mailto:WilliamGoSC@goldbell.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 30 October, 2014 4:58 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong 
Cc: Ng Mei Yen 

Subject: Accident Involving SDJ7000D/SKP9940M and Your Insured 34322MID on 28/10/2014 

 

Dear Mdm, 

 

Please find the attached GIA report and estimate. We would like to propose for direct settlement with LOU/LOR. 

Kindly advise for the liability. 

Thanks & Best Regards, 

William Go 
Motor Claims Officer 
Service & Parts Division 
Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd.  
Motorviva Pte Ltd.  
Tel: +65 6861 0007 
DID: +65 6864 0637 
Fax: +65 6863 0425 
Mobile: +65 9755 7336 
Website: www.goldbell.com.sg  
Industrial Vehicles. 20,000 Served. And Counting 
 


