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Your Ref: WY 14/15 AF 009
Our Ref: CC2MIDF14020518/T1pq2

25 JAN 2018

AFPN HQ-SUPPLY
Kranji Camp 3

151 Chua Chu Kang Way
Block 822, #03-03
Singapore 688248

Attn  : CPT Kristine Tan/ Ms Ang / Mr Siva

Dear Sir.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES MID 34322 & SKP 9940M(SD.J7000D) ON
28/10/2014

We refer to the above matter.

We have concluded settlement with M/s Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd acting for third party
(DV enclosed).

We have also concluded TCA Recovery for MINDEF from TP insurers M/s AIG Asia Pacific
Insurance Pte Ltd. Enclosed please find the DBS cheque no. 375746 for the 5$850.00/-
payable to PS Defence for your necessary action.

We have completed the claims activities and shall close our file.

Our note of charges is enclosed for your necessary action.

Summary: -
Date of submission: Remarks:
Professional Service Fee Completed. |
Disbursement Fee 19/06/2015 DV from civilian enclosed.
TCA Completed.

Yours faithfully

CM Tong

Claims Section

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com



AlG ASIA PACIFIC INSURANCE PTE. LTD

AIG BUILDING, 78 SHENTON WAY
LINIT 08-16
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PS DEFENCE
cfo LKK Auto Consulftant
_— Bik 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 176746
SINGAPORE 408933
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Payment Details:

& =DBS

Cheque is valid before 20-Jun-18.

Py **PS DEFENCE""

Singapore
Dollars

**Eight Hundred Fifty Only™

u EECURA M3

DB% Bank Ltd

£ hinduii MO EankMranch Cile

Date: 20/12/2017

Bank Reference: 1712207107000102
Customer Reference: TOO0501425
Amount: SGO 850.00
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RELEASE
Claim Ne: 17331989705G-003 Palicy No: -

I'We, MINISTRY OF DEFENSE, hereby agree to accept the sum of (Singapore Doller Bight Hundred & F ivetyj(§
£30.00) to be paid 10 (PS DEFENCE) ix fiall and fina] seftlement of all claims, costs and disbursement arising fom
Personal injury or loss of or demage to property sustained by mefus as a result of an accident invalving SDIT000D &
24322MID along PIE towards Changi on 28/10/2014, Thwe agree that the said sum iz paid with 2 denial of ligbility on
the part of AIG Asia Pacific Insuranze Bie, Ld, being the insurer, insured and the driver ofvehicle No, SDI7000D
respectively, (or any other person or persans) in respect of said loss and for damage whether now or hersafier to
become manifest, and is accepted by me/us to the intent that the said AIG Asia Pecific Insurance Pte, Ltd, and all other
persens be absolutely and fAnally exonerated and discharged from all claims of every nature and kind whatsoever
which Ifwe now or hereafter may have arising out of or connected with or traceable 1o the szid accident. ['We further
stete that the forezoing release has been carefully reed by me/us or has been read to mefus and Liwe imow the contents
thersof and have signed the same as my/our own free and voluntary act and heve ot been influenced in making this
setilement by any representation of te party or parties releaced. I/'We also declare that T am/we are the PeTsOn/persons
entitled to receive the shove compensation and hereby undertake o indemnis ATG Asiz Pacific Insurance Pre, Lid

ageinst any claim made or which may be made in respect ef this eompansation

“This Release does not bind the insured and insured driver of AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd. and is not to
be construed as an admission of liability on their part and shall not be used as evidence in any claims, actions
which may be lodged by them ™

Dated this 6 day of October 2017

WITNESS GLAIM%'N?‘
. 1}
Signature: .9""". __ Signstore: I
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[ATY ; 78EP 2017

TO HETAD TONCG,
Case Handler, LKK Auwie Consullants Pre Lid
Tel: 67423197 / Fux: 6741 4108

FROM : CPT KRISTINE TAN
Hd CE. MSB. HO Supply
Tel: 63074586 / Fax: 63074378

NCY. OF PALGHE : 1

SUBIEC : ACCIDENT INVOLVING MDD 343272 & SKP 9940M
(SDJ 7000D) ON 28/1072(14

Reference: WY 1413 AF G0Y
| refer to your proposal on the above mentioned accident received on U2 Sep 2017.
2) RSAL has no objection with the proposed TCA amount of 850,00/,

3) For vour processing please,

fod-
CPT KRISTINE TAN
HCE. MSHE - EIQ SUPPLY



Hsiao Tnng

Tl T e e EOSRSSTES S AT e e iy
From: Tan, Rachel-M5 <Rachel-MSTan@aig.com>
Sent: Friday, 12 June, 2015 4:03 PM
To: Hsizo Tong
Subject: RE: <TCA CHECK=>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34322 & SKP 9940M(5D) 7000D) ON
28/10/2014

Hi Hsiao Tong

Insured SKPS940M is under comprehensive cover form 11 Qct 2014 till 10 Oct 2015.
The excess under the policy is $1,000/-
Insd didn’t file Own Damage claim.

Rachel Tan

AlG

Complex Claims Examine

Jdaims | AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Lid

AlG Building, 78 Shenton Way, #08-16, Singapore 078120

Tel (65) 6419 3000 | DID (65) 6419 1881 | Fax (65) 6835 7418 | Email address: Rachel-MS. Tan@aia.com

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Thursday, June 11, 2015 3:39 PM

To: Tan, Rachel-M5

Subject: FW: <TCA CHECK>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34322 & SKP 5940M(SD] 70000) ON 28/10/2014

Dear Rachel,
We rafer to the above matter and our email dated 05/02/2015.
Kindly revert.

"ppreciate your kind assistance.

Best Regards,
Hsiao Tong Chew | Case Handler
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, 202-25 | $(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Thursday, 14 May, 2015 9:08 AM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah (Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com)

Subject: RE: <TCA CHECK=ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34322 & SKP 9940M(SD] 7000D) ON 28/10/2014

Dear Sirs/Madam,

We refer to our email dated 05/02/2015.



Kindly revert

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pre Ltd

Phone: 6742-3107 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S5{408933)

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Thursday, 5 February, 2015 9:18 AM

To: Md Noor, Norsiah (Norsiah.MdNoor@aig.com)

Subject: <TCA CHECK>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34322 & SKP 9540M(5DJ 7000D) ON 28/10/2014

Your ref. To be advised
Qur ref: CC2/IMIDF14020518/T1p WITHOUT PREJUDICE

\is AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

Dear Sir,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34322 & SKP 9940M(SDJ 7000D) ON 28/10/2014
We refer to the above matter.

We understand that vehicle SKP 9940M was insured with M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd at the time of
accident,

e would be grateful if you could let us have the following information:-

1 Scope of your cover - Comprehensive | ) Third Party { )
Third Party Injuries ]

2, Excess under your policy: 5%

3, Cost of repair to your insured’s vehicle |

Jppreciate your kind assistance.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Ple Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Pava Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 8{408933)

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient,
you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please
immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or

2



printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other
defect that might affect any computer sysiem into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of
the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International
Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any
way from its use.
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Your Ref: WY 14/15 AF 009
QOur Ref: CC2/MIDF14020518/T1p /

15 JUNE 2015

AFPN HQ-SUPPLY

Kranji Camp 3 /
151 Choa Chu Kang Way
Block 822, #03-05

Singapore 688248

Atin : MSG Manimaran

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 34322 & SKP 9940M(SDJ 7000D) ON 28 OCT 2014
We refer to the above matter.

We have concluded settlement with M/s Goldbell Engineering Pte Ltd acting for third party
(DV enclosed).

We are processing TCA recovery from TP insurer M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
and will close our file upon completion of the recovery/settlement.

Our note of disbursement enclosed for your necessary action.

Yours faithfully

e q
.LJ [ \JAAD

Chew Hsiao Tong

Claims Section

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

E-mail: chewht@lkkauto.com )



DISCHARGE VOUCHER AND INDEMNITY

[/ We, the undersigned CHEW AH GUAN DO HEREBY AGREE to accept the offer by the

Government of the Republic of Singapore (hereinafter referred to as the “Government”) for
the sum of SGD THREE THOUSAND TWO HUNDRED EIGHTY NINE ONLY /
($$3.289.00) in full and final settlement of all claims (Excluding Injury Claim) howsoever

P

arising out of or in connection with the damages caused to my vehicle no. SKP 9940M(SDJ
7000D), in an accident involving Govt, vehicle no. MID 34322 on 28.10.2014.

I hereby authorize you to make payment in favour of GOLDBELL ENGINEERING 4
PTE LTD.

I agree that the payvment is made u.-'iﬁ;mu any admission of lability on the part of the
Government or any agent or servant of the Government, 1 declare that T have no further claim
whatsoever against the Government or any agent or servant of the Government in respeci of
the abovementioned incident and hereby give the Government a full and final discharge in
respect of any liability or liabilities (Excluding Injury Claim) which mayv arise out of the
aforesaid accident.

I also declare that I am the person entitled to receive the above compensation and hereby
undertake to indemnify the Government against any claim made or which may be made by

any person in connection with this martter,

a Y =
Date: 'LI J-Hf YV b
Signature of Claimant (with company stamp if applicable): C:L'JMH
Name of Claimant: _ Q€43 }’S(L'k A -

If the Claimant is a Company or Firm, Name and Designation

Of the person signi thlf of the Company or Firm. Y
EF
Signature of Witn Kt/)e % [ =
WY W
Name and Desi gnatmﬂ 1tness: rL/L" |
¥
~a

CCMIDF14020318/T1p
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408033
TEL: 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607186R GST Reg. No. 15-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automaobile

MINISTRY OF DEFENCE Ref ;. CC2/MIDF14020518/T1pg2
NI
HQ SUPPLY
151 CHOA CHU KANG WAY 18-01-2018
BLK822, #03-05
SINGAFORE 688248
Code:. MIDF
i Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. MID 34322 Veh. Inspected SKP 9940M({SD. 7000D)
Policy No. Coverage (3) 0.00
Claim No., WY 14/15AF009 Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 1111172014
2 Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model TOYOTA CAMRY c.c 2362
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reqg. 2011
Chassis No. MROS53BK4007047325 Colour WHITE
Odometer 132271 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GoCD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
RI/H Front Tyre |215/60 R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/60 R1& MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre [215/60R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/60 R16 MICHELIN & mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S FRONT PORTION.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS,
5. General Information
Accident Date  28/10/2014 Inspection Date 11112014
Survey held at GOLDBELL ENGINEERING FTE LTD
10 TUAS AVE 18
SINGAPORE 6388594
5a. Remarks
A)THE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B)IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR:

4 Working Days
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TEL: 6256 3561 FAX; 6256 4315

Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKP 9940M(SDJ 7000D)

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408533

Fage Mo.:1 of 1

(TO ITS PRE-ACCIDENT CONDITION)

Estimate By | Our Adjusted
Description of Parts Condition
Qty P Workshop ($)) ()
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|FRONT BUMPER DEFORMED 650.00 650.00
1|FRONT BUMPER BRACKET LHS NECESSARY 100.00 100.00
1|FRONT BUMPER SIDE RETAINER LHS NEGESSARY 105.00 105,00
1|FRONT FEMDER LHS BENT TE5.00 T85.00
1['WVTI' EMBLEM NECESSARY 85.00 85.00
1|FRONT WHEEL LINER LHS DEFORMED 265.00 265.00
1|HEADLAMP LHS CRACKED B885.00 985.00
LESS 25% DISCOUNT 74625 74625
2.238.75 223875
SPECIAL NETT ITEMS
1|SUNDRIES (SN} NECESSARY 50.00 30.00
50.00 30.00
LABOQUR
TO REMOWE & REFIX FRONT BUMPER & FRONT FENDER B00.00 500,00
LHS
TO REPLACE HEADLAMP LHS .TO CHECK FOR & 150.00 50.00
RECTIFY WIRING FAULTS .ETC
TO CARRY OQUT WHEEL ALIGNMENT 280.00 80.00
TO PUTTY,CLEAN ,SPRAY PAINT & POLISH ETC 600,00 400.00
REPAIR LH WHEEL RIM 150.00 100.00
1,780.00 1,130.00
GRAND TOTAL 4,068.75 3,398.75
RECOMMENDED COST OF LUMP SUM REFPAIRS 2,700.00

Report Ref No. CC2/MIDF14020518/T1pg2

M .

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH
M.MATAL AMSAE-A

Automotive Assessor

CISCLAIMER OF LIABILITY TO THIRD PARTIES:- This Report is made solely Tor the use and benefit of the Client named on the front page of this Repor,




1 Vdl V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Libi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408333

-_ TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Aeg. Mo: 199607198F GST Reg. No 19-9807188-R

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SKP 9940M(SDJ 7000D)

INSPECTION

DRIVER
DOOR OPEN 9




' Pl 7 4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

r -
#’-.-_!
TEL; 6256 35681 FAX: 6256 4315

Rag. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-9607198-R
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.—l. A ;; 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Indusirial Park, Singapore 408933
/—_‘. TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. No: 198607198R GST Reg. Mo. 19-9607188-R




§ LS LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
it S ;;; 51 Ubi Ave 1#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 403933

e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6266 4315

Reg. No: 19960T198R G5T Reg. No. 19-5607108-R

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SKP 9940M(SDJ 7000D)

REJINSPECTION




