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Vic

From: Vic
Sent: Monday, 4 January, 2016 3:22 PM
To: Jim Zheng
Cc: Admin A; Vic
Subject: RE: Direct Settlement / EM-1 Auto / C0320381 / OD SJV6468K / TP JLX8681 / 24.10.14 / EST : TBA / JZ
Attachments: TP ESTIMATE.pdf; Preliminary Advice.pdf

Dear Jim, 

 

Please be informed that a duly completed pricing of the estimated repair cost that was recently handed to us and our preliminary 

advice is attached herewith for your perusal. 

 

Thank you. 

 

"Wishes�you�a�Happy�New�Year�2016""Wishes�you�a�Happy�New�Year�2016""Wishes�you�a�Happy�New�Year�2016""Wishes�you�a�Happy�New�Year�2016"�
 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh | Case Handler 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.Save the Earth. Print only when necessary. 

 

 

This email may contain confidential and/or privileged information. If you are not the intended recipient (or have received this email in error) please notify the sender 

immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email is strictly forbidden. 

 

From: Tan Tiong Beng [mailto:tantiong.beng@axa.com.sg]  

Sent: Thursday, 30 October, 2014 3:50 PM 

To: Admin-B (LKK Auto); assignments; SUR 
Cc: Jim Zheng; Ivy Yong 

Subject: Direct Settlement / EM-1 Auto / C0320381 / OD SJV6468K / TP JLX8681 / 24.10.14 / EST : TBA / JZ 

 

Dear Ivy, 
 
Pls input VAT in AS400. Thank you. 
 
 

From: Admin-B (LKK Auto) [mailto:admin-b@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, October 30, 2014 2:23 PM 

To: Winnie Ho Ping Ping; Tan Tiong Beng; Jacy Goh Lay Ting 

Cc: 'Kathy Lai'; 'Vic'; 'KKLau' 

Subject: Direct Settlement - Acc Invl SJV 6468K (OI : AXA - TBA) & JLX 8681 (TP : LKK - CC6/AXA14020316/M1h2y3) on 

24.10.2014 

 

Dear Sir/Madam, 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle JLX 8681 AT M/s EM-1 Auto Pte Ltd. 

 

Enclosed herewith a copy of TP’s police report for your perusal. 

 

Please be informed that our estimated cost of repair is not ready yet. 

 

Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action. 
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Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Vic and he can be contacted at DID 6841 2096. 

 

 

 

Thanks & Regards, 

YIN SIEW 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

DID: 6366 0055 

FAX: 6741 4108 

 


