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Your Ref: WY 14/15 AF 006
Our Ref: CC2/MIDF14019492/T1pg2

31 March 2013

AFPN HQ-SUPPLY
Kranji Camp 3

151 Chua Chu Kang Way
Block 822, #03-05
Singapore 688248

Attn  : MSG Manimaran
Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07 OCT 2014
We refer to the above matter,

We have concluded settlement with M/s Wearnes Automotive Pte Ltd acting for third party
(DV enclosed).

We are processing TCA recovery from TP insurer M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd
and will close our file upon completion of the recovery/settlement.

Our note of disbursement enclosed for your necessary action.

Yours faithfully

1\‘. 2 §
Chew Hsiao Tong
Claims Section
DID: 6742 3197
Fax: 6741 4108
E-mail: chewht@lkkauto.com

.



DISCHARGE VOUCHER AND INDEMNITY

1/ We, the undersigned CHAN YING HENG DO HEREBY AGREE 10 accept the offer by

the Government of the Republic of Singapore (hereinafter referred to as the “Government”)
for the sum of SGD SEVEN THOUSAND ONE HUNDRED EIGHTY AND CENTS
SIXTY FIVE ONLY {S‘ST.ISH.ES_} in full and final settlement of all claims (Excluding

Injury Claim) howsoever arising out of or in connection with the damages caused to my
vehicle no. SKP 30770, in an accident involving Govt, vehicle no.MID_41670 on
07.10.2014.

I hereby authorize you to make payment in favour of WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTE
LTD.

I agree that the payment is made without any admission of liability on the part of the
Government or any agent of servant of the Government, [ declare that I have no further claim
whatsoever against the Government or any agent or servant of the Government in respect of
the abovementioned ‘ncident and hereby give the Government a full and final discharge in
respect of any liability or liabilities (Excluding Injury Claim) which may arise out of the
aforesaid accident.

[ also declare that I am the person entitled to receive the above compensation and hereby
undertake o indemnify the Government against any claim made or which may be made by
any person in connection with this matler.

) '|'x

Date: o | -

Signature of Claimant (with company stamp if applicable):
Name of Claimant: Char Thnf PR
If the Claimant is a Company of Firm, Name and Designation

Of the person signing on hehalf of the Company oF Firm.

Signalure of Witness:_~ A 1' l-'“w{-f WA 1 | >

| Vi & T
Name and Designation of Witness: “4—t’3L'“i R U

CC2/MIDF14019492/T1p




Hsiao TunE

From: AMIRTHALINGAM Manimaran <AMIRTHALINGAM_Manimaran@defence.gov.sg>

Sent: Wednesday, 4 February, 2015 5:28 PM

To: Hsiao Tang

Cc: KKLau; WONG_Su_Xin@defence.gov.sg

Subject: RE: <For Your Approval> ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON
07.10.2014 WY 14/15 AF 006]

Good Afternoon Ms Chew,

Please proceed.

_Regards,
Maran

On 2015-02-04 10:50, Hsiao Tong wrote:

Dear MSG Maran,

We refer to our email dated 13/12/2014.

Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction as third party claimant is chasing for it.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong | Case Handler 20415
.—.q.-‘-.‘-.—a.

LEK Auto Consultants Pte Lid

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Tuesday, 27 January, 2015 1:56 PM
To: AMIRTHALINGAM_Manimaran@defence.gov.sg



Cc: WONG_5Su_Xin@defence.gov.sg; KKLau
Subject: RE: <For Your Approval>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07.10.2014 [WY
14/15 AF 006]

Dear MSG Maran,

We refer to our email dated 13/12/2014.

Kindly let us have your approvall instruction.

Best regards,

Chew Hsiao Tong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
(S) 408933

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 67414108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Saturday, 20 December, 2014 11:21 AM

To: AMIRTHALINGAM_Manimaran@defence.gov.sg

Cc: KKLau; WONG_Su_Xin@defence.gov.sg

Subject: RE: <For Your Approval>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07.10.2014 [WY
14/15 AF 006]

Dear MSG Maran,

We refer to cur email dated 13/12/2014

Kindly let us have your approval/ instruction.



“"Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2015"

Best regards,

Chew Hsiao Tong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
(5) 408933

DID: 6742 3197

Fax: 6741 4108

Email; chewht@lkkauto.com

From: Hsiao Tong

Sent: Saturday, 13 December, 2014 12:58 PM

To: AMIRTHALINGAM_Manimaran@defence.gov.sg

Cc: KKLau; WONG_Su_Xin@defence.gov.sg; Zayyer

Subject: <For Your Approval>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07.10.2014 [WY 14/15
AF 006]

Dear MSG Maran (WY 14/15 AF 006)

- The accident occurred when SAF vehicle swerved into civilian's lane and collided onto
L civilian vehicle. As such, SAF driver is at fault.

- We have adjusted claim amount as below;

- For your approval please.

“Your Ref: SKP 3077U “WITHOUT PREJUDICE "

Our ref. CC2/MIDF14018492/T1p

Dear Sirs,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07.10.2014



We refer to the above matter.

Without admission of liability, our principal MINDEF is prepared to settle your client’s claim as follows:-

1. Cost of Repair(w/GST) 36 645,65
2. Loss of Rental (5days x $100)(w/GST) 3 53500

Total $7,180.65

If our offer is acceptable by your client, please duly sign the DV enclosed and return the original copy to us
for our necessary action.”

Best regards,

Chew Hsiao Tong

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Lid
51 Ubi Ave 1

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park
(S) 408933

DID: 5742 3187

Fax: 6741 4108

Email: chewht@lkkauto.com

*** IMPORTANT ANNOUNCEMENT ***

With effect from 16 March 2014, MINDEF/SAF will be changing its
existing domain for all StarNet email accounts from @starnet.gov.sg

to @defence.gov.sg.

A transition period will be catered to ensure a smooth migration.

During this period, emails sent to user@starnet.gov.sg will be
automatically routed to user@defence.gov.sg.

Please take note of the change-over date and update your email
address book accordingly.

WARNING: "Privileged/Confidential information may be contained in this
message. If you are not the intended addressee, you must not copy,
4



distribute or take any action in reliance thereon. Communication of any

information in this email to any unauthorised person is an offence under
the Official Secrets Act (Cap 213). Please notify the sender immediately
if you receive this in error.”



Hsiao TunE

From: Md Noor, Morsiah <MNorsiah.MdNoor@aig.coms

Sent: Thursday, 5 February, 2015 9:55 AM

To: Hsiao Tong

Subject: RE: <TCA CHECK>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07/10/2014

Hi Hsiao Tong,
Please refer as follows:

1 Scope of your cover - Comprehensive { X ) Third Party ( )
Third Party Injuries ( )

2, Excess under your policy: S% 800.00

1 Cost of repair to your insured's vehicle : _ NIL

Morsiah Md Noor

AIG

Claims Service Executive

Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd.
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore 078120

Tel +(65) 8419 1606 | Fax +(B5) 8835 7418

Morsiah MdNoor@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Wednesday, February 04, 2015 5:57 PM

" To: Md Noor, Norsiah

—Subject: <TCA CHECK>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07/10/2014

Your ref. To be advised
Qur ref: CC2/MIDF 14019492/ T1p WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd

Dear Sir,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 41670 & SKP 3077U ON 07/10/2014
We refer to the above matter.

We understand that vehicle SKP 3077U was insured with M/s AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid at the time of
accident.

We would be grateful if you could let us have the following information:-

1 Scope of your cover - Comprehensive ( X ) Third Party ( }
Third Party Injuries ( )

2 Excess under your palicy: S$_800.00



3. Cost of repair to your insured’s vehicle : _ NIL

Appreciate your kind assistance.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong | Case Handler

LEKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408033)

2045
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¥ M RS LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Bmlm BE B 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
- TEL: 6256 3561 FANX: G256 4315

Reg, Mo: 1986071988 GST Reg. No. 19-2607128-A

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

MINISTRY OF DEFENGCE Ref : CC2MIDF14019492/T1pg2
AFPN 1615 |
HQ SUPPLY ]
151 CHOA CHU KANG WAY Date : 30-03-20156
BLK822, #03-05
SINGAPORE 688248

Code : MIDF

Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM

Insured Veh. MID 41670 Veh. Inspected SKP 30770
Policy No. Coverage (5) 0.00
Claim No. WY 1415 AF 006 Excess () 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 28/10/2014
2. Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model VOLVO SB0 c.c 1560
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Req. 2014
Chassis No. ¥V1FSB4ABF 2336668 Colour BLACK
Odometer 5159 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Modification SPORTS RIM
General GOOoD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre |215/55 R16 MICHELIN 6 mm
L/H Front Tyre |215/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
R/H Rear Tyre |[215/55R16 MICHELIN & mm
L/H Rear Tyre |215/55 A16 MICHELIN & mm
4. Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE N/S BODY,
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS.
5. General Information
Accident Date  07/10/2014 Inspection Date 2B/10/2014
Survey held at WEARNES AUTOMOTIVE PTELTD
249 ALEXANDRA ROAD
SINGAPORE 159935
5a. Remarks
AITHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
BJIN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair

ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 5 Working Days




' 74 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
Al mE » 51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
e TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. Mo: 199607198R GET Reg. No. 19-96071088-R Page No.:1of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SKP 3077U
. timate By | Our Adjusted
Q Description of Parts Condition Es
W et Workshop ()] ($)
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1| ALUMINIUM RIM (SN) cuT 1.200.98 1.080.89
1,200.98 1.080.89
LABOUR
TO STRAIGHTEN ,REPAIR AND REPLACE REAR LH 3,200.00 2,400.00
DOOR .REAR LH FENDER ,REAR BUMPER .
TO PUTTY AND SRPAY PAINT ON REAR BUPER ,REAR 2 800.00 2,100.00
LH FENDER,REAR LH DOOR .
TO CHECK WIRING INCLUSIVE OF RESETTING ALL 300,00 300.00
ELECTRICAL MODULES.
COMPUTERISED 4-WHEEL ALIGNMENT. 280.00 280.00
TO REMOVE AND REPLACE RA LH RIM . 50.00 50.00
6,630.00 5,130.00
GRAND TOTAL 7,830.98 6,210.89
RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 6,210.89|

Report Ref No. CC2/MIDF14019492/T1pg2

| i J e’

L)

MOHAMAD TAUFIKH HO LEONG CHUAN

M.MATAI, AMSAE-A Automotive Assessor

Automotive Assessar




' V4 V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

- ar T aF W - 5
i BA B 51 Ubi Ave 1 £01-25 Pays Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
- TEL 6266 3661 FAX: 8266 4315

Reg. Mo 198607198R G5T Reg No. 19-860T1238-R

PHOTOGRAPHS FOR VEHICLE NO. SKP 3077U INSPECTION




'Y Vd V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

I Ubi Ave 1#01.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408833

- TEL 8256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg, No: 199607198R GST Reg. o 18-8607198-R
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51 Ubi Ave 1201.25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park. Singapore 408933
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