Hsiao Tong

From: Sashe Go <sashe.go@income.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 25 January, 2016 3:16 PM

To: Hsiao Tong

Subject: RE: <Potential Recovery>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID46247 & YL9727T ON

18/08/2014 [Our Ref: CC2/MIDA14017777/p]

'WITHOUT PREJUDICE'
Dear Hsiao Tong
We have repudiated the liability to our insured for this accident.

Our repudiation letter will soon follows.

Thank you.

Regards
Sashe Go
Claims Executive, Motor Insurance
T +65 6594 7094

www.income.com.sq

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, January 23, 2016 3:10 PM

To: Sashe Go

Subject: RE: <Potential Recovery>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID46247 & YL9727T ON 18/08/2014 [Our Ref:
CC2/MIDA14017777/p]

Without Prejudice
Dear Sashe,
We refer to your email dated 21.12.2015.

Kindly update and advise.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)



From: Sashe Go [mailto:sashe.go@income.com.sd]

Sent: Monday, 21 December, 2015 4:52 PM

To: Hsiao Tong

Subject: RE: <Potential Recovery>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID46247 & YL9727T ON 18/08/2014 [Our Ref:
CC2/MIDA14017777/p]

'"WITHOUT PREJUDICE'
Dear Hsiao Tong

We are unable to revert as our insured has not reported this accident. We have written to our insured to
report the accident.

Thank you.

Regards

ntec SaShe Go

[nconvE Claims Executive, Motor Insurance

t: (65) 6594 7094 | www.income.com.sg

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named above. If
you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you.

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Saturday, December 19, 2015 10:36 AM

To: mtreg; MTCL@income.com.sg

Subject: <Potential Recovery>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID46247 & YL9727T ON 18/08/2014 [Our Ref:
CC2/MIDA14017777/p]

Your Ref: MT/CA/TP/003/0881961-001/SG/VU
Dear Sirs,
We refer to the above matter.

Kindly revert.

Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Junainah Bte Mohd Alfia [mailto:junainah.mohdalfia@income.com.sg] On Behalf Of MTCL@income.com.sg
Sent: Thursday, 19 November, 2015 11:58 AM

To: Hsiao Tong; mtreg

Cc: KKLau; Olivia Lau; Zayyer

Subject: FW: <Potential Recovery>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID46247 & YL9727T ON 18/08/2014 [Our Ref:
CC2/MIDA14017777/p]

2



Dear Sir/Mdm
Thank you for your email/attachment.

We are forwarding your email to our respective colleague to register the claim.

With Regards

niuc Junainah
1 *| C ’:’{ [-“"l-""l"'“l?- Senior Admin Assistant, Motor Insurance

WWwWWw.income.com.sg

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the recipient(s) named above. If
you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all copies of it. Thank you.

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: November 19, 2015 9:26 AM

To: MTCL@income.com.sg

Cc: KKLau; Olivia Lau; Zayyer

Subject: <Potential Recovery>ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 46247 & YL 9727T ON 18/08/2014 [Our Ref:
CC2/MIDA14017777/p]

Your Ref: To be advised
Our Ref: CC2/MIDA14017777/p WITHOUT PREJUDICE

M/s NTUC Income Insurance Co-operative Ltd

Attn: The Motor Claims Department

Dear Sir,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING MID 46247 & YL 9727T ON 18/08/2014

We have been appointed by MINDEF as claims adjuster to handle all traffic accident claims involving military vehicles
with effect from 01" April 2007.

We are instructed that the accident was caused by your insured’s negligent driving and / or management of his
vehicle. As a result of the accident, our principal’'s vehicle was damaged and our principal has been put to loss and
expense, particulars of which are as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair $ 894.46
2. Loss of Use (1day x $100) $ 100.00
3. LTA/GIA search fee $ 2.00

TOTAL $ 996.46

A copy of the supporting documents is enclosed.

To settle our principal’s claim please forward your cheque made payable to “PS DEFENCE” within 7 working days of
your receipt of this letter.




Best Regards,

Hsiao Tong, Chew | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6742-3197 | email: chewht@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

Disclaimer

This e-mail contains privileged or confidential information which is intended only for the use of the
recipient(s) named above. If you have received this message in error, please notify the sender immediately
and delete all copies of it. Thank you.



