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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Sulaiman Abd Rahman <sulaiman@mbmwheelpower.com.sg>

Sent: Monday, 13 February, 2017 2:38 PM

To: Vic (LKKAuto)

Cc: kenneth@mbmwheelpower.com.sg

Subject: FW: YR REF: SFK36T & OUR REF: SKJ369D DOA 14/07/2014

Hi Vic, 

 

Thanks very much for your explanation over this case, kindly just place it in writing for our Auditor to understand 

better and Get root of this case, why to date till not Seattle. 

 

 

Warm regards. 

 

Thank you 

 

Sulaiman Abd Rahman 

....................................................................  

MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

176, SIN MING DRIVE 

#01-11/14/15/16 

SIN MING AUTO CARE 

SINGAPORE 575721 

 

hp: +65 9328 8668 

tel : +65 6458 3198 

fax : +65 6458 6018 

email:  sulaiman@mbmwheelpower.com.sg  

Find us on Facebook: facebook.com/kbsmotorsports 

Instagram: kbsmotorsports 

 

-----Original Message----- 

From: Vic [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Tuesday, June 21, 2016 10:07 AM 

To: Sulaiman Abd Rahman 

Cc: 'Lim Kelvin'; Chloe; kenneth@mbmwheelpower.com.sg; Admin A; Vic 

Subject: RE: YR REF: SFK36T & OUR REF: SKJ369D DOA 14/07/2014 

 

Without Prejudice 

 

Dear Sulaiman, 

 

We refer to your below email and to our telephone conversation earlier. 

 

As spoken, we are still pending for mandate approval from our principal. 

 

We will follow up and will revert for an update. 

 

Thank you. 

 

Best Regards, 

Vic Alpeh 
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LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6841-2096 | email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 Blk 51, Paya 

Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) Save the Earth. Print 

only when necessary. 

 

________________________________________ 

From: Sulaiman Abd Rahman [sulaiman@mbmwheelpower.com.sg] 

Sent: Thursday, 26 May 2016 11:56 AM 

To: Vic 

Cc: 'Lim Kelvin'; Chloe; kenneth@mbmwheelpower.com.sg 

Subject: YR REF: SFK36T & OUR REF: SKJ369D DOA 14/07/2014 

 

Hi Vic, 

 

I was told you are  the Officer In charge of this particular case. We really 

need to know the status as at today 26/05/2016. 

Our LOD sent to you dated 4/10/2014 with the said amount of $76,364.83/- 

 

Kindly please revert to us soonest, 

 

THANK YOU. 

 

Sulaiman Abd Rahman 

.................................................................... 

MBM Wheelpower Pte Ltd 

2 Kung Chong Road, 

Singapore 159140. 

 

hp: +65 93288668 

tel : +65 64515333 

fax : +65 6458 6018 

email:  sulaiman@mbmwheelpower.com.sg<mailto:sulaiman@mbmwheelpower.com.sg> 

Find us on Facebook: facebook.com/kbsmotorsports 

Instagram: kbsmotorsports 

 

 


