Vic

From: Terrence Lim [tar6985@hotmail.com]

Sent: Thursday, 24 July, 2014 3:33 PM

To: Vic

Subject: RE: Your ref: SJE 2169P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 28/06/2014
hi Vic,

for your infor I'll pass the case to the lawyer to settle.

thanks
Terrence Lim
Aspec Carcare Centre

From: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

To: tar6985@hotmail.com

CC: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com; admin-a@Ilkkauto.com

Subject: Your ref: SJE 2169P_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 28/06/2014
Date: Fri, 11 Jul 2014 02:48:44 +0000

Your ref: SJE 2169P
Our Ref: CC4/A1G14012282/M1h2b3 “WITHOUT PREJUDICE”

Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 28/06/2014
We refer to the above matter.

Please be informed that basing on the accident statements submitted by both party, the liability is clear for the above mentioned
case.

Please note that this e-mail is on without prejudice basis which does not amount to an authorisation of repair to your client’s vehicle
The final repair cost is subjected to the consistency of the damages according to the nature of the accident. And the days of LOU/
LOR will be based on the number of days of repair as recommended by our surveyor.

Thank you.

Kind Regards,

Vic Alpeh

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID : 65- 6841 2096

Fax : 65- 6741 4108

Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com

Save the Earth- Frint only whenr necessary-



