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Vic

From: Pillai, Sherini [Sherini.Pillai@aig.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 12 May, 2015 11:52 AM
To: Vic
Subject: RE: Yr ref: 9650110406SG Our ref: BSA.8319/201400408

Hi Vic, 

 

Pls upload all docs & close file. 

 

Sherini Pillai 
AIG 
Complex Claims Examiner 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1767 | Fax +(65) 68357416 
 
sherini.pillai@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended recipient, you 
must not use or disseminate the  
information.  If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and 
permanently delete the original and any  
copies or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or 
other defect that might affect any computer  
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free 
and no responsibility is accepted by AIG  
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 

 

From: Pillai, Sherini  

Sent: Wednesday, December 24, 2014 11:24 AM 
To: 'Vic' 

Subject: FW: Yr ref: 9650110406SG Our ref: BSA.8319/201400408 

 
Hi Vic, 

 

Refer to email below. For your advice pls. 

 

Sherini Pillai 
AIG 
Claims Service Executive 
Claims | AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd 
78 Shenton Way #08-16 Singapore(079120) 
 
Tel +(65) 6419 1767 | Fax +(65) 68357416 
 
sherini.pillai@aig.com | www.aig.com.sg 
 
IMPORTANT NOTICE: 
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential.  If you are not the intended recipient, you 
must not use or disseminate the  
information.  If you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and 
permanently delete the original and any  
copies or printouts thereof.  Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or 
other defect that might affect any computer  
system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free 
and no responsibility is accepted by AIG  
for any loss or damage arising in any way from its use. 
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From: Wahidah . [mailto:wahidah@pereiraandtan.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, December 22, 2014 3:14 PM 
To: Pillai, Sherini 

Cc: Bala 
Subject: Yr ref: 9650110406SG Our ref: BSA.8319/201400408 

 

Mc Suit No.21621/2014 

 

Accident on 28.06.2014 involving SKF 2972U & SJE 2169P at Still Road 

 

Dear Ms Sherini 

 

We refer to the above matter. 

 

We understand that you are the officer in charge of this matter. 

 

Please let us have your proposal for an amicable settlement. 

 
Regards, 
Ms Wahidah 
Secretary 
for and on behalf of  
M/s Pereira & Tan LLC 
Advocates & Solicitors 
141 Middle Road #04-02/03 
GSM Building 
Singapore 188976 
Tel:  6339 0359     
Fax: 6339 5925 
Email:wahidah@pereiraandtan.com.sg 
DID: 6337 6814 
 
This message is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is addressed and contains information 
that is privileged and confidential.  If the reader of this email message is not the intended recipient, you are hereby 
notified that any dissemination, distribution or copying of this email message is strictly prohibited.  If you have 
received this email message in error, please notify me immediately by telephone and delete the original email 
message.  
IMPORTANT NOTICE:  

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, 

you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this email in error, please 

immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or 

printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other 

defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, it is the responsibility of 

the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by American International 

Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any loss or damage arising in any 

way from its use. 


