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Vic (LKKAuto)

From: Mr Bala <bala@pereiraandtan.com.sg>

Sent: Tuesday, 13 January, 2015 11:51 AM

To: Hsiao Tong

Cc: CS A Team; Vic; Bryan Ang

Subject: RE: Your Ref: BSA.8319/201400408.wb_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U 

AND SJE 2169P ON 28/06/2014

Dear Hsiao Tong,  

 

We refer to the above. 

 

We confirm settlement at $4,500. 

 

Please arrange for payment in favour of our firm  forthwith. Thank you.   

 

Regards 

Bala 
M/s Pereira & Tan LLC 

Tel: 6236 2001 

 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

This e-mail  is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended receipient please notify us immediately at 

Telephone : 6337 4394 or Fax No. 6339 5925. You should not copy this e-mail or use it for any purpose nor disclose its contents 

to any other person.  

M/s Pereira & Tan LLC (UEN No. 200506667N) 

141 Middle Road 

#04-02/03 GSM Building  

Singapore 188976  

 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Monday, January 12, 2015 5:24 PM 
To: Mr Bala 

Cc: CS A Team; Vic; Bryan Ang 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: BSA.8319/201400408.wb_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 
28/06/2014 

 
Without Prejudice 
(save as to costs) 

 
Dear Mr Bala, 
 
We refer to the above matter. 
 
For an amicable settlement, we are prepared to revise our offer at a global sum of $4,500.00(all-in). 
 
Kindly revert. 
 
Best regards, 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Ave 1 
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
(S) 408933 
DID: 6742 3197 
Fax: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 
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From: Mr Bala [mailto:bala@pereiraandtan.com.sg]  

Sent: Monday, 12 January, 2015 5:09 PM 

To: Hsiao Tong 
Cc: CS A Team; Vic; Bryan Ang 

Subject: RE: Your Ref: BSA.8319/201400408.wb_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 
28/06/2014 

 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Hsiao Tong,  

 

We refer to the above and telecom on 9/1/2015. 

 

As spoken, we reject your proposal. Please revise the same or file an appearance at the latset by 19/1/2015. 

 

Regards 

Bala 
M/s Pereira & Tan LLC 

Tel: 6236 2001 

 

----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 

This e-mail  is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended receipient please notify us immediately at 

Telephone : 6337 4394 or Fax No. 6339 5925. You should not copy this e-mail or use it for any purpose nor disclose its contents 

to any other person.  

M/s Pereira & Tan LLC (UEN No. 200506667N) 

141 Middle Road 

#04-02/03 GSM Building  

Singapore 188976  

 

From: Hsiao Tong [mailto:chewht@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Thursday, January 08, 2015 3:49 PM 
To: bala@pereiraandtan.com.sg 

Cc: CS A Team; Vic; Bryan Ang 
Subject: RE: Your Ref: BSA.8319/201400408.wb_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 

28/06/2014 

 
Without Prejudice 

 
Dear Mr Bala, 
 
We refer to your below email. 
 
We propose settlement at a global sum of $4,200.00(all-in). 
 
Kindly revert. 
 
Best regards, 
Chew Hsiao Tong 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Ave 1 
#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park 
(S) 408933 
DID: 6742 3197 
Fax: 6741 4108 
Email: chewht@lkkauto.com 

From: Mr Bala 

Sent: Tuesday, 6 January 2015 7:39:06 PM (UTC+08:00) Kuala Lumpur, Singapore 
To: Vic 

Cc: Admin-A (LKK Auto) 
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Subject: RE: Your Ref: BSA.8319/201400408.wb_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 

28/06/2014 

WITHOUT PREJUDICE  

  

Dear Vic, 

  

We refer to the above. 

  

Please note that a Writ has been issued. We enclose the following : 

1.      Writ 

2.      List of disbursements 

  

Strictly for an amicable settlement, on a without prejudice and without admission of liability basis, we propose the 

following ; 
1.      Costs of Repair                                                                $  2,800.00 (agreed) 
2.      Loss of Use (5 days x $60)                                             $      300.00 (agreed) 
3.      Costs                                                                                 $   1,100.00 

4.      GST on costs                                                                   $         77.00 

5.      Disbursements                                                               $       336.75 

Total      $   4,613.75 

  

Please confirm acceptance and arrange for payment in favour of our firm  forthwith. Thank you.   

  

Regards 

Bala 
M/s Pereira & Tan LLC 
Tel: 6236 2001 
  
----------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------------- 
This e-mail  is confidential and may also be privileged. If you are not the intended receipient please notify us immediately at 

Telephone : 6337 4394 or Fax No. 6339 5925. You should not copy this e-mail or use it for any purpose nor disclose its contents 

to any other person.  
M/s Pereira & Tan LLC (UEN No. 200506667N) 
141 Middle Road 
#04-02/03 GSM Building  
Singapore 188976  

  

From: Vic [mailto:vicalpeh@lkkauto.com]  

Sent: Friday, December 26, 2014 12:30 PM 

To: bala@pereiraandtan.com.sg 
Cc: pnt@pereiraandtan.com.sg; Admin-A (LKK Auto); Vic 

Subject: Your Ref: BSA.8319/201400408.wb_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 

28/06/2014 
  
Your Ref: BSA.8319/201400408.wb   

Our Ref: CC4/AIG14012282/M1h2e3                   “WITHOUT PREJUDICE” 

  
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SKF 2972U AND SJE 2169P ON 28/06/2014 

  
On a without prejudice basis, we refer to your Letter of Demand dated 01/09/2014 and we would like to offer settlement as per 

below.  
  
  

1.       Costs of Repair                                                                           $  2,800.00 (agreed) 
2.       Loss of Use (5 days x $60)                                        $      300.00 (agreed) 
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3.       LTA search fees                                                                         $           5.35 (agreed) 
4.       Costs and Disbursements (w/gst)            $       400.00 

                                                                                                TOTAL                    $ 3,505.35 
  
Kindly confirm acceptance. 
  
Thank you. 
  
Kind Regards, 
Vic Alpeh 
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25 

Paya Ubi Industrial Park 

Singapore 408933 

DID : 65- 6841 2096 

Fax : 65- 6741 4108 
Email: vicalpeh@lkkauto.com 
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