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Join Ngai

From: Claims Dept of CTl [claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Friday, 20 June, 2014 12:45 PM

To: Admin-B (LKK Auto)

Cc: KKLau; Kathy Lai

Subject; RE: Direct Settiement - Acc Invl SKJ 6117A(OI1) & SMB 275J(TP) on 07/06/2014 (LKK Ref:
CC3/CAI14011622/K1rb3)

Attachments: MSME14066296-SKJ6117A pdf

Dear Jojo,

Our Ref: SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS

Enclose herewith our insured SAS report for your reference.

Thanks & Regards,

Hwang Shiang Yi

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
105 Cecil Street #18-00/#15-00/#16-01/02
The Octagon Singapore 069534

Co. Reg. No 200208384E

oD : 6389 6541

Fax - 6224 TAT75 /6224 7478

Email : claimsdept .cntaiping.com

Email : hwangsy@sg.cntaiping.com
Website | www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer !

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance {Singapore) Ple. Ltd. Any vnauthorized
disclosure, use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the infended recipient of the message, pleasa
notify the sender immediately

From: Jojo Ngai [mailto:admin-b@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 20 June, 2014 11:39 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Toh Hock San Alfred; Chee So Chow; Yao Yue Sheng; KKLau; Kathy Lai
Subject: Direct Settlement - Acc Invi SKJ 6117A(0I) & SMB 275)(TP) on 07/06/2014 (LKK Ref:
CC3/CAI14011622/K1rb3)

Dear Sir/Madam,

We refer to the above matter.

This is a TP direct settlement case. We had inspected TP vehicle SMB 275J AT M/s SMRT Automotive Service Pte Ltd.
Enclosed herewith a copy of TP's GIA report , estimated cost of repair and preliminary advice for your perusal.
Meanwhile, kindly let us have a copy of your insured’s GIA report for our necessary action.

Kindly take note that the case handler in-charge is Kathy and she can be contacted at DID: 6841 2928 & email :
kathylai@lkkauto.com

1



Thanks & Regards

Jojo Ngai

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Ave 1,

#01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park,
Singapore 408933

DID : 6742 8617

Fax : 6741 4108

[ﬁ Save the trees - Do you really need to print this e-mail?

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http:/www.symanteccloud.com
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Rosey Naing

From: Hwang Shiang Yi [shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 December, 2014 12:00 PM

Te: Rosey Naing

Ce: 'Hsiaoc Tong'

Subject: RE: Your ref : SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS Our ref : CC3/CAI14011622/K1kb3w2 ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SKJB117TA & SMB 275J ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 5

Dear Rosey,
Please proceed to offer as per your proposal.

Offer liability starting from 50%.

Thanks & Regards,

Hwang Shiang Yi : o
Claims Department yopose
China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. 5

3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No 200208384E

DD . B389 6541

Fax 16224 7175/ 6224 7478

Email :claimsdept@sg.cntaiping.com

Email : shiangyihwan .cntaiping.com

Website : www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance {Singapore} Pfe. Lid. except
where provided for in a wiitten agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd. Any unauthorized disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or partial, is prohibited, If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Rosey Naing [mailto:roseynaing@Ikkauto.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 December, 2014 10:23 AM

To: Hwang Shiang Yi

Cc: 'Hsiao Tong'; 'Rosey Naing'

Subject: FW: Your ref : SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS Our ref : CC3/CAI14011622/K1kb3w2 ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5KJ
6117A & SMB 2751 ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENLE 5

Dear Shiang Y1,
Attach the survey report for your perusal.

Kindly revert your approval /instruction.

Thank you.

"Wishes vou a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2015"



Kind Regards,

Rosey

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID : 65- 6841 2132

Fax : 65- 6741 4108

Email: roseynaing@lkkauto.com

From: Hwang Shiang Yi [mailto:shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 December, 2014 9:43 AM

To: roseynaing@lkkauto.com

Subject: FW: Your ref : SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS Our ref : CC3/CAI14011622/K1kb3w2 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ
6117A & SMB 275] ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 5

Dear Rosey,

Flease forward completed survey repart.

Thanks & Regards,

Hwang Shiang i

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079908

Co. Reg. No 200208384E

DID : B389 6541

Fax 16224 7175 /6224 7478

Email :claimsdept@sqg.cntaiping.com
Email : shiangyihwang@sg.cntaiping.com
Website | www sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constitute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple. Lid. exc_ept
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Ple, Ltd. Any unaufhnn‘zed_ disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whale or partial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message, please nolify the
sender immediately.

From: roseynaing@lkkauto.com [mailto:roseynaing@lkkauto.com]

Sent: Friday, 14 November, 2014 9:18 AM

To: Claims Dept of CTI

Cc: Hwang Shiang Yi; "Hsiao Tong"; roseynaing@lkkauto.com

Subject: Your ref : SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS Our ref : CC3/CAI14011622/K1kb3w2 ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 6117A &
SMB 275) ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 5

Your ref : SNM14D02337/COZ/LKKDS
Our ref ; CC3/CAI14011622/K1kb3w2 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiang Y.

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 6117A & SMB 275J ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 5

2



We refer to the above accident,

Ol reported that he was stationary and TP was picking / alighting passenger. Therefore Ol opened his rear right door to

allow his daughter to enter the car, before to close the door, TP moved
out and hit onto O rear right door.,

TP reported that Ol was stationary at the bus stop. TP has turned out of the bus stop at the yellow box. Suddenly Ol opened the

Our opinion that this is the conflicting version and there was no evidence nor witness in both parties.

Based on the damages profile it is possible that when TP was overtaking OI stationary car, the door was opened at the same ti
We had informed O] about TP claim and NCD issue.

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD up to S§ 17008.20 ( all
in). The breakdown is as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised
1. Cost of Repairs $ 21,408.00 §  20,754.00
2. Loss of Use (2days x $250) $ 500.00 b 500.00
i 21908.00 $ 21254.00
@ 50% - 80% $ $ 10627.00-17003.20
4.LTA /GIA Search Fee $ 5.00 $ 5.00
b 21,913.00 §  10,632.00-17008.20

Enclosed herewith all the relevant documents for your perusal.

For your approval please.

Kind Regards,

Rosey

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID : 65- 6841 2132

Fax : 65- 6741 4108

Email: roseynaing@lkkauto.com

This email has been scanned by the Symantec Email Security.cloud service.
For more information please visit http://www.symanteccloud.com
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Rosey Naing __

Your Ref: SMB 275) "Without Prejudice”
Our Ref; CC3/CAI14011622/K1kb3Iw2

Dear Madeline,
ACCIDENT ON 07/06/2014 INVOLVING VEHICLES SKJ 6117A AND 5MB 275)

We refer to the above matter.
Enclosed herewith a copy of our insured's sketch plan for your perusal.

We are of the opinion that this is a case of conflicting versions. There is no conclusive evidence to substantiate either's
parties version.

We propose settlement as follows: -

1. Cost of Repair S 20754.00
2. Loss of Use(5250x2days) S 500.00

$ 21254.00

@50% S 10627.00

4. LTA/GIA search fee 5 5.00
TOTAL 10632.00

Please confirm acceptance.

Kindly note that this negotiation between parties on this matter is purely on a without prejudice basis with the sole
intention of resolving the matter amicably without parties resorting to legal proceedings. No admission of liability,
whatsoever, should be deemed / inferred from this negotiation of terms/settlement.

In the event of new evidence being discovered or subsequently produced by either party that will materially

affect/influence on the issues of liability/demages, either party is not bound, thereafter, by the negotiation
terms/settlement.

"Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2015"

Kind Regards,

Rosey

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408333

DID ; 65- 6841 2132

Fax : 65-6741 4108

Email: roseynaing@lkkauto.com







Rosey Naing .

Attachments: LOD OF SMB 275J pdf; Survey photos. pdf; Inspection Report.pdf

Your rel ; SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS
Our ref : CC3/CALI4011622/K 1kb3w2 WITHOUT PREJUDICE

Dear Shiang Y1,

ACCIDENT INVOLVING SKJ 6117A & SMB 2751 ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 5

We refer to the above accident.

O1 reported that Ol was stationary and TP was stationary picking / alighting passenger. Therefore Ol opened OF vehicle
rear right door to allow his daughter to enter the car, before to close the door, TP moved
out and hit onto O1° rear right door.

TP reported that Ol was stationary at the bus stnp:. Suddenly TP opened the right hand side passenger door and hit TP's rear in
Ll A

Our opinion that this is the conflicting version and there was no evidence nor witness in both parties.
We had informed OI about TP claim and NCD issue.

W have surveyed the vehicle. and relevant supporting documents - enclosed for your perusal.

[ F

We seek your approval to offer to TP repairer, SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD.is.as follows:

Amount Claimed Amount Revised

1. Cost of Repairs & % 21.408.00 b 20.754.00
2. Loss of Rental {2days x $250) ] S00.00 by 500.00

% 21908.00 b 2125400
@ 50% 5 ! $ 10627.00
4.LTA /GIA Search Fee S 500 % 5.00

L 21.913.00 h 10,632.00

Amount of claim 88 10,632.00 for approval e

,

\

Surveyer recommended 2working days.

For your approval please. |I ]
1
\

-. ;
Y
h,

Kind Regards, \H__

Rosey

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
51 Ubi Avenue 1 #01-25

Paya Ubi Industrial Park
Singapore 408933

DID : 65- 6841 2132

Fax : 65- 6741 4108

Email: roseynaing@|kkauto.com

i



Rosey Naing |

From: Hwang Shiang Yi [shiangyi hwang@=qg.cntaiping.com]

Sent: Tuesday, 9 December, 2014 12:00 PM

To: Rosey Naing

Cc: ‘Hsiao Tong'

Subject: RE: Your ref : SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS Our ref : CCHCAIMA0116822/K1kb3w2 ACCIDENT INVOLVING

SKJ 6117A & SMB 275J ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 5

Dear Rosey,

Please proceed to offer as per your proposal.

Offer liability starting from 50%.

Thanks & Regards,

Hwang Shiang Yi

Claims Department

China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Ltd.
3 Anson Road #16-00

Springleaf Tower

Singapore 079909

Co. Reg. No 200208384E

DiD - 5389 6541

Fax (8224 T1T75 /8224 7478

Email : claimsdept@sa.cntaiping.com
Email : shiangyi.hwang@sg.cntaiping.com
Website - www.sg.cntaiping.com

Disclaimer :

This message is confidential; its contents do not constifute a commitment by China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. except
where provided for in a written agreement between you and China Taiping Insurance (Singapore) Pte. Lid. Any unauthonzed disclosure,
use or dissemination, either in whole or parfial, is prohibited. If you are not the intended recipient of the message. please notify the
sender immediately.

From: Rosey Naing [mailto:roseynaing@lkkauto.com]
Sent: Tuesday, 9 December, 2014 10:23 AM

To: Hwang Shiang Yi

Cc: 'Hsiao Tong'; 'Rosey Naing'

Subject: FW: Your ref : SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS Our ref : CC3/CAI14011622/K1kb3w2 ACCIDENT INVOLVING 5KJ
6117A & SMB 275] ON 07/06/2014 ALONG YISHUN AVENUE 5

Dear Shiang Yi.
Adttach the survey report for your perusal.
Kindly revert your approval /instruction.

Thank vou.

"Wishes you a Merry Christmas & Happy New Year 2015"



Report: Adrason Private Limuted (HO)) - SKI61TTA

4/5: Photographs of Damaged Parts Rear Door Trim Board RiH

SKJG117A - Submi . Ad Bri ;e iC
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https: /singapore merimen.com’,., TOKEN=Thlad (5d70739be-ABIIBR34-9733-ER3B-BE286BFODCFASB I 6&USID=3038&RID=2826065] 10072017 3:.08:13 PM]



Report: Adrason Private Limited (HQ) - SKI611TA

RO ]

5/5: Photographs of Damaged Parts Centre Door Pillar R/H

hitps://singapore. merimen com/, TORKEN=Blad (53470739 be- AR 3BT 5-ERIB-BE2ROBFODCFASB 16& USID=363 8& RIT- 2826065 10772017 3:08:13 FM]



Report: Adrason Private Limited (HUY - Skl 17A

3/5: Photographs of Damaged Parts Rear & Front Doors R/IH

SKJG117A - Submitted by; A Bri imit Q

hirps:singzapore. merimen, comy,,. TOK EN={blad{3d 70739 be- AB33B854-9735-FE3B-BE2R6BF ODCF ASB 164 USID=3638L RID-2826065] 10072017 30813 PM]



Report: Adrason Private Limited (HO) - SEI61ITA

15 Front View Right

SKJB117A - Submi _ Pri -

hueps:singapore merimen, com, . TOK EMN=1h0ad (3070739 be-ARIIBE34-4735-E 83 B-BE2ROBF O FASB A& LIS = 303848 RIL=2R2I00635] 11 OT24007 3:08:13 M



Report, Adrason Private Limited (HQ) - 5KI6117A

| S
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-

2/5: Photographs of Damaged Parts Fronir & Rear Doors RiH

Submiitted by Ad Private Limi .

hitps. fsingapore merimen. com .. TOK EN={hlad (3dT0739(be- ABIFBR34-9735-ERIB-BE2RGBFODCEASB 16 LISID VAR RID=2826063] 10072007 3:08:135 PM]



LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

51 Ubi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933

TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315

Reg. Mo: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 19-8607198-R

Affiliated to Federation Internationale Des Experts En Automobile

CHINA TAIPING INSURANCE (S) PTE LTD

3 ANSON ROAD #16-00

Ref : CC3/CTIM4011622/K1uadn

SPRINGLEAF TOWERSINGAPORE 079909 D Ame MI"‘”IIM"IN" |‘|
Code: CTI
1. Policy Particulars :- THIRD PARTY CLAIM
Insured Veh. SKJ B117A Veh. Inspected SMB 2754
Policy No. DMPCSN1418601400 Coverage ($) 0.00
Claim No. SNM14D02337/C02/LKKDS Excess ($) 0.00
Assign From Assign Date 19/06/2014
& Vehicle Particulars & Condition
Make & Model  MAN NL320F c.c 10518
Engine No. HIDDEN Year of Reg. 2012
Chassis No. WMAA22ZZ2C7001337 Colour WHITE
Odometer 168117 Steering IN ORDER
Brakes IN ORDER Meodification STANDARD ALLOY RIM
General GOOD
3. Conditions of Tyres
Size Make Balance
R/H Front Tyre [275/75R225 CONTINENTAL 4 mm
L/H Front Tyre |275/75R225 CONTINENTAL 4 mm
R/H Rear Tyre |275/75R22.5 (D) CONTIMNENTAL 4/4 mm
L/H Rear Tyre [275/75 R22.5 (D) CONTINENTAL 4/4 mm
4, Description of Damages
THE VEHICLE SUSTAINED DAMAGES AT THE REAR N/S DOOCR.
DAMAGES SEE DETAILS
8. General Information
Accident Date  07/06/2D14 Inspection Date 19/06/2014
Survey held at SMRT AUTOMOTIVE SERVICES PTE LTD
B0 WOODLANDS INDUSTRIAL PARK E4 SINGAPORE 757705
5a. Remarks
AJTHE INSPECTION WAS CONDUCTED ON A"WITHOUT PREJUDICE" BASIS.
B}IN ACCORDANCE TO YOUR INSTRUCTIONS, WE HAVE NOT AUTHORISED REPAIRS.
5b. Estimate Days of Repair
ESTIMATED NORMAL PERIOD FOR REPAIR: 2 Working Days




T P4l V4 LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd
“"_‘ e ; " ; 51 Libi Ave 1 #01-25 Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Singapore 408933
s TEL: 6256 3561 FAX: 6256 4315
Reg. No: 199607198R GST Reg. No. 15-9607198-R Page No.:1 of 1
ADJUSTMENT ON REPAIR COST FOR VEHICLE NO. SMB 275J
Qty Description of Parts Condition WE:::I:::?:]} Durﬁ:::j}ustad
REPLACEMENT OF PARTS
1|EXIT DOOR ASSY CRACKED 20,700.00 20,700.00
LESS 10% DISCOUNT " -2,070.00
20,700.00 18,630.00
LABOUR
TO REMOVE AND INSTALL ALL ABOVE ITEMS AND 1,446.00 964.00
REPAIR OTHERS DAMAGED AFFECTED AREAS,
TO PROVIDE LABOUR & MATERIAL TO PUTTY AND 372.00 200.00
RESPRAY ABOVE REPAIR ITEMS.
TO PROVIDE LABOUR & MATERIAL FOR 860.00 960.00
ADVERTISEMENT STICKER.
2,778.00 2,124.00
GRAND TOTAL 23,478.00 20,754.00
|  RECOMMENDED COST OF REPAIRS | | | 20,754.00

Report Ref No. CC3/CTI14011622/K1ua3n2
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KALVIN ANG WEI KUN HO LEONG CHUAN

Automotive Assessor | Investigator Automotive Assessor




