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Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

From: Asher Yeo [asheryeo82@yahoo.com]
Sent: Saturday, 2 May, 2015 11:43 AM
To: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)
Cc: Admin-A (LKK Auto); Vic
Subject: Re: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFX2918S AND FBF8555H ON 12/02/2015

Hi Bevan, 
 
There is totally no basis for his claim against me. I have zero 0 percent liability in this accident. 
 
1. You mentioned you all reviewed the matter? What are the facts and what evidence did you all base on?  
2. Did you even bother to get the actual facts right before sending this email? 
3. This is an accident with injured personnel. It is a police case, you mean you all can decide the responsibility? 
 
I don't know you are from a Law Firm or an Insurance Firm, but what kind of email or service standard is this? 
Get your facts right, now I demand you all to provide what are the evidence you all gathered to derive at the 
recommendation that I am partly at fault. 
 
For your info, the motorcyle FBF8555H hit on to the wheel on the road himself. The rider was thrown off the wheel 
and his motorcycle skid into my lane and hit my front right bumper. Traffic police is fully aware of this case. I didn't 
claim against him and now he wants to claim against me? 
 
Either you are telling me traffic police is wrong or the rider gives false statement or you all are not doing your job. 
 
So give me on what evidence or facts you all based on to say I might be held partially responsible for this case. 
I will consult my lawyer. Thanks. 
 
Regards, 
Khen Boon 
 
 

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) <bevanlim@lkkauto.com> 
To: "asheryeo82@yahoo.com" <asheryeo82@yahoo.com>  
Cc: Admin-A (LKK Auto) <lkkauto@lkkauto.com>; Vic <vicalpeh@lkkauto.com>; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto) 
<bevanlim@lkkauto.com>  
Sent: Wednesday, 22 April 2015, 15:11 
Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFX2918S AND FBF8555H ON 12/02/2015  
 
Our Ref: CC4/AIG14010906/Sh2a3 
  
Dear Sir/Madam, 
  
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFX2918S AND FBF8555H ON 12/02/2015  
  
We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to 
resolve the claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken 
up with them. 
  
We tried to contact you at your mobile at 94521012 but to no avail. 
  
Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your 
authorized driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident. 
  
If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let 
us have them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 02/05/2015, after we shall proceed with 
negotiation with Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should 
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not bind any claims whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from 
this particular accident. 
  
Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% 
for commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy 
has a NCD protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be 
protected.  
  
Please call us if you have further queries. 
  
  
  

Best Regards, 

Bevan Lim 

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd 

Phone: 6749-5792 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108 

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933) 

  
  
 


