Ju! Irene (LKKAuto)

From: Joy Irene (LKKAuto)

Sent: Wednesday, 3 January, 2018 5:47 PM

To: '‘Dally Amri, Mimi Zarina’

Cc: 'KianMeng.Chan@aig.com’; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 800716797 ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SFX 29185(0I) AND FBF

8555H(TP) ON 12.02.2014

TP / 800716797

Dear Mimi,

We refer to the subject of this e-mail. We have inspected TP vehicle on 10.06.2014
TP repairer’s last correspondence with us was on 02.09.2016.

The claim file has been inactive for more than one(1) year now.

In view of no further development from TP’s side, we will temporarily close file and will submit our WP report to
your good-office.

In future, if there is any action from TP, we will notify you for our further handling.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Joy Irene | Case Handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

DID: 6749-5792 | email: joyirene @lkkauto.com | Fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5(408933)

All contents of this email is intended strictly for the addressee(s) only.lt may contain confidential and/or privileged
information.If you are not the intended recipient {or have received this email in error) please notify the sender
immediately and destroy this email. Any unauthorized copying, disclosure or distribution of the material in this email
is strictly forbidden.

From: Ahmad, Syaza [mailto:Syaza. Ahmad@aig.com]

Sent: Monday, 31 July, 2017 4:33 PM

To: Tan, Wilson-KL

Cc: Admin A; Sukimin, Nurasikin; Chan, Kian Meng; Vic (LKKAuto)

Subject: RE: Your Ref: 800716797_ACCIDENT INVOLVING VEHICLES SFX 29185(0I) AND FBF 8555H(TP) ON
12.02.2014

Hi Wilson,
Below email refers. Kindly assist further.

Thank you.



SG MOTOR ENTERPRISE

4001, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 568622
Tel: 6452 4808 Fax: 6452 4888
Email: sg_motor_sntarprise@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 4 May 2018

AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Lid LETTER OF DEMAND

78 Shenton Way
#07-16
SINGAPORE 079120

Your Insured: SFX 29188
Date of Accident:  12-Feb-14

Accident: BKE towards PIE

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO. FBF 8555H

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No. : FBF 8555H (Lump Sum) $1,700.00
Loss of Use: 3 days x $30 $90.00
Total: $1,790.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED NINETY ONLY.
Notes:

1. Al cheque payment should be "Crossed" and made payable to 3G MOTOR ENTERPRISE
2. All cheque should have our “Invaice No" written on the reverse side of the cheque
3. For further enquiries on this involce, please feel free to contact us

SG Motor Enterprise
HEC)



Bevan Lim !LKK Autut

From: Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Sent: Wednesday, 22 April, 2015 3:12 PM

To: asheryeo82@yahoo.com

Cc: Admin-A (LKK Auto); Vie; Bevan Lim (LKK Auto)

Subject: ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFX28185 AND FBF8555H ON 12/02/2015

Our Ref: CC4/AIG14010906/Sh2a3
Dear Sir/Madam,
ACCIDENT INVOLVING SFX29185 AND FBFS8555H ON 12/02/2014

We refer to the above accident where we are acting for AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd to resolve the
claim against you and/or your authorized driver under the Auto Insurance policy taken up with them.

We tried to contact you at your mobile at 94521012 but to no avail.

Kindly note that we have reviewed this matter and would like to advise that you and/or your authorized
driver may not be absolved from blame for this accident.

If you have evidence/information to prove that we should not settle the third party claim, kindly let us have
them in writing within the next 10 days i.e. by 02/05/2015, after we shall proceed with negotiation with
Third Party claimant on the without prejudice basis and any settlement should not bind any claims
whatsoever by you/your driver against the other party’s insurer arising from this particular accident.

Please note that your No-Claim Discount (NCD) (if any) will be affected and reduced by 30% (20% for
commercial vehicles) upon next renewal due to this Third Party claim. However, if your policy has a NCD
protector feature, it will be deemed utilized for this claim and your NCD will be protected.

Please call us if you have further queries.

Best Regards,

Bevan Lim

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6749-5792 | email: bevanlim@lkkauto.com | fax: 6741-4108
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | 5{4080933)



SG MOTOR ENTERPRISE

4004, Ang Mo Kio Industrial Park 1 #01-21 SINGAPORE 559622
Tel: 6452 4898 Fax: G452 4868
Email: sg_motor_snterprise@yahoo.com.sg

DATE: 4 May 2018 Invoice No: 5G-PD-98-410
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte Ltd FD - Direct Settlement

78 Shenton Way

#07-16

SINGAPORE 079120

Your Insured: SFX 29185
Date of Accident:  12-Feb-14

Accident: EKE towards FIE

FINAL REPAIR COSTS
VEHICLE NO. FBF 8555H

Cost of Repair for Vehicle No. : FBF 8555H (Lump Sum) $1,700.00
Total: $1,700.00
SINGAPORE DOLLARS: ONE THOUSAND SEVEN HUNDRED ONLY.
Motes:

1. All cheque payment should be "Crossed" and made payable to 8G MOTOR ENTERPRISE
2. All chague should have our "Involce No® written on the reversa side of the cheque
2, For further enguiries on this involca, please feel free o contact us

SG Motor Enterprise
LG
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