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Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)

From: Rasul (LKKAuto)
Sent: Friday, 16 August 2024 2:58 PM
To: Robyn Chin Zhi Shen
Cc: Shiau Chan (LKKAuto)
Subject: Re: HYUNDAI AVANTE -  SMG9565L - COR

Hi Robyn, 
 
We will be advising our principal a cost of repair P/P $3,000.00 /- with 03 days of repair before GST, subject to their 
approval. 
 
Best Regards,  
Rasul | Assessor  
LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd  
Phone: 6256-3561 | email: Rasul@lkkauto.com | fax: 6841-4315  
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)  

Save the Earth. Print only when necessary.  

 

From: Robyn Chin Zhi Shen <robyn.chin@hyundaimotors.com.sg> 
Sent: Friday, 16 August 2024 1:43 pm 
To: Rasul (LKKAuto) <Rasul@lkkauto.com> 
Cc: Heng Swee Hee <shheng@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; Foong Yao Jie (Jack) <Foong.Yao@hyundaimotors.com.sg>; 
Nordin Bin Mohammad <nordin.mohammad@hyundaimotors.com.sg> 
Subject: HYUNDAI AVANTE - SMG9565L - COR  
  
Hi Rasul, 
 
The attached is for your reference and authorization of COR, 
 
Kindly note that the cover bumper (item #4) was not replaced, but repaired instead (refer to supplementary labour 
charge #1),  
 
also the front fender panel (lhs) was affected and needed to be repaired as well (refer to supplementary charge #2 
& attached file) 
 
number of days for repair was 3  

Thank You, 
  
Best regards, 
  
Robyn Chin Zhi Shen 
Vehicle Assessor Officer, Service 
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KOMOCO MOTORS PTE LTD 
253 Alexandra Road 
#01-01 Singapore 159936 
Email  robyn.chin@hyundaimotors.com.sg 
HP (65) 9070 0157 
  


