Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

From: Huey Yon (LKKAuto)

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2024 2:52 PM

To: Tam, Ivan-WK

Cc: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat; SUR

Subject: RE: 5276305165SG-007 - SKF3358L(AIG) & SKB1913T *** LKK REF:
CS/AIG24080128/KNP3E2

Dear Sir/Mdm,
We still checking the matter.

Best Regards,

Huey Yon | case handler

LKK Auto Consultants Pte.Ltd.

Phone: 6256-3561 Fax: 62564315 email: hueyyon@Ilkkauto.com
Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, Singapore 408933

From: Tam, Ivan-WK <lvan-WK.Tam@aig.com>

Sent: Tuesday, 24 September 2024 2:48 PM

To: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@lkkauto.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@lkkauto.com>
Cc: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat <Jeffreysaykiat.Ng@aig.com>; SUR <sur@lkkauto.com>

Subject: RE: 52763051655G-007 - SKF3358L(AIG) & SKB1913T *** LKK REF: CS/AIG24080128/KNP3E2

Dear team,
Any updates to this matter?

Thank you.

Ivan Tam

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AIG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1959
Ivan-WK.Tam@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If
you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in
any way from its use.

From: Mei Kwan (LKKAuto) <Meikwan@|kkauto.com>
Sent: Thursday, 19 September, 2024 10:44




To: Tam, lvan-WK <lvan-WK.Tam@aig.com>; Huey Yon (LKKAuto) <hueyyon@Ikkauto.com>
Cc: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat <Jeffreysaykiat.Ng@aig.com>; SUR <sur@I|kkauto.com>
Subject: [EXTERNAL] RE: 52763051655G-007 - SKF3358L(AIG) & SKB1913T *** LKK REF: CS/AIG24080128/KNP3E2

This message is from an external sender; be cautious with links and attachments.

Dear Sir / Madam,

Thank you for your email.

Our respective case handler will look into the matter and get back to you in due course.
Hi HY,

Kindly assist.

To check availability of the case handler, you may contact the undersigned.

Thank you.

Best Regards,

Mei Kwan | Admin

Third Party Direct Settlement

LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd

Phone: 6366 0055 | email: MeiKwan@lkkauto.com

Blk 51, Paya Ubi Industrial Park, Ubi Avenue 1, #02-25 | S(408933)

From: Tam, lvan-WK <lvan-WK.Tam@aig.com>

Sent: Thursday, 19 September 2024 10:28 AM

To: Admin A <admin-a@lkkauto.com>

Cc: Ng, Jeffreysaykiat <Jeffreysaykiat.Ng@aig.com>
Subject: 52763051655G-007 - SKF3358L(AlG) & SKB1913T

Dear Team,
Please check the invoice for this case.

Lonpac has agreed to bear all survey fee for this.



RE: [EXTERNAL] FW: RE: PRE-REPAIR INSPECTION - ACCIDENT INVOLVING OUR INSURED VEHICLE SKF3358L A

. €5 Reply &5 Reply Al Forward
@ Ng, Jeffreysaykiat D Reply D Reply All | — Forwar
To Corene Chon Wed 07-Aug-
e d g

Cc Hui Ting Tang; © Lim, Kok-Cheng; @ Lim, Sheng Yang; @ Hiew, Chasin; @ Hor, Yinrul;
© Azlan, Syazairding; © Kamalasanan, Ghayatri

WITHOUT PREJUDICE
SAVEAS TO COSTS

Dear Corene,
Your chain cellision sequence is confusing. It should be as follows:

SKF3358L (AIG) > GBK85695 (Ecics) > GBC9962A (Lonpac) > SKB1913T (TP/Sompo)

1. We are agreeable to appoint LKK Auto Consultants Pte Ltd as Single Joint Expert {“SJE”) which is proposed by the insurers of the 2" vehicle no.
GBC39624 (Lonpac Insurance Bhd); At this stage, LKK survey fees will be borned by Lonpac.

2. We are agreeable to use BOLA scenario 28 of the Motor Claims Framework (MCF) Guidelines for your client’s property damage claim as the insurer:
3" yehicle no. GBK85695 (ECICS Limited) has already agreed.

Thank you.

Jeffrey Ng
Senior Complex Claims Examiner Il

Thank you.

Ivan Tam

AIG

Complex Claims Examiner — Auto Property Damage Claims
AlG Asia Pacific Insurance Pte. Ltd

AIG Building

78 Shenton Way, Level 10
Singapore 079120

Tel +(65) 6419 1959
Ivan-WK.Tam@aig.com | www.aig.sg

Advanced Leave Notification:

If you have received this message outside of your usual work hours, | do not expect that you will read, respond to or action it until appropriate for you.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:

The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If
you have received this email in error, please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any copies or printouts
thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is
received and opened, it is the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by AIG for any loss or damage arising in
any way from its use.

IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emailin error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which itis received and opened, it is
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any
loss or damage arising in any way from its use.
IMPORTANT NOTICE:
The information in this email (and any attachments) is confidential. If you are not the intended
recipient, you must not use or disseminate the information. If you have received this emailin error,
please immediately notify me by "Reply" command and permanently delete the original and any
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copies or printouts thereof. Although this email and any attachments are believed to be free of any
virus or other defect that might affect any computer system into which it is received and opened, itis
the responsibility of the recipient to ensure that it is virus free and no responsibility is accepted by
American International Group, Inc. or its subsidiaries or affiliates either jointly or severally, for any

loss or damage arising in any way from its use.



